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Easter egg hunt, 
March 16
The Ladies Auxiliary of the 

James F. Talbott VFW Post No. 
1121 will host its annual Easter 
egg hunt from 2 to 4 p.m. 
Sunday, March 16, at the 
Kewanna-Union Township Fire 
Station. Parents are invited to 
bring their children, infants 
through 11 years of age, to the 
event. Drinks and cookies will be 
available.

+++

Kindergarten 
roundup at Caston
Caston Elementary School will 

host its annual kindergarten 
roundup Tuesday, March 18, at 7 
p.m. in the Caston Elementary 
library. Parents may come in at 
6:45 for pre-registration.

Parents of children who will 
enter kindergarten next school 
year are encouraged to attend this 
informational meeting. Children 
must be five (5) years of age by 
August 1 to be eligible to attend 
kindergarten. Parents who have 
children meeting the age 
requirement will have the 
opportunity to register their child 
in next year’s kindergarten 
program while at the meeting. 
Parents must have a legal birth 
certificate to verify the age of the 
child. Children need not attend 
with the parents, as there will be 
no screening or programs for the 
children that evening.

Parents are asked to bring three 
items to the meeting: their child’s 
(1) legal birth certificate; (2) 
social security card; and (3) 
immunization record. Im­
munization records will be 
reviewed by the school nurse that 
evening and parents will be 
informed if there is a need for any 
additional immunizations that the 
children must have prior to 
entering school next year.

Questions can be forwarded to 
Mrs. Cindy Douglass, principal, 
at 574-857-3025 or 
douglas@caston.kl2.in.us.

+++

Final legislative 
breakfast
The final legislative breakfast 

will be held at 8 a.m. Saturday, 
March 22, at the Manitou 
Banquet Hall in Rochester. The 
breakfast will provide local 
residents a chance to interact with 
their current state senator and 
representatives.

The breakfast is sponsored by 
the Rochester/Lake Manitou 
Chamber of Commerce.

+++

Bake Sale, March 22
St. Ann Catholic Church, 

Kewanna, will host its annual 
bake sale from 8:30 to 10:30 a.m. 
Saturday, March 22, at the 
Community State Bank, Kewanna 
branch.

+++

Subscribe To
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Town Council Holds 
March Session
The Kewanna town council met 

for its March session Thursday, 
March 6, at the town hall. Present 
were council members Jeff Finke, 
Dan Birge and Mark Smith; 
clerk-treasurer, Jenny Kay; Mike 
Molitor, Danny Winter, Bob 
Clyde, Danny Chew, John 
Cochran, Steve McPeek and 
Karen Good.

Mr. Cochran commended the 
council on its efforts to provide a 
rural medical clinic for the area. 
He recommended and outlined a 
four-step process for starters, 
including working with the 
Regenstrief group from Purdue 
University to gain certification as 
an underserved area. He also 
recommended forming and 
chartering a Kewanna Medical 
Clinic Task Force, designing a 
detailed survey to be 
administered to the residents of 
Kewanna, and the enlisting of 
area medical providers in the 
effort. Any Kewanna area 
resident that is interested in 
serving on this task force should 
contact the town clerk-treasurer at 
574-653-2112.
Bob Clyde presented the 

monthly fire department report 
noting one town call (medical) 
and four township calls (three fire 
and one medical).

Clyde also asked the council to 
pursue getting a property in his 
neighborhood cleaned up or at 
least boarded up as it is a haven 
for pests and unwelcome guests.

Danny Chew requested 
permission to take home the snow 
plow truck when heavy snow is 
predicted overnight making it 
easier for him to get to work the 
next morning. The council 
expressed some concern about 
letting the dump truck/snow plow 
leave town but okayed the use of 
the town pickup whenever heavy 
snowfall might be a problem. He 
also suggested the council seek 
additional summer help when 
renovation work begins at the 
sewer treatment plant so he can 
be part of the process. This will 
also free up mowing time so 
installation of new meters can 
move forward. The board took 
the suggestion under 
consideration.

Town superintendent Mike 
Molitor presented his monthly 
report. Most of the month was 
spent dealing with high water 
problems or plowing snow. The 
pump at the No. 1 lift station was 
not pumping. It was feared that it 
would have to be pulled for 
repairs but it was subsequently 
determined the line to the pump 
was plugged and just needed to 
be back flushed. A damaged 
meter pit was repaired. Some left 
over cold patch was used to start 
filling some of the potholes. The 
assistant superintendent did some 
cleaning and sorting of 
accumulated paperwork at both 
well houses. A lengthy power 
outage caused problems at one 
point. Town employees were 
getting ready to start the

Methodist Churches 
Offering Holy Week 
Services

The Kewanna and Pleasant Hill 
United Methodist Churches invite 
everyone to make Holy Week 
services part of their Easter 
celebration.
Maundy Thursday services will 

be held at the Kewanna United 
Methodist Church at 7 p.m. 
March 20.

Good Friday services will take 
place at 7 p.m. March 21 at the 
Pleasant Hill Church.

An Easter sunrise service will be 
held at 7 a.m. Sunday, March 23, 
at the Pleasant Hill United 
Methodist Church, follow by a 
carry-in breakfast.

Both churches will also hold 
regular Sunday morning worship 
services, 9 a.m. at Pleasant Hill 
and 10:30 a.m. at the Kewanna 
church.

+++

Fish and chicken 
supper at Grass Creek
The Grass Creek Lions will 

serve a fish and chicken supper 
from 4:30 to 7 p.m. Saturday, 
March, 29 at the Grass Creek Fire 
Station. The cost of the meal will 
be $7 for adults and $3.50 for 
children 6-12. Children under six 
may eat free.

Dan’s Frying Service of 
Huntington will prepare the fish 
and chicken. Carry outs will be 
available.

Proceeds will benefit Lions’ 
state and local projects.

+++

Caston Elementary 
collecting plastic bags

Caston Elementary is collecting 
plastic bags. The bags need to be 
delivered to the school between 
April 10 and April 15. Kewanna 
area residents may also call 
Millie Redweik and she will pick 
them up.

+++

generator to run the water pumps 
and sewage collection system 
when the power came back on. 
Employees are also working on 
the vulnerability assessment and 
emergency response plans for the 
USDA Rural Development. The 
water works pumped a total of 
979,900 gallons of water during 
February.
Jack Urbin was appointed to the 

Board of Zoning Appeals (BZA). 
He will serve on this board along 
with Larry Kimble and David 
Fuller of Kewanna and two 
members appointed by the Fulton 
Town Council.

The removal of a tree and 
stump was approved by the 
council.
The marshal’s monthly report 

detailed one traffic arrest, ten 
traffic warnings, four criminal 
arrests, one accident report, 42 
calls answered and 1,625 miles 
patrolled.

All Conference
Basketball Team 
Announced
Caston’s Wes Rigney has been 

named to the Midwest 
Conference all-conference bas­
ketball team. He is joined by Ben 
Welsh, Matt Winkler and Brice 
Willey of South Newton; James 
Taulman and Ben Ticen, Tri­
County; Travis Nuest and Jordan 
Stevens, West Central; Dylan 
Sterrett, Frontier; Cody Conn, 
Pioneer; Cory Hurd, Winamac; 
and Jesse Philo, North White.

Comets Bryant Brown and 
Ethan Zartman were given 
conference honorable mention. 
Others receiving this honor were 
Jordan Zeider, South Newton; Joe 
Brown and Jason Stitz, Tri­
County; Jesse Wuethrich, West 
Central; Eric Post and Jon-Marc 
Ream, Frontier; Mitchell Petrie 
and Justin Ruff, Pioneer; and 
Charlie Dilts, Winamac.

Ben Welsh of South Newton 
was named MWC player of the 
year and Chris Enyeart, also of 
South Newton, was named MWC 
coach of the year.

+++
AREA FIVE MENU 

Kewanna Fire Station
Monday, March 17 - Cheese 

sandwich, broccoli soup, carrots, 
cookie, crackers and milk

Wednesday, March 19 - Turkey 
Manhattan, mashed potatoes, 
beets, fruit gelatin, bread and 
milk

Friday, March 21 - Closed. 
Good Friday.

+++

Send In Your News

Kewanna Youth League
Players Name______________________ __________ Birth Date___________________
Address_________________________________City___________________Zip__________
Phone Number___________________________Email________________
Family Doctor________________________ _ Allergies ___________
Medi cations________________________ _
Parents Name Phone Number

T-ball Age 4-6 Games on Wednesday @5:30 
Minors Age 7-8 Games on Monday and Wednesday 
Majors Age 9-12 Games on Tuesday and Thursday

Shirt Size: Youth Small___ Medium___ Large  
Adult Small___ Medium___ Large___ X-Large 

Parent help: Coach___ Assistant Coach___ Team Help___ Transportation

Fees are $15.00 per player with a maximum of $40.00 per family. If assistance is needed 
for fees please let us know. Forms and fees should be mailed to:
Kewanna Youth League P.O. Box 34 Kewanna, IN 46839 Att: Maryanne
Forms need to be received by March 21

Pease read the following carefully:
This information will be kept on file and if necessary, given to medical personnel in the 
event of an injury to your child, if you are you are not present.
* In case of injury to my child, I authorize the officials of the Kewanna Youth League to 
take the necessary actions to save the life of my child.
* I agree to return upon request the uniform and any other equipment issued to my child 
in good condition.
Parents Signature Date

For questions contact Tana Garver v^ 653-3731 or Maryanne Rude <<? 653-260^

Meal site at local fire 
station
The Area Five Agency on Aging 

operates a meal site in the 
community room of the 
Kewanna-Union Township Fire 
Station serving lunch every 
Monday, Wednesday and Friday. 
Area residents who are 60 years 
of age or older are welcome to 
take part in the program.

For more information on the 
meal site, call Alvena 
Mollencupp at 653-2318.

+++
Callers phishing for 
personal information
The Better Business Bureau of 

Northern Indiana reports it has 
received calls from consumers 
telling them they have received a 
call indicating they will be issued 
a new Social Security card, and 
the caller needs banking 
information to process the new 
card. The BBB warns residents to 
beware of the phishing scam.

The intent of the caller is to 
throw the consumer off track by 
identifying himself or herself 
with something they are familiar 
with, and getting the consumer to 
give information before they 
realize it is a scam. NEVER give 
information to anyone who is 
asking for it. Reputable 
companies, government agencies, 
or other entities will not do 
business in this manner.

+++

Kewanna Town Council 
Meetings

First Thursday of Each Month
7 p.m. - Town Hall

mailto:douglas@caston.kl2.in.us


Clowning Around

The Sunday school children and 
other members of the 
congregation of St. Luke 
Evangelical Lutheran Church, 
Winamac, enjoyed some surprise 
visitors after the Saturday 
evening worship service on 
February 23. The sermon, given 
by interim pastor Mel Meyer, 
focused on baptism. The children 
have also been studying and 
learning about baptism in their 
Sunday sessions.
Following services, the group 

enjoyed special decorated cakes 
by Susette McCormick, ice 
cream, coffee and drinks. As they 
were finishing their refreshments, 
a clamor was heard on the stairs 
and four clowns made their 
appearance. Everyone enjoyed 
the antics and rollicking religious 
jokes, songs and teasing of the 
clowns, Bubbles, Stitch, Rufus 
and Dusty.

Worship services are held at St. 
Luke on Saturday evenings at 6 
p.m. and on Sunday morning at 9 
a.m. All interested people are 
welcome to attend.

During Lenten season, midweek 
services are held at 7 p.m. on 
Wednesday. There will be special 
services during Holy Week 
beginning on Palm Sunday, 
March 16. Call the church or a 
member about other services. 
Easter Sunday will begin with a 
pancake and sausage breakfast 
prepared by the elders. The rest

of the congregation will carry-in 
the remaining goodies. All are 
welcome at the 7 a.m. breakfast 
and the 9 a.m. Easter service. 
There will be no Sunday school 
on Easter, but classes will resume 
the following Sunday with a 
special study on St. Paul’s trips.

A Vacation Bible School 
program is being planned so keep 
this in mind as summer 
approaches.

Members of the children’s 
Sunday school include Cameron 
and Hayley Benesh, Brooke- 
Lynne Braun, Hanna Galbreath, 
Kolton Graves, Ben Gudas, Clark 
and Grace Gudas, Dylan and 
Tyler Hintz, Clay Kistler, Cole, 
Kyle and Samantha Olds, Justin 
Olds, Chace Podell, Ainsleigh 
Purtee, Matthew Schafer, Sydney 
and Taylor Tripenfeldas and 
Mackenzie and Riley Wheeler. 
Teen helpers are Ryan Abbott, 
Tyler Abbott, Merissa Fritz,

Quest Fritz, Becca Gudas and 
Michelle Gudas. The teachers are 
Millie Redweik, Shelley Graves, 
Kathy Zellers, Louise Gudas, 
Amanda Kistler and Marsha 
Olds.

Program on Indian 
Artifacts Sunday
Alan Chesser will give a 

program on Indian artifacts at 2 
p.m. Sunday, March 16, during a 
meeting of the Fulton County 
Historical Society.

Plans for an all-you-can-eat 
breakfast buffet on March 29 will 
be discussed. Proceeds will be 
used to hire a summer intern to 
give tours of the Living History 
Village. Tickets will be available 
from members and the museum.

Members and public are 
welcome to attend the meeting. 
Refreshments will be served.

James F. Talbott VFW Post 
March Activities

March 9 - District meeting at 
Syracuse, 2 p.m.

March 11 - Men’s meeting, 6:30 
p.m.

March 16 - Easter egg hunt at 
fire station for infants through 
age 11,2 p.m.

March 23 - Happy Easter
March 25 - Men’s Auxiliary 

meeting, 6:30 p.m.
March 30 - Open Sunday at 

noon. Free food and euchre, 1 
p.m. Everyone welcome.

LAYNE JORDAN HORN
Travis and Kristin Horn, 

Rochester, are the parents of a 
son born at 11:40 a.m.
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Wednesday, February 13, 2008, 
at Logansport Memorial Hospital. 
The baby weighed 5 pounds and 
7 ounces, was 19/2 inches long, 
and has been named Layne 
Jordan Horn.

The maternal grandparents are 
Jeff and Mindy Douglass, 
Kewanna, and Kathy Douglass, 
Twelve Mile.

The paternal grandparents are 
Tim Horn, Rochester, and Tina 
and Dave Bratton, Tippecanoe.
Great-grandparents include Don 

and Nancy Douglass, J. Herrold, 
Phyllis Scott, Maurice and Janet 
Horn and Tom and Bonnie 
Fisher.

KEWANNA TOWN HALL 
(Water & Sewage Payments) 

308 S. Logan St.

9 a.m.
Hours:

to 3 p.m. weekdays 
or by

Appointment
574-653-2112

Introducing the ultimate 
healing machine. Your body.

Using the specific Gonstead System of analysis, 
chiropractic turns your bodies own healing abilities 
on! Chiropractic encourages the body to do what it 

does best: heal itself.

Office in Rochester Open! 

800 Main Street 

(574) 223'5557

Experience the Gonstead Difference 

Dr. Cherie Goble & Dr. Mark Heal 
574.946.4113 Winamac IN

Carpet/Linoleum 
Laminate Flooring 

Ceramics 
Ph: (574) 653-2202

RON HAMMAN 
ALL WORK GUARANTEED.... 

P.O. Box 124 / Kewanna. IN 46939
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A series of group classes will be offered to anyone interested in 
learning more about managing Diabetes.

Class 1 — What is diabetes, monitoring, regulating blood 
glucose, medications, and exercise.

CASA
Court Appointed Special Advocates

Make a difference in a 
child's life. Become a 

trained CASA Volunteer 
and speak up for the 

children of Fulton County.
You can be a voice for children 

in need of services.

Please call today 
574-223-2183

Class lyates:
Class TLMS: 
locations.

Cost:
Instructors:

April 9, 15, 23 
1*3 pm or 6*8 pm 
Woodlawn Hospital 
Ambulance Garage 
$ 10 (for series)
Jean Herd, FNP*CS, 
Maureen Neeley, FNP*C, 
& Betsy Wolfe, Dietitian

Class 2 — How what you eat affects diabetes, label reading, 
dining out, meal planning.

Class 3 — Learning to live with diabetes, personal health 
habits, sick-day guidelines, long-term complications, 
changing behavior, putting the pieces together.

WO.OD.LAWN HOSPITAL

ROCHESTER — INDIANA
1400 East Ninth Street

Mill Race Complex, Rochester 
401 E. Eighth St.,Ste.E 

E-mail:casafultoncoun ty@rtcol.com

mailto:ty@rtcol.com
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WOODLAWN HOSPITAL
February 29

Births - Dan and Lauren Jefferies, 
Rochester, a son
March 2

Births - Joel and Angela Lowe, 
Macy, a daughter; Amber Calvert, 
Rochester, a daughter
March 3
Admissions - Winfred May and 

Brenda Holmes, Rochester; Dolly 
Rife, Kewanna
Dismissals - Dorine Kabel, 

Lashawna Burnett, Lisa Castleman 
and son, Debra Gardner, Lauren 
Jefferies and son and Brenda Holmes, 
Rochester; Linda Jackson, Bourbon; 
Priscilla Powell and son, Macy 
March 4
Admissions - James Mulligan, 

Vonnie Sanders and Naomi 
Livingston, Rochester
Dismissals - Minnie Ellison, Akron; 

Angela Lowe, Macy; and Amber 
Calvert and daughter, Rochester

Births - Todd and Leslie 
Howdeshell, Rochester, a daughter 
March 5
Admissions - Mary Clark and 

Nancy Stiles, Rochester
Dismissals - Randall Furnivall and 

Winfred May, Rochester; Dolly Rife, 
Kewanna

Births - Adam and Andrea Starkey, 
Macy, a daughter
March 6
Admissions - Chloe Webb, Peru
Dismissals - Alexa Lowe, Macy 

March 7
Admissions - Donna Rans and John 

Reed, Rochester; Glen Lockwood, 
Macy
Dismissals - Vonnie Sanders and 

Leslie Howdeshell and daughter, 
Rochester; Chloe Webb, Peru; 
Andrea Starkey and daughter, Macy

574-595-7262

PULASKI MEMORIAL 
HOSPITAL

February 29
Admissions - Randy Bishop. 

Thomas Halleck, Sr. and Brittney 
Starr, Winamac; Patricia Klein, Star 
City; and Dale Bratt, Knox

Dismissals - Bradley White, Knox;
Edmond Targosz, Chicago, IL
March 1
Admissions - none
Dismissals - Patricia Klein, Star 

City; Stephanie Murray, Winamac 
March 2
Admissions - Linda Wireman, 

Winamac
Dismissals - Thomas Halleck, Sr., 

Winamac
March 3
Admissions - June Kestle, Winamac 
Dismissals - Brittney Starr and son 

and Linda Wireman, Winamac
March 4

Admissions - none
Dismissals - Randy Bishop,

Winamac
March 5
Admissions - Helen Whiteman, 

Kewanna; Frances Smith, Winamac
Dismissals - June Kestle, Winamac

March 6
Admissions - David Charles, 

Monticello; Paul Tweedie, Kewanna; 
Ruth Conley, Winamac
Dismissals - John Raybould, Knox;

David Charles, Monticello 
+++

DEATHS.........

DOLLY E. RIFE
Graveside services were held at 

2 p.m. Tuesday, March 11, 2008, 
at the Fulton Cemetery for Dolly 
E. Rife, 81, Kewanna. Rev. 
George Hapner officiated. Mrs. 
Rife passed away at 11:24 p.m. 
Saturday, March 8, at her home.
Born August 6, 1926, in Fulton 

County, she was the daughter of

• Vinyl Replacement Windows
• Entry Doors & Storms Doors
• Free In-Home Estimates
• Vinyl Siding & Soffit
• Porch Enclosures

DON FRITZ
Star City

Cell: 574-225-3030

The OBSERVER. Kewanna, IN

Manford J. and Chloe Curtis 
Kingery. She was married March 
27, 1943, to Lloyd T. Rife, who 
preceded her in death.

Mrs. Rife retired in 1991 from 
Marshall Electric. She enjoyed 
working puzzles, crocheting and 
quilting.

Survivors include two sons, 
Manford C. Rife and his wife, 
Ellen, of Mitchell, and Jerry Rife, 
Kewanna; one daughter, Carol 
Rife, Kewanna; eight 
grandchildren; nine great­
grandchildren; a sister, Dorothy 
Mason and her husband, Maurice, 
Brooklyn; two brothers, John 
Kingery, Las Vegas, Nevada, and 
Bill Kingery and his wife, Pat, 
Fulton; and several nieces and 
nephews.

She was preceded in death by a 
daughter, Janet Loveless; a 
granddaughter; three brothers; 
and two sisters.

Zimmerman Brothers Funeral 
Home, Fulton, was in charge of 
arrangements. Memorial contri­
butions may be made to Hope 
Hospice of Fulton County.

+++

March is Multiple 
Sclerosis Awareness
Month

Pat Smith 
Pulaski Memorial Hospital

Multiple sclerosis (MS) is a 
nervous system disease that 
affects your brain and spinal cord. 
It damages the myelin sheath, the 
material that surrounds and 
protects your nerve cells.

This damage slows down or 
blocks messages between your 
brain and your body, leading to 
the symptoms of MS. These 
symptoms may include:

• Visual disturbances
• Muscle weakness
• Trouble with coordi­

nation and balance
• Sensations such as

numbness, prickling, or 
“pins and needles”

• Thinking and memory

problems
No one knows what causes MS. 

It may be an autoimmune disease, 
which happens when your body 
attacks itself. Multiple sclerosis 
affects women more than men.

It often begins between the ages 
of 20 and 40. Usually, the disease 
is mild, but some people lose the 
ability to write, speak or walk. 
There is no cure for MS, but 
medicines may slow it down and 
help control symptoms. Physical 
and occupational therapy may 
also help.

EASTERN PULASKI MENU 
March 17-21 

Elementary Breakfast
Cereal, grahamMonday

cracker juice and milk
Tuesday - Breakfast pizza, juice

and milk 
Wednesday - Donut, 

cheese Juice and milk
Thursday - Cinnamon

string

toast,
yogurt, juice and milk

Friday - Good Friday, no school
Elementary Lunch

Monday - Macaroni and cheese, 
green beans, applesauce, soft 
pretzel and milk

Tuesday - Chicken strips, 
potatoes, banana, peanut butter 
sandwich and milk

Turkey andWednesday
noodles, mashed potatoes, fruit 
ice, baking powder biscuit and
milk 

Thursday Cheeseburger,
pickle spear, pears, cookie and 
milk

Friday - Good Friday, no school

A Nonprofit, Public Benefit Organization

Brenda Burkey, rn 
Patient Care 
Coordinator C

Middle/High School Lunch
Monday - Tacos, winter blend 

vegetables, apricots, cookie and 
milk. Choice - salad bar

Tuesday - Corn dog, potatoes, 
applesauce, cookie and milk. 
Choice - salad bar

Wednesday - Ravioli, cheese 
breadstick, peas, pears and milk. 
Choice - salad bar

Thursday Sloppy Joe
sandwich, fries, fruit mix, cookie 
and milk. Choice - salad bar

Friday - Good Friday, no school
Spring Break - March 24-28

Healthcare
Scholarships Available

The Woodlawn Hospital 
Auxiliary will be awarding 
scholarships to Fulton County 
residents who are pursuing a 
career in healthcare. Graduating 
seniors may obtain applications 
from their high school guidance 
counselors. At-large applications
may be
Community

obtained from
Relations at

Woodlawn Hospital, 1400 E. 
Ninth St., Rochester.
For more information, call 

Becky Rude, at Woodlawn 
Hospital, 574-224-1180. The 
deadline for submitting 
applications is April 1, 2008.

Send In Your News 
e-mail: jkgood@rtcol.com 

Fax: (574) 653-3418 
Ph.: (574) 653-2101

(574) 224-4673

(888) 737-4673

SMITH 
SAWYER
SMITH
INC SERVING FULTON COUNTY 

SINCE “1932”
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Sixty Years Ago
March 11, 1948

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Thomas, 
Grass Creek, will observe their 
25th wedding anniversary Sunday, 
March 14, at an open house from 
2 to 4 p.m. for their relatives and 
friends. A family dinner will be 
enjoyed in the evening.

Elmer Gady, employee of the 
Charles Van Meter Co., 
Kewanna, was honored at a 
farewell party last Wednesday 
evening by the Van Meter 
employees and their families. 
Gady is leaving to take up 
farming.

The Kewanna Supper Club met 
with Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Talbott in Akron Sunday evening. 
A buffet supper was served to 
Mr. and Mrs. Phillip Anderson 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Anderson, Mr. and Mrs. Lester 
Shidaker and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Smith and family 
and Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
McColley.

Pha Metzger was hostess to the 
Birthday Club at Aileen’s 
Saturday evening honoring Mrs. 
Gladus Wharton. A chicken 
dinner was enjoyed after which 
euchre was played with prizes 
going to Jessie Urbin, Margaret 
Gillespie and Louise Whybrew.

Fifty-Five Years Ago
March 13,1953

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Whiteman 
entertained Sunday with a family 
dinner in honor of Sgt. Gene 
Whiteman who has recently 
returned from Korea.

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Shidaker 
entertained in their home Sunday, 
March 8, with a family dinner 
honoring Mr. and Mrs. Jonas 
Shidaker’s 45th wedding 
anniversary. The group also 
celebrated the 13th wedding 
anniversary of Mr. and Mrs. 
Manson Leap.

The West Union WSCS met in 
the home of Mrs. Joe Bucks 
Thursday, March 5, with 26 
members present. The following 
officers were elected: president, 
Mrs. Ernest Daily; vice president, 
Mrs. May Mitchell; and treasurer, 
Mrs. Nancy Daily.

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. (Bummer) 
Wilson celebrated their 44th 
wedding anniversary Tuesday, 
March 10, in the home of their 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Smith in Rochester.

Fifty Years Ago
March 13,1958

Joan Graffis was named 
valedictorian and Bill Harris, 
salutatorian, of the 1958 
Kewanna High School graduating 
class. Joan is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Graffis, Rt. 3, 
Kewanna. She is also the 
Kewanna DAR winner and editor 
of the school news. Bill is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Harry Harris, 
Kewanna. He participated in four 
years of softball and basketball 
and is sports editor of the school 
news.

A barn on the Donald Mutchler 
farm was destroyed by fire 
Tuesday, March 11. A combine 
was lost in the fire, but five

2180 Southway 31, P0 Box 607, Rochester, IN 46975-0607
Office 574-223-3518
Office 1-800-508-9873
Fax 574-223-6914
Cell 574-835-0626
Home 574-857-9955
cdougla@e-farmcredit.com Craig Douglass

Financial Services Officer

calves were led to safety. The 
Grass Creek Fire Department was 
called to the scene and was able 
to save the nearby house and 
granary, which were threatened 
by the blaze.

Walt Koebcke, a senior at 
Kewanna High School, was 
named the outstanding county 
basketball player of the year at a 
dinner held March 5 in the 
Richland Center gym. He was 
selected by vote of all county 
basketball players. Koebcke 
headed a list of ten players voted 
to the all county team. Among the 
others on the team were Bill 
Ingram of here, Dave Huffman of 
Grass Creek and Danny Hauser 
of Fulton.

AO/2c Allen Lane, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Grustel Markley of 
Kewanna, has departed from San 
Diego, California, aboard the 
USS Shangri-La attack aircraft 
carrier for a six-month cruise in 
the Far East.

Forty-Five Years Ago
March 14, 1963

Members of the Leiters Ford 
community honored the 
Aubbeenaubbee High School 
basketball team Friday night in 
appreciation of the team’s success 
in the Winamac sectional. The 
Braves knocked off North Judson 
in the first round and then took 
revenge on Hamlet, which had 
beaten Aubbee in regular season 
play. However, the Braves were 
defeated 62-59 in overtime by the 
Knox Redskins in the 
championship game. Getting to 
the final game was the best that 
an Aubbeenaubbee team has ever 
done in sectional play.

New officers were elected and 
installation plans were made at 
the recent stated meeting of the 
Kewanna OES. The following 
officers were elected: Worthy 
Matron, Patsy Evans; Worthy 
Patron, Harold Hyatt; Associate 
Matron, Violet Troutman; 
Associate Patron, Donald 
Troutman; secretary, Ruby 
Woolington; treasurer, Lera 
McKinney; conductress, Rosetta 
Newgent; and associate 
conductress, Josephine Hyatt.

Mary Sommers of Star City and 
Ed Sayers of here visited

Saturday afternoon with her 
father, Lee Sommers, who is 
quite ill in Methodist Hospital, 
Indianapolis.

Forty Years Ago
March 14, 1968

During the past week Explorer 
Post 2451 was formed under the 
sponsorship of the Kewanna 
Progressive Association. Explorer 
Advisers are Vern Biber and 
Clem Good.

Mr. and Mrs. Ned Warfield of 
Kewanna observed their 50th 
wedding anniversary March 5. 
The occasion was celebrated by 
their family with a dinner at 
Seidel’s Catering near Star City 
March 3.

Gwen Clyde spent the weekend 
at Purdue University with Carol 
Clyde.

Mrs. Violet Smith, instructor of 
the knitting class at the Kewanna 
Library, was honored by her 
group Monday afternoon, March 
11. Refreshments were enjoyed 
by the honored guest, nine class 
members and three guests: Jane 
Berry, Donnabelle Fisher, 
Maggie Gillespie, Fern Master, 
Mildred Miller, Vera Wickline, 
Ann Zartman, Mary Biber, Flo 
Hilficker and Thelma Johnston.

Thirty Years Ago
March 9, 1978

Richard C. Baldwin, 49, has 
filed for nomination for trustee of 
Union Township on the Democrat 
ticket.
The Farmers and Merchants 

Bank/Kewanna Furniture House 
basketball team, which won the 
local independent league, was 
honored at a supper at the Marlo 
Monday evening. Team members 
present included Tom Hickle, 
Larry Baldwin, John Anderson, 
Mark Hall, Tom Wilson, and 
David Briney. Also present were 
Harry Richter of the Farmers and 
Merchants Bank and Joe 
Holmquist of the Kewanna 
Furniture House.

Jon Donathen, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Donathen, was 
scheduled to receive his Eagle 
Scout award Sunday, March 19, 
at 1:30 p.m. at the Kewanna 
Church of Christ.

Twenty Years Ago
March 10,1988

Jim and Sandy Roark have

opened a video rental store at the 
corner of Main and Toner Streets 
in Kewanna. To be known as Ma 
and Pa’s Movie Rentals, the store 
will be open evenings and 
weekends.

Funeral services were conducted 
at 2 p.m. Saturday at St. Ann’s 
Catholic Church, Kewanna, for 
James Hubeny, Jr., 74, Rt. 3, 
Kewanna. Rev. Cornelius Kelly 
officiated and burial was in St. 
Peter’s Cemetery, Winamac.

Funeral services were held 
Monday in the Harrison-Metzger 
Funeral Home, Royal Center, for 
Robert F. Fultz, 71, Rt. 2, 
Kewanna. Burial was in the Grass 
Creek Cemetery.

Angela Gast spent Saturday 
night with Kimberly Sutton at 
Leiters Ford. Mr. and Mrs. Jon 
Gast attended the benefit pancake 
and sausage breakfast at Leiters 
Ford Sunday morning and Angela 
returned home with them.

Ten Years Ago
March 12, 1998

Karen Miller, lifetime resident 
of Fulton County, has filed her 
candidacy for Fulton County 
Clerk on the Democrat ticket.

Jacob Tyler Kiss and Luke 
Sutton, children of Steve and 
Wendy Sutton, Kewanna, were 
featured at “Tomorrow’s 
Leaders”.

Amanda Garner of Ball State 
University is spending her spring 
break with her parents, Tom and 
Linda Garner. Jessica Urbin, a 
freshman at Ball State, is 
spending her spring break with 
her parents, Jack and Jean Urbin.

+++

Exca vating / Bulldozing 
Hauling

* Commercial * Residential 
"Agricultural

Jesse Rude (574) 835-0158 
John Geier (574) 817-0038

MAINTENANCE 
DOCTOR 

(574)653-9904

General Handyman Work 
Drywall Hanging & Repair 

Plumbing Repairs
“No lob Too Small” 

Fast, Courteous Service 
797 S. St Rd 17. Kewanna. IN 46939 A Division of R-Mar. Inc

WANTED ... 
Farm Scrap, junk 
can and Trucks

PHONE:
(574) 653-2578
DAVID WOODS 

6879 West, State Road

mailto:cdougla@e-farmcredit.com
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RESOLUTION # 030308
RESOLUTION OF THE FULTON COUNTY 

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
WHEREAS, the Board of trustees of Woodlawn Hospital has determined that it is 

necessary and appropriate that Woodlawn Hospital make substantial improve­
ments to the present hospital and after much study has decided to proceed with 
expansion and improvements, adding an additional larger operating room geared 
to orthopedic surgery, relocating the emergency department to a new wing on the 
east of the existing building, adding an all-new diagnostic imaging department, 
adding a new and larger laboratory facility, adding a cardiology area adjacent to 
both diagnostic imaging and the emergency room, along with other improvements; 
and
WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees has entered into an agreement with the archi­

tectural and construction management firm of BSA Life Structure, Inc., Indianapo­
lis, IN, to design the plans and oversee construction; and
WHEREAS, since the dedication of the new hospital in 1978, the Board of Trustees 

of Woodlawn Hospital has maintained not only the land and buildings of the foot­
print of the presently existing hospital, as per the lease rental agreement, but also 
the entire acreage of the real estate purchased in 19 75 (33.488 acres less 0.215 
acre) and the real estate added thereto in 1977 and 2007, and provided mainte­
nance, repair, security and insurance coverage on the entire site; and
WHEREAS, the Woodlawn Hospital and the surrounding area are looked upon as 

the site of intense medical care in Fulton County, which area provides not only a 
vision of the hospital, but walking trails, exercise areas and a total health plant; and 
WHEREAS, Indiana Code 36-1-11-8 provides a transfer or exchange of property 

may be made between governmental units upon terms and conditions agreed upon 
by the entities as is evidenced by the adoption of substantially identical resolutions 
by each entity; and
WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of Woodlawn Hospital has approached the 

Board of Commissioners of Fulton County to adopt a resolution for transferring the 
remaining real estate at the Woodlawn Hospital site, not only for construction of a 
new addition to the hospital but also to maintain the site as a comprehensive health 
care facility to enhance and improve the level of healthcare in Fulton County and 
serve as a center for healthcare not only in Fulton County but in surrounding com­
munities as well, and
NOW, THEREFORE, the Fulton County Board of Commissioners, pursuant to I.C. 

36-1-11-8, does hereby resolve that the portion of the real estate of the Woodlawn 
Hospital site as described in attached Exhibit “A” is hereby transferred to the 
Board of Trustees of Woodlawn Hospital with the condition that it be used solely for 
hospital and related medical and healthcare purposes, said transfer to be further 
evidenced by an appropriate quit-claim deed.

EXHIBIT “A”

All that part of the East % of Section 9, Township 30 North, Range 3 East, Fulton 
County, Indiana, being more particularly described as follows: Commencing at the 
Northwest corner of the East 14 of said Section 9, said comer also being 168.00 
feet south of the Southerly R/W line of Erie & Lackawanna RR; thence South 0 
degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds West, along said West line of the East % of said 
Section 9, 931.85 feet to the Southwest comer of a 50 feet strip of land for road 
purposes of the City of Rochester, Indiana, found in Deed Record Book 115, page 
64, the Point of Beginning; thence South 89 degrees 51 minutes 37 seconds East, 
along the South line of said 50 feet strip of land, 983.91 feet; thence South 01 
degree 39 minutes 37 seconds East, parallel to and 348.5 feet West of the West 
R/W line of State Road #25,1085.43 feet; thence South 89 degrees 08 minutes 24 
seconds West, parallel to and 585.00 feet North of the North R/W line of State 
Road #14 and 25, 232.13 feet; thence South 0 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds 
West 236.50 feet; thence South 89 degrees 08 minutes 24 seconds West, 250.03 
feet; thence South 0 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds West 348.5 feet to the North 
R/W line of said State Road #14 and 25; thence South 89 degrees 08 minutes 24 
seconds West, along the North R/W line of said State Road #14 and 25, 130.30 
feet to a point of curve; thence Northwesterly along a curve and along the said 
North R/W line of State Road #14 and 25, with a radius of 1872.23 feet and a 
central angle of 12 degrees 24 minutes 36 seconds an arc length of 405.52 feet to 
the West line of the East % to said Section 9; thence North 0 degrees 00 minutes 
00 seconds East along the West lien of said Section 9, 1583.05 feet to a U.S. Fish 
Hatchery Monument; thence continuing North 0 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds 
East along the said West line of the East 1/2 of said Section 9, 60.82 feet to the 
Point of Beginning. The foregoing described tract contains 33.488± acres and is 
subject to all easements and roads of record.

50 feet of uniform width off of the entire west side of the following described 
tract, to-wit: Beginning at a point on the north line of State Highway 14, which is 
783.25 feet east and 62.35 feet north of the center of Section 9, Township 30 
North, Range 3 East, thence north 348.5 feet; thence west 250 feet; thence south 
348.5 feet to the north line of said Road; thence east 250 feet to the place of 
beginning, as and for a public road.

EXCEPT THE FOLLOWING DESCRIBED TRACTS:

A part of the east half of Section 9, Township 30 North, Range 3 East, described 
as follows: Beginning south 00 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds west 1,870.72 feet 
and north 90 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 583.27 feet from the northwest 
comer of said half quarter section; thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds 
west 203.00 feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds west 297.54 
feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 262.04 feet; thence south 
45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 297.54 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 
minutes 00 seconds west 59.04 feet to the point of beginning, and containing 
1.790 acres, more or less; EXCEPTING therefrom a parcel of land described as 
follows: Commencing at the point 1,870.72 feet south and 583.27 feet east from 
the northwest comer of the east half of said Section 9, thence south 45 degrees 00 
minutes 00 seconds west 203.0 feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 
seconds west 297.54 feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 
23.46 feet to the point of beginning; thence continuing north 45 degrees 00 
minutes 00 seconds east 24.71 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 
seconds east 7 feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 3 6.63 
feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 20 feet; thence north 45 
degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 32.42 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 
minutes 00 seconds east 23 feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds 
east 23 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 63.29 feet; 
thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds west 70.94 feet; thence north 45 
degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds west 3 8.54 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 
minutes 00 seconds west 21.94 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 
seconds east 4 feet; thence south 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds west 27.88 
feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds west 27.88 feet; thence north 
45 degrees 00 minutes 00 seconds east 4 feet; thence north 45 degrees 00 minutes 
00 seconds west 50.88 feet to the point of beginning, containing 9,3 87 square feet 
(0.215 acre), more or less.

Also, a right of way access easement in and to a tract extending 15 feet on each 
side of its centerline, which centerline is described as follows: Beginning south 00 
degrees 00 minutes, 00 seconds west 1,93 5.74 feet and north; 90 degrees 00 
minutes 00 seconds east 418.25 feet from the northwest comer of the east half of 
Section 9, Township 30 North, Range 3 East, thence south 00 degrees 00 minutes 
00 seconds west 675.95 feet to the terminus at the north right of way line of State 
Roads 25 and 14.

Also, a parcel of land located in the West half of the Northeast Quarter of Section 9, 
Township 30 North, Range 3 East, in Fulton County, Indiana, more particularly described 
as follows:
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EARTH 
TALK
Questions & Answers 
About Our Environment

atmospheric electromagnetic 
radiation as a result of growing 
numbers of cell phones and 
wireless communication towers. 
The increased radiation given off 
by such devices may interfere 
with bees’ ability to navigate. A 
small study at Germany’s Landau 
University found that bees would 
not return to their hives when 
mobile phones were placed 
nearby. Further research is 
currently underway in the U.S. to 
determine the extent of such 
radiation-related phenomena on 
bees and other insect populations.

Biologists also wonder if global 
warming may be exaggerating the 
growth rates of pathogens such as 
the mites, viruses and fungi that 
are known to take their toll on 
bee colonies. The unusual hot- 
and-cold winter weather 
fluctuations in recent years, also 
blamed on global warming, may 
also be wreaking havoc on bee 
populations accustomed to more 
consistent seasonal weather 
patterns.

A recent gathering of leading 
bee biologists yielded no 
consensus, but most agree that a 
combination of factors is likely to 
blame. “We’re going to see a lot 
of money poured into this 
problem,” says University of 
Maryland entomologist Galen 
Dively, one of the nation’s 
leading bee researchers. He 
reports that the federal 
government plans an allocation of 
$80 million to fund research in 
connection with CCD. “What 
we’re looking for,” Dively says, 
“is some commonality which can 
lead us to a cause.”
CONTACTS: Organic
Consumers Association Bees 
Info, 
www.organicconsumers.org/bees. 
cfm; Colony Collapse Disorder in 
Honey Bees,
http://pestalert.ifas.ufl.edu/Colon 
y_Collapse_Disorder.htm.
GOT AN ENVIRONMENTAL 
QUESTION? Send it to: 
EarthTalk, c/o E/The

Environmental Magazine, P.O. 
Box 5098, Westport, CT 06881; 
submit it at:
www.emagazine.com/earthtalk/th 
isweek/, or e-mail:
earthtalk@emagazine.com. Read 
past columns at:
www.emagazine.com/earthtalk/ar 
chives.php. 

+++++

To Reserve the Fire 
Department Community Room 

Call Bev Baldwin at 
574-653-2622

Evenings 
+++

Recycling Dates 
Thurs., Mar. 13th 

& Mar. 27th

SOLID WASTE DISTRICT

FULTON

COUNTY

Dear EarthTalk: What is 
causing the dramatic decline in 
honeybee populations in the U.S. 
and elsewhere in recent years, 
and what is being done about 
it?— James Harris, Akron, Ohio

Kids everywhere may revel in 
the fact that bees are no longer 
stinging them as frequently on 
playgrounds and in backyards, 
but the decline in honey bee 
populations in the U.S. and 
elsewhere signals a major 
environmental imbalance that 
could have far-reaching 
implications for our agricultural 
food supply.

Brought here from Europe in the 
1600s, honeybees have become 
widespread across North America 
and are bred commercially for 
their abilities to pollinate crops— 
90 different farm-grown foods 
including many fruits and nuts 
depend on them—and produce 
honey. But in recent years 
populations across the continent 
have plummeted by as much as 
70 percent, and biologists are still 
scratching their heads as to why 
and what to do about the problem 
which they have termed “colony 
collapse disorder” (CCD).

Many believe that our increasing 
use of chemical pesticides and 
herbicides, which bees ingest 
during their daily pollination 
rounds, are largely to blame. 
Commercial beehives are also 
subjected to direct chemical 
fumigation at regular intervals to 
ward off destructive mites. 
Another leading suspect is 
genetically modified crops, which 
may generate pollen with 
compromised nutritional value.

It may be that the build-up of 
both synthetic chemicals and 
genetically modified crop pollen 
has reached a “tipping point,” 
stressing bee populations to the 
point of collapse. Lending 
credence to this theory is that 
organic bee colonies, where 
chemicals and genetically 
modified crops are avoided, are 
not experiencing the same kind of 
catastrophic collapses, according 

to tne non-profit Organic 
Consumers Association.

Bee populations may also be 
vulnerable to other factors, such 
as the recent increase in

Handschu 
Construction 
(574) 653-2422

Commencing at the Northwest comer of said Northeast Quarter; thence south 00 degrees 
14 minutes 52 seconds west (bearings per NGS-NAD 83) on and along the west line of 
said Northeast Quarter a distance of 929.70 feet to a 5/8 inch rebar located at the 
southwest comer of a 50 foot strip of land for the purpose of a roadway recorded at Deed 
Record Book 115, page 64, said point also being witnessed by a U.S. Fish and Wildlife 
Monument located a distance of 60.80 feet south 00 degrees 14 minutes 52 seconds west 
of said point, said point being the point of beginning; thence south 89 degrees 29 minutes 
21 seconds east along the south line of said roadway to the northwest comer of a tract of 
land as described in Deed Record, Instrument Number 0200368, a distance of 983.91 feet 
(% inch rebar); thence south 01 degree 13 minutes 38 seconds east along the west line of 
the aforementioned tract a distance of 456.01 feet (5/8 inch rebar); thence north 89 
degrees 29 minutes 21 seconds west to the intersection of the west line of said Northeast 
Quarter, a distance of 995.65 feet; thence noith 00 degrees 14 minutes 5 2 seconds east 
along said west line a distance of 455.80 feet to the point of beginning, said exception 
containing 10.36 acres, more or less.
Dated this 3rd day of March, 2008

Richard A. Powell 
Roger D. Rose 

Pub 3/13/2008 Mark J Rodriguez

Materials accepted at 
the Recycling Center:

Aluminum Cans
• Beverage cans
• Pop tab pet food cans

Aluminum Foil
• Foil wrap
• Aluminum pie and dinner trays

Chipboard
• Cereal box type paper
• Office paper - all types
• Paperback books
• Junk mail
• Phone books
• Hardback books - covers need to 

be removed
No tissue or foil paper
No carbon, carbonless forms or 

other treated paper
No wax paper

Corrugated Cardboard
• Viewed from the edge, 

corrugated cardboard looks like 
this: _____

• Remove packing materials

Electronics
• Computers (including mice, 

keyboards, monitors and 
printers)

• Main frames
• Fax machines
• Scanners
•VCRs
• DVD players
• Stereos
• Telephones
• TVs

Glass Jars & Bottles
• Separate into: CLEAR COLORED
• Labels do not have to be removed
• Remove lids - put with steel
No mirrors, light bulbs, window, 

ceramic, Pyrex or other glass

Grocery Bags
• Paper grocery bags can be used 

to hold newspapers

Magazines & Catalogs
• Only magazines & catalogs made 

of slick, glossy paper
• Slick newspaper insert

Scrap Metal
• Small amounts of any type of 

scrap metal are accepted
• Aerosol cans - remove lids

Miscellaneous
• AAA-D, hearing aid, watch and 

rechargable batteries
• Inkjet and laser cartridges
• Items containing mercury
• Florescent bulbs
• Motor oil
• Pallets - wood or plastic
• Styrofoam packing peanuts - 

must be contained

Newspaper
• Stack in brown paper grocery 

bags
• Remove glossy inserts and put 

with magazines
Do not pack in plastic bags

Plastic Bags and film
• Plastic grocery bags (make sure 

they are empty)
• Bubble wrap
• Clean plastic film

Plastic Bottles #l-#7
• All plastic bottles - look for the 

chasing arrows
• Farm chemical containers - MUST 

be triple rinsed

Refrigerated Units
• Refrigerators
• Freezers
• Air conditioners
• Dehumidifiers
(Any item containing Freon)

Steel Food Cans
• Include metal lids from glass jars
• Pet food containers

Please make sure all items are 
separated and rinsed out.

Manufacturers require clean and 
contaminant-free materials to 

make new products.

574-223-4939
1452 Wentzel St., Rochester I 

Mon. - Fri. 8 a.m. - 4 p.m.; 6
8 a.m.-Noon Sat. D

E-mail: fcswd@rtcol.com [

www fultoncountyrecycling com |

http://www.organicconsumers.org/bees
http://pestalert.ifas.ufl.edu/Colon
http://www.emagazine.com/earthtalk/th
mailto:earthtalk@emagazine.com
http://www.emagazine.com/earthtalk/ar
mailto:fcswd@rtcol.com
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New books at the library:
ADULTS:
Christian Fiction— A Passion 
Most Pure (# 1 of The Daughters 
of Boston series) by Julie 
Lessman; As High as The 
Heavens by Kathleen Morgan; 
Solemnly Swear by Nancy Moser; 
Sons of Glory (#3 of The Thistle 
and The Cross series) by Craig 
Parshall; and The Battle of Vast 
Dominion (#3 of The Trophy 
Chase trilogy) by George Bryan 
Polivka.
Large Print General Fiction- 
Sr/// Summer by Jacquelyn 
Mitchard.
Large Print Christian Fiction— 
One More Sunrise by Michael 
Landon Jr. and Tracie Peterson.
Short Story Collection— Eyes to 
See edited by Bret Lott.
JUVENILES:
Picture Books Fiction—
Dumpy’s Valentine (from the 
Dumpy series) by Julie Andrews 
Edwards; Uh-Oh! (from the 
Harry and His Bucket Full of 
Dinosaurs series) by R. Schuyler 
Hooke; We Love Bathtime (from 
the Rubbadubbers series) by 
Alison Inches; Bubble Trouble by 
Stephen Krensky; and Max and 
Mo’s First Day of School by 
Patricia Lakin.
Ages 10 and Under Fiction—

Brown Bear gets in Shape (from 
the Brown Bear series) by Alan 
Durant; The Treasure Chest by 
Dominique Falda; Clean Up, 
Grumpy Bunny by Justine K. 
Fontes; Friends Forever by Sally 
Grindley; Buried Treasure by 
Kirsten Hall; The Littlest 
Christmas Tree by R.A. Herman; 
Wanda Witch and The Stray 
Dragon and Wanda Witch and 
Too Many Frogs (from the 
Wanda Witch series) by Rose 
Impey; and Pinky Stinky Doo and 
Shrinky Pinky (from the Pinky 
Dinky Doo series) by Jim Jinkins.

+++

Junior High Wrestling
The Caston Junior High 

wrestlers competed in the 
Logansport Invitational Saturday, 
March 8.

Finishing for the Comets were: 
70 lb. - Derek Berkshire, second 
75 - Kyle Harvey, third 
80 - Cane Nilson, third 
90 - Cole Nilson, second 
110 - Braxton Lee, fourth 
115 - Graham Redweik, fourth 
125 - Trevor Hoover, second 
130 - Blain Hizer, third 
135 - Jeremey Gonzalez, second 

+++

Elliot Rowe to play 
baseball at Bethel
Caston senior Elliot Rowe has 

signed a letter of intent to play 
baseball at Bethel College, 
Mishawaka. Shown at the signing 
are, seated left to right, Elliot’s 
sister, Emily Rowe; his mother, 
Stephanie Rowe; Elliot; and his 
father, Ken Rowe. Standing are 
Dan Foster, Caston principal; 
Blake Mollenkopf, Caston 
baseball coach; Seth Zartman, 
Bethel College baseball coach; 
Elliot’s brother, Caleb Rowe; and 
Debb Stevens, Caston athletic 
director.

4—I—F

CASTON MENU 
March 17 21 

Breakfast
Choice each day with juice and 

milk: cereal and toast;
sausage/cheese bun; ham/cheese 
bun; or toaster pastry

Lunch
Monday - Cheeseburger, 

potatoes, pears and milk. Comet 
Cafe - pizza

Tuesday - Soft tacos with meat 
and cheese, lettuce & tomato, 
sherbet and milk. Comet Cafe - 
bacon, lettuce and tomato bun 
and chips

Wednesday - Barbecue 
sandwich, augratin potatoes, corn,

Jell-0 poke cake and milk. Comet 
Cafe - chicken and onion rings

Thursday - Chicken nuggets, 
whipped potatoes and gravy, 
California blend, triple chocolate 
chip cookie and milk. Comet 
Cafe - seafood platter and fries

Friday - Toasted cheese 
sandwich, potatoes, green beans, 
peaches and milk. Comet Cafe - 
pepperoni/cheese stuffed bread 
sticks

4—I—F

Caston is looking for an 
assistant softball coach. If 
interested, contact Debb Stevens 
at 574-857-3505, extension 319 
or email stevensd@caston.kl2.in.us.

NOTICE TO TAXPAYERS OF FULTON COUNTY OF PROPOSED TAX RATES
Notice is hereby given to the taxpayers of Fulton County, Indiana, on the budgets, tax rates and tax levies submitted by the tax levying officials of the several taxing units of the County Rates of taxation on each one hundred dollars ($100) of assessed 

property are hereby proposed, subject to the appeal for State, County or other purposes for 2007 payable 2008.

AUBBEE- ROCHESTER UNION UNION UNION ROCHESTER
NAUBBEE HENRY LIBERTY NEWCASTLE RICHLAND TWP CASTON ROCH PULASKI WAYNE AKRON FULTON KEWANNA CITY

STATE RATES
STATE FAIR BOARD 0.0008 0.0008 0.0008 0.0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 0008 0.0008 0.0008 0.0008 0 0008 0.0008 0 0008 0.0008
STATE FORESTRY 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0.0016 0 0016 0 0016 0.0016 0.0016
TOTAL STATE RATE 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024 0.0024

COUNTY RATES
COUNTY GENERAL 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 0 5977 0.5977 0 5977 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 0.5977 
COUNTY HEALTH 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 0.0344 
CUMULATIVE BRIDGE 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0 0400 0 0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 0.0400 
REASSESSMENT 2006 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0 0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 
HOSPITAL DEBT 0.0414 0.0414 0.0414 0.0414 0 0414 0.0414 0.0414 0.0414 0.0414 0 0414 0.0414 0 0414 0.0414 0.0414 
CUM CAP DEVELOPMENT 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0 0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0.0326 0 0326 
SUB TOTAL COUNTY 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 0.7661 

FAMILY & CHILDREN SERV 0.1282 0.1282 0.1282 0.1282 0 1282 0 1282 0.1282 0 1282 0 1282 0 1282 0 1282 0.1282 0 1282 0 1282 
WELFARE HCI 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0 0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 0.0765 
WELFARE MED AID WD 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0 0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0.0072 0 0072 
WELFARE CWSHN 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0 0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 0.0085 
CHILDREN'S PSYCHIATRIC 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 0.0363 
SUB TOTAL CO WELFARE 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 0.2567 
TOTAL COUNTY RATE 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228 1.0228

AVIATION RATES
Operating 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0.0658 0 0658 0.0658 0.0658 0 0658 0.0658
Cum Building 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051 0.0051
TOTAL AVIATION RATE 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709 0.0709

CIVIL TWP RATES
TOWNSHIP (GENERAL) 0.0400 0.0279 0.0080 0.0300 0.0099 0.0200 0.0600 0.0600 0.0600 0.0200 0.0279 0.0080 0.0600 0.0200
TWP POOR RELIEF (ASSIST) 0.0080 0.0100 0 0009 0.0100 0.0060 0.0060 0.0060 0.0040 0.0080 0.0060 0.0100
TWP FIRE FIGHTING 0.0900 0.1497 0.0300 0.0500 0 0245 0.1300 0.0600 0.0600 0.0600 0.0500
TWP RECREATION 0.0080 0.0080
COMMUNITY BUILDING 0.0050
CUMULATIVE FIRE FUND 0.0200 0.0200 0 0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0200 0.0300
FIRE DEBT 0.0375 0.0300
CEMETERY
TWP DEBT SERVICE
TOTAL TOWNSHIP 0.1300 0.2151 0.0740 0.1450 0.0553 0.1600 0.1460 0.1460 0.1460 0.1040 0.0279 0.0240 0.0660 0.0300

CITY/TOWN RATES

LIBRARY RATES
LIBRARY OPERATING 0.1300 0.1200 0.1300 0.1300 0.1300 0.1300 0 1400 0 1400 0.1400 0.1300 0 1200 0.1300 0 1400 0.1300
LIBRARY DEBT 0.0600 0 1400 0.0600 0 0600 0.0600 0.0600 0.0600 0 1400 0.0600 0 0600
LIBRARY CAP PROJECT 0.0300 0.0200 0.0300 0 0300 0.0300 0.0300 0.0300 0 0200 0.0300 0.0300
LEASE RENTAL
LIBRARY BOND LEASE REDEMPTION
TOTAL LIBRARY RATE 0.2200 0.2800 0.2200 0.2200 0.2200 0.2200 0.1400 0.1400 0.1400 0.2200 0.2800 0.2200 0.1400 0.2200

SCHOOL RATES
GENERAL SCHOOL 0.7091 1 0309 1.2471 1.0309 1 1560 1 1560 1.2471 1 1560 1.5600 1.2471 1.0309 1.2471 1 2471 1.1560 
DEBT SERVICE 0.3072 0.7875 0 1628 0 7875 0 4867 0.4867 0.1628 0 4867 0 2750 0 1628 0.7875 0 1628 0 1628 0 4867 
CAPITAL PROJECTS 0.2314 0.5246 0.5279 0.5246 0 7207 0 7207 0 5279 0.7207 0.5000 0.5279 0 5246 0.5279 0 5279 0.7207 
TRANSPORTATION 0.1313 0.3510 0.3647 0 3510 0 1911 0.1911 0.3647 0.1911 0.2000 0.3647 0.3510 0.3647 0 3647 0.1911 
BUS REPLACEMENT 0.0501 0 0455 0.0992 0 0455 0 1260 0 1260 0 0992 0 1260 0.0330 0 0992 0 0455 0 0992 0 0992 0.1260 
SPECIAL ED PRE SCH 0.0017 0.0052 0.0143 0 0052 0 0097 0 0097 0.0143 0 0097 0.0100 0.0143 0.0052 0.0143 0 0143 0.0097 
RETIRE/SEV/BOND DEBT 0.0559 0 0845 0 0845 0.0845 0.0845 
TOTAL SCHOOL RATE 1.4867 2.7447 2.4160 2.7447 2.7747 2.7747 2.4160 2.7747 2.5780 2.4160 2.7447 2.4160 2.4160 2.7747

GENERAL CORP
STREET(MVH)
PARK
FIREMEN PENSION(OLD)
POLICE PENSION (OLD)
CITY HALL DEBT
CUM CAP DEVELOPMENT
CITY BLDG RENOVATION 
PARK BOND
SEWER BD/ MINNOW CR DBT 
SEWER/MINNOW MAINT
CUM CAP IMPROVEMENT-FIRE
CUM CAP IMPROVEMENT 
LEASE AGREEMENT
TOTAL CORP RATE

TOTAL TAXING UNIT RATE
LAKE BRUCE CONSERV
MILL CREEK CONSERV 
NYONA LAKE CONSERV 
FULTON CO SOLID WASTE

0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

2.9328 4.3359 3.8061

0 0900

4.2058

0 0000 0 0000 0 0000 0 0000

1 1600
0 2200

0 1300

1 5900 1 0100
0 4400

0.8632 
0.5998 
0 1502
0.0189 
0 0248 
0 0607 
0 0/14

0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000

0 0500

1.5600 1.5900

0 1500

1.6000

0 0448
0 0052
0 0032

1.8422

4.1461 4.2508 3.7981 4.1568 3.9601 3.8361 5.7087 5.3461 5.3181 5.9630

0 0000 0 0000

0 1100
0 0900

0 0000

0 1100
0 0900

0 0000

0 1100
0 0900

0 0000

0 0900

0 0000 0 0000 0 0000 0 0000 0 0000

Ten or more taxpayers or one (1) taxpayer that owns property that represents at least ten percent (10%) of the taxable assessed valuation in the political subdivision affected by the county board of tax adjustment's action on a political subdivisions budg 
objecting petition with the County Auditor to such budgets within ten days from the date of publication of this notice All appeals shall be in writing addressed to the Department of Local Government Finance naming specifically the items in the budgets a 

and shall be filed with the County Auditor The Auditor shall forward the statement, with the budget to the Department of Local Government Finance for consideration This notice is given in compliance with Acts of 1937 Chapter 119 as amended bv Acts 
of 1937 Chapter 119, as amended by Acts of 1947, Chapter 41, and the rights of taxpayers and the manner of filing objections are set forth herein

____________ Publish March 6 &8 13, 2008
Dated this 3rd day of March. 2008 Denise J Chandler, Fulton County Auditor

mailto:stevensd@caston.kl2.in.us
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Grass Creek School History
Continued From Last Week...

THE CULTIVATION
From those small beginnings - a 

class of five graduates, a faculty 
of two teachers, a curriculum of 
academic subjects - the school 
has come a long way. Seven 
trustees, thirteen principals, and 
scores of teachers have served the 
high school of Wayne Township. 
Majesty High School, the title 
given the school by its first 
trustee, E. J. Buchanan, was 
commissioned by the State of 
Indiana during the 1905-06 
school year. It is not certain how 
long the school was called 
Majesty High School. Some 
questionnaires indicated the name 
officially changed around 1912 
and a 1917 report to the 
Superintendent of Public 
Instruction shows the name at 
that time to be Grass Creek High 
School; however, many people 
referred to the school as Majesty 
High School as late as 1923.

CURRICULUM
As stated earlier, the early years 

of Majesty/Grass Creek High 
School taught the purely 
academic curriculum. Four years 
of grammar were required, as 
were three years of math, four 
years of history, and four years of 
Latin. Political geography 
(agriculture) was also required. 
As the years went on, other 
subject fields were added as the 
school grew and more teachers 
were employed. Grass Creek 
School’s first band was organized 
in 1921 under the direction of 
May Kumler. Without the 
records, which perished with the 
fire, it is impossible to say when 
such new subjects as biology, 
shorthand, typing, health and 
safety, physics, home economics, 
business, sociology, psychology 
and industrial arts were added to 
the curriculum. By 1956, Grass 
Creek High School offered one of 
the broadest curriculums to 
choose from in Fulton County, as 
there were 39 different courses to 
choose from.

STUDENT ACTIVITIES
One needs only to read a history 

of education to know that early 
extra-curricular activities were 
frowned upon by both educators 
and patrons. This was especially 
true of physical education 
activities. Students of early 
Majesty High School were not 
unlike other high school students 
of that time - they wanted outside 
activities. Probably the earliest 
form of extracurricular activities 
in Majesty High School were the 
debate societies. At least two 
such societies are remembered - 
the Rileys and the Athenians. 
Debates were of an intramural 
nature and no contests with other 
schools were held.
Many games were played before 

school and during the noon hour. 
Early favorites were black man, 
dare base, baseball, fox-and- 
geese, ice skating, and (as one 
questionnaire indicated) fighting 
when teachers were not around.
Organized sports probably 

started with the Majesty Athletic 
Club, which was organized in 
1905. Members of this club were 
called MACs. They met in the old 
Grass Creek Common School 
(Everett Cunningham’s resi- 
dense). This club had no 
connection with the school as one 
did not need to be in school to

belong, although most members 
were high school students. They 
had uniforms and played many 
baseball games with various other 
towns and villages. This urge to 
organize teams was also going on 
in other schools throughout 
Indiana and the nation at this 
time. Although most early 
educators fought the movement 
of sports into schools, the 
organization of teams continued 
and finally school authorities 
realized that if sports were to 
continue, they should be under 
school supervision.
There are no records or 

memories of the first 
interscholastic contest with 
another school. There is a belief 
by some that the first 
interscholastic contests were in 
baseball during the 1915-16 
school year. About this time, 
however, basketball, soon to be 
king in Indiana, was growing 
popular with the boys at Old 
Majesty High. An outside court 
was prepared behind the school 
building. During the 1915-16 
school year, Mr. S. Earl Rouch, 
superintendent of Fulton County 
Schools, and then principal of 
Majesty High School, organized 
and coached a basketball team 
that represented Wayne 
Township. They had a fine team 
consisting of Al McLochlin, 
Archie Wills, Jack and Arthur 
Burns, John Douglass, and Harley 
Miller. They won most of then- 
games. Games were played on the 
outside court in the fall and in the 
old Catholic Church in the winter. 
Soon the church building became 
too small and practices were held 
in the Kewanna gym when 
possible. Games were played 
away with schools that had gyms. 
With basketball gaining 
popularity in the early 1920s, the 
patrons began to come and watch 
their boys play ball. Grass Creek 
played as curtain raisers to many 
Kewanna High School games. 
Agitation for a gym started 
around 1923 and continued to rise 
until a gym was constructed in 
1928. It was the largest gym in 
the county at that time and the 
Fulton County tournament was 
played there in 1928 and 1929. It 
would be almost impossible to 
find the win and loss data on the 
teams representing Majesty/Grass 
Creek High School. We know 
that many fine teams have 
represented the school. Grass 
Creek never captured a sectional 
tourney (as of the writing of this 
history), but won the county 
tourney twice, in 1940 and 1941. 
The Panthers won several four­
way tournaments. Probably the 
greatest team in the win/loss 
department was the 1936 team, 
which went through its 20 
scheduled games undefeated. It 
was also during the 1936 
basketball season that the team 
got its name, the Panthers. The 
members of that great team all 
purchased a black basketball shoe 
called “black panther”. The boys 
began calling themselves the 
Black Panthers. Somewhere 
along the line the ‘black” was 
dropped. The school song was 
adopted during the later Majesty 
High School days. May Kumler 
wrote the words and applied them 
to the Illinois Loyalty tune. There 
have, however, been a few minor 
additions and subtractions of the

original words.
The first annual was published 

in 1940. It is uncertain when the 
first school paper was published 
but it is believed around 1938-39.
The title of the first paper 
“Panther Scratches” is still used 
today.

The first school plays were 
presented in the old Majesty 
Athletic Club where a stage was 
built. Later a temporary stage was 
built in the assembly in the old 
building and plays were 
presented. During the 1920s and 
early 30s, several minstrels were 
presented.

Grass Creek School has not 
been without tragedy. In the 
earlier days, Ruth Linden was 
killed and Nellie Walsh injured 
when a team ran away with the 
school hack. Later, in 1939, seven 
Grass Creek juniors were injured 
in a bus/street car accident in 
Chicago on their junior trip. In 
1937, Old Majesty High burned!
After the fire destroyed Old 

Majesty, a new school was built 
connected with the gym, which 
had been saved. The building, 
now Grass Creek School 
(officially Wayne Township 
School) was built under the 
supervision of township trustee 
Loyd Rouch and his advisory 
board of Alpha Hoesel, Lawrence 
Funk and Harry Hiatt. The 
architect was Henry C. Wolf and 
the construction firm was W. R. 
Dunkin and Sons.

TRANSPORTATION
To students today, probably one 

of the sights to see would be the 
coming and going of alumni in 
the older days. Transportation 
was provided the common 
(elementary) pupils in horse- 
drawn hacks. High school 
students had to furnish their own 
transportation. Most of the early 
students who lived farther than 
walking distance used the horse 
and buggy for transportation. The 
horses were kept in several barns 
during the school day. Several 
barns used for this purpose were 
Melvin Thomas’s, Heward’s, 
Tommy Harrison’s, Janie 
Albro’s, and Grace Downs’. A 
fee of a dollar a month was 
usually charged. When roads 
were very muddy many rode 
horseback. When the snow was 
high, boats were often pulled by 
horses over the snow in place of 
the hack. There are many 
conflicting theories on when the 
first motor bus was used, but 
evidence leads us to believe 
around 1923-24.

THE GOLDEN HARVEST
Space and time have permitted 

us to only scratch the surface of 
what could have been written. 
One lesson that we have learned 
well is that the alumni, students, 
faculty and community can well 
feel proud of the high school. 
After doing this research on the 
school, one can feel the spirit as 
one walks down the rows of 
pictures in the “hall of fame”. 
One can almost hear the sounds 
of yesteryears, sounds of 
teachers’ lecturing, laughter, 
cheers from the gymnasium and 
playgrounds. One can see the 
changing styles in the various 
photographs. Yes, the students 
are thankful to the community for 
providing a high school, and for 
the many fine memories that 
going through high school brings. 
Thanks also to the community for 
the fine education that has 
enabled so many of the graduates

to go forth and make fine citizens 
they have and will become.

We call this section “The 
Golden Harvest” because 
education is a planting, a 
cultivation and harvest of 
preparation for young people to 
meet the needs of the life they 
will live. That was true 50 years 
ago (now 102 years) when the 
first graduates came forth from 
Majesty High School, and it is 
true on the 50th anniversary when 
the 14 members of the Class of 
’56 will go forth from the 
institution which began its history 
a half a century ago. With the 
graduation of 14 seniors in 1956, 
Majesty/Grass Creek High 
School had graduated a total of 
558 students, truly a “golden 
harvest”.

+++

Volunteer drivers 
needed
Volunteer drivers are being 

sought to help with the Road to 
Recovery Program. The 
volunteers will drive cancer 
patients from their homes to their 
cancer related treatments and 
tests. This transportation could 
involve a round trip to 
Logansport for radiation therapy. 
The Road to Recovery volunteer 
would need to provide his/her 
own vehicle and gas for the trip.

However, American Cancer 
Society representatives hope that 
“in the very near future, we will 
be providing gas cards for use 
with this program.”
If interested in becoming a Road 

to Recovery volunteer driver, call 
Shelby Peck at the Mishawaka 
American Cancer Society office 
at 866-522-31 15 or Joan Lauder 
at 574-946-2180.

+++

Kewanna Community 
Food Pantry

United Methodist Church 
Open Thursdays by 

Appointment
Call 574-653-2201 or 

574-653-9052 
+++

FOR SALE

FOR SALE - New shipment of 
pecans. $6.50 for a 1-pound bag. 
Available at The Observer, 
Kewanna, or by calling Beth 
Weller, 653-2173, or Karen 
Good, 653-2777. 

4-4-4-

Public Notice
Fulton County 

ADVERTISING CLAIMS 
for March 17th, 2008

ACS Inc., 1,725.00; Akron Animal Clinic 
Inc., 150.00; Akron Area Arts League, 
800 00; Amco Elevators Inc., 396.24; Anco 
Inc., 43.99; Andrews Walt, 39.00; Arrow Pest 
Control Inc., 53.63; Association of IN 
Counties Inc., 150.00; Atlas Collections Inc., 
386.82; B&B Mens Wear Inc., 22.99; Bobs 
Lock & Key Inc., 61.70; Boyce 
Forms/Systems Inc., 594.75; Bratemans Inc., 
9 70.26; Brown, Richard, 109.94; Burke & 
Heller, 1,389.66; Clark Willard L & Pauline E, 
439.6 7; CSI-Computer Systems Inc., 135.00; 
Calico Industries Inc., 204.70; Casa Fulton 
County Inc., 21,456.14; Centenial Wireless, 
76.63; Chandler, Denise J, 15.29; Citicard, 
1,438.05; Cody Computer Services Inc., 
16,110.00; Cramer, Casi, 5.21; Culligan of 
Fulton Co., 21.00; DMC Lasers Inc., 189.00; 
Duke Energy, 2,603.62; EMBARQ, 3,732 19; 
Enyart William F, 9.14; Edington, Ralph, 
208.00; Enid Tate Shepherd, 99 7.66; Enyarts 
True Value Hardware Inc., 39.26; 
Fenstermaker Don & Annette, 570.55; Fine 
Things, 15.59; First Financial Bank, 119.34; 
Four County Conseling Center, 150.00; 
Fulton County EMS, 39,793.00; Fulton County 
Jail Commissary, 153.93; Fulton County 
Sheriff Dept., 5,000.00; Fulton County Sheriff 
Fund, 35.80; Giles Iva, 14.92; Gall’s Inc., 
299.49; Garver Motors Inc., 600.66; Good Oil 
Co Inc., 2,711.63; Henderson James H & 
Dorothy E, 153.25; Holgren Patricia & Noel, 
512.42; Howes Clayton M & Mable L, 159.03; 
HP Products Inc., 103.48; Haley-Aldrich Inc., 
339.30; Harter Beverly, 1,545.00; Health 
Professionals LTD, 4,847.60; Herrman & 
Goetz Inc., 591.43; Holloway Bernard, 29.99; 
Hurst, Lorie, 82.40; IKON Office Solutions 
Inc., 517.18; IN Dept of Workforce Dvlpmnt, 
333.20; IVRA, 25.00; Indiana Chamber Of 
Commerce, 292.56; Indiana Office of 
Technology, 338.81; Inventory Trading Co., 
127.50; Kasten Maurice R & Heather, 184.10; 
Marriott North Ind., 118.81; Key Waste 
Indiana Partnership, 98.20; Kroeger Funeral 
Home Inc., 100.00; Leiter Teddy D & Karen 
Joan, 46.12; Lagrou, Jeffrey & Donna, 
250.00; Lectrecom Inc., 86.00; McCrosky 
Donald J Liv Trust, Morse Sandi, 5.49; 
Morton, Judge Douglas, 39.19; Municipal 
Electronics Inc., 322.00; NIPSCO, 243.00; 
O’Herron Inc., Ray, 344.38; Oliver Douglas R 
& Leslie A, 6.95; Observer, 326.33; Plumlee 
Maintenance, 960.00; Priority Dispatch Inc., 
315.00; Purdue University, 17.00; Quality 
Auto Repair, LLC, 51.90; Quill Coro., 
1,066.99; Reed, Judith, 49.60; Reliable 
Office Supplies Inc., 127.10; Reporters & 
Paper MFG Co., 7.72; Robert J Kinsey Youth 
Center, 7,670.00; Rochester Chamber of 
Commerce, 4,000.00; Rochester High 
School, 1,500.00; Rochester Optimist Club, 
1,000.00; Rochester Sentinel Corp., 77.94; 
Rochester Telephone Co., 4,322.34; 
Rochester Telephone Co., 527.98; Rochester 
Water Dept., 1,282.38; Rockhurst University 
Continuin, 597.00; Sawka Ethel, Burk Joseoh 
&, 93.56; Secretary of Housing & Urbin 
Devlp., 357.74; Sherron John H, 5.08; 
Suwalski Charles F & Rowland, 986.79; 
Swart David P & Amy M, 112.30; Saylor J H 
Inc., 105.91; Sears Commercial One, 18.01; 
Smith Office Plus Inc., 38.00; Smith Sawyer 
Smith Inc., 2,402.00; Steele Wayne, 80.00; 
Steven R Jenkins Co Inc., 243.94; The Tire 
Store, 15.75; Treasurer Fulton County, 
174.00; Universal Lighting Co Inc., 845.48; 
Van Ausall & Farrar Inc., 84.09; Verizon, 
20 7.99; WTH Engineering Inc., 75.00; 
Walmart Community BRC, 47.14; Waste 
Management Inc., 141.59; Webbs 
Electronics/Radio Shack, 8.07; Webbs Family 
Pharmacy Inc., 34.36; West Group Payment 
Center, 1,777.50; Whetstone Angy, 47.20; 
Wildman Inc., 228.87; Xerox Corp., 55.65.
WITNESS MY HAND AND SEAL OF THE 

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, FULTON CO., 
INDIANA ON MARCH 10th, 2008.

DENISE J. CHANDLER
Pub. 3/13/08 FULTON COUNTY AUDITOR

Buy 
Sell 
Rent

FULTON COUNTY 
COURTHOUSG HOURS 
Mon. thru Thurs. 8 to 4 

Friday, 8 to 5 
CLOSED Sat. and Sun.

FOR RENT

Station House
APARTMENTS....

KEWANNA, INDIANA
Spacious one bedroom and effi­
ciency apartments. Private exterior 
entry; refrigerator; range; on-site 
laundry facilities; some utilities 
included. Country setting; plenty 
of off-street parking. Rent based 
on 30% of adjusted income; in­
come guidelines apply - Elderly 
(62 and older). Disabled, Handi­
capped Housing; Rental Assistance 
Available. For more information 
Call Lucille Bowlan at (765) 669- 
1308 or Kathy Richards Manage­

ment at 1-888-576-6468.

Equal Housing Opportunities 
Now Taking Applications
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Town & Country 
Chatter...

by: Julie Brown (574) 653-2451

Four robins were sighted the 
first weekend of March by Linda 
Garner, Wilma Wilson and Jackie 
Heidenreich. So Mother Nature, 
get your act together; the robins 
say spring has arrived!

Leonard and Nancy Evers were 
in Indianapolis Monday, March 3. 
They had an enjoyable time as 
overnight houseguests of their 
daughter, Diane Evers. Joining 
them in the evening for a visit 
over supper were Leonard and 
Nancy’s son, John Evers.

Don and Pauline Scales 
traveled to Ft. Wayne Tuesday, 
March 4. They took care of some 
business early in the day. 
Afterward, they were joined by 
their daughter, Ellen Heiden of 
Columbia City, for lunch and a 
chat.

Mathilda Lamb had company 
Wednesday, March 5. Stopping 
by late in the day while running 
some errands, was her niece, 
Claudia Winegardner.

Tom and Barb LaFollette spent 
Thursday, March 6, in the 
Kokomo area. They attended the 
funerals of family friends, Melva 
Smith of Greentown and Mason 
Kleiber of Kokomo. They also 
visited with Bud and Ingrid 
Landis and Angie, Mary, Mike 
and Joe Martino at Martino’s 
Italian Villa restaurant. Upon 
their return to this area, they 
stopped in Rochester and joined 
their daughter and her family, 
Karina and Terry Bohac, Shelby 
and Nick, for supper.

Jerry and Kay Brown and 
Kay’s mother, Mary K. 
Williamson of Winamac, were in 
Rochester Thursday evening. 
They had an exciting time 
attending a girls’ basketball 
game. The Browns’ grand­
daughter, Leighnee Smith, is a 
player for Rochester.

Jackie Heidenreich had 
company Thursday. Coming over 

late in the day for a visit and 
bringing along supper was her 
son, Roger Vogel of Rochester.

Dennis and Susan Wilson of 
Greensburg arrived Friday, 
March 7, for an overnight 
working visit with Dennis’s 
mother, Lois Wilson. They 
tackled some chores around the 
house while it was still daylight. 
In the evening, they looked 
through slides of family trips that 
were taken when Dennis was 
younger.

Hugh and Maryellyn Tennent 
accompanied Gil and Joyce Vallis 
to Kokomo over the weekend.

Wilma Wilson and Mathilda 
Lamb were treated to dinner 
Saturday afternoon by Wilma’s 
son- in- law and Mathilda’s 
nephew, Bill Foerg of Royal 
Center.

Barb and Jon Gast were in 
Rochester Saturday. They

enjoyed attending the boys’ 
basketball game held at Columbia 
Elementary School. Their great- 
grandson, Riley Sutton, was one 
of the players. Also attending the 
game were Riley’s siblings, 
Brendan and Katelyn; his great- 
grandparents, Harold and Phyllis 
Sutton and Ray and Beth Weller; 
his great- great- aunt, Betty 
Leazenby; his grandmother, Cora 
Lynn Clemans; and several other 
family members.

Nancy and Leonard Evers had 
a nice time as supper guests of 
their son and daughter- in- law, 
Dave and Maria Evers, Saturday 
evening.

Pauline and Don Scales had a 
couple of callers Sunday, March 
9. Stopping by in the afternoon 
for a visit and helping with some 
chores was their daughter, Linda 
Garner. In the evening, their 
granddaughter, Cindy Wiese 
walked over for a chat.

Jackie Heidenreich had a nice 
time as a dinner guest of Roger 
and Brenda Vogel Sunday 
afternoon.

Julie Brown had a fun time 
Sunday afternoon attending a 2nd 
birthday party held in honor of 
one of her “munchkins,” Tanner 
Sutton. Hosting the event were 
Tanner’s parents and brothers, 
Steve and Wendy Sutton, Jake 
and Luke.

Barb and Tom LaFollette 
accompanied Karina and Terry 
Bohac, Shelby and Nick, to 
Kokomo Sunday. They visited 
with Tom Miller of Sharpsville, 
who has been hospitalized due to

a recent illness. Later, the 
LaFollettes and Bohacs dined at 
The Golden Corral restaurant.

Leonard and Nancy Evers had 
company Sunday. Coming over 
from Rochester for a visit and 
bringing along dinner were their 
daughter and son- in- law, Janet 
and C.J. Yocum.

Those persons who will be 
having birthdays next week (so 
please remember to give them 
your best regards) are: Matt 
Carlson, Kris French and T.J. 
Garner, March 16; Mike Bartram, 
Adam Berry, Lynette Good, 
Haley Harding, Theresa Hott, 
Terry Newton, Rob Lewark, 
Devon Overmyer, Violet 
Troutman and Pat Zellers, March 
17; Beth Ann Deckard and 
Lorena Kline, March 18; Jeremy 
Agnew, Haley Markley and 
Chase Simpson, March 19; Bill 
Gupton, Louise Masteller, 
Darlene Masunas, Gary L. 
Plummer, Jerry J. Plummer and 
Adam Troutman, March 20; 
Randy Hall, Ryan Hall, Lorna 
Mollencupp, Haley Rigney, 
Samson Shaw and Joshua Ton, 
March 21; and Larry Bucks, Tina 
Pesaresi and Bryan Thomas, 
March 22.

Mr. and Mrs. Bo Hines will be 
celebrating their wedding 
anniversary March 18.

+++

Construction set to begin 
on new Ivy Tech Campus 
in Logansport
(STATEHOUSE)- Sen. Tom 

Weatherwax (R-Logansport) 
announced construction of the 
new Ivy Tech Campus in 
Logansport will begin this year. 
The new permanent facility will 
be built using $16 million in 
funds appropriated from both the 
State Budget Committee and

private money.
“I am very pleased this exciting 

and necessary project is now 
moving forward,” Weatherwax 
said. “We have worked hard over 
the years with Ivy Tech and the 
people of Logansport to build 

support, negotiate funding, and 
see this project through.”
The 81,880 square foot building 

will be built on 59 acres of land 
donated by the college and will 
replace existing leased space in 
Logansport. The new structure 
will house eight academic schools 
and an academic skill center. In 
addition, faculty offices, student 
common areas, a library, 
bookstore, meeting rooms and a 
wellness center for faculty, staff 
and students will also be located 
in the building.
“Without the help and 

leadership of Rep. Rich McClain 
(R-Logansport), we would not

have been able to facilitate the 
progress of this venture,” 
Weatherwax continued. “I 
expressly thank Rep. McClain 
and all those involved that put 
forth effort to bring the new Ivy 
Tech campus to a reality.

Ivy Tech-Logansport was 
established in 1972 and has been 
at its current location since 1983. 
It has seen enrollment continue to 
increase over the past several 
years and has become a focal 
point within the community. In 
addition, it is the only higher 
education institution within thirty' 
miles of Logansport.

Weatherwax represents Senate 
District 18, which includes Cass, 
Fulton, Kosciusko, Miami, 
Pulaski and Wabash Counties.
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Did You Know We Repair 

TRACTORS / LP Repair

GENERAL FARM TRACTOR 
REPAIR

Minneapolis Moline Parts 
and Service.......

AGRICULTURAL AIR 
CONDITIONING SERVICE

We Process All Types Of Tax Returns

COMPLETE LAWN 
& LANDSCAPE 
MAINTENANCE

COMMERCIAL / RESIDENTIAL 
“Since 1986”

If You’re Particular, Call Us. 
“We Are Too!”

R-MAR, Inc.
P 0 Box 465, Kewanna, IN

PH.: (574) 653-2387


