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Governor Daniels 
speaks at annual 
Lincoln Day dinner

Fulton County Republicans 
gathered last Wednesday, July 23, 
at the Fulton County Historical 
Society Museum for their annual 
Lincoln Day Dinner. The guest 
speaker for the evening was 
Governor Mitch Daniels.

The governor displayed several 
maps depicting the Hoosier 
state’s status in several categories 
including: one of four states 
boasting the best tax climate in 
the United States; one of four 
states with the best cost of doing 
business in the U.S.; one of eight 
states rated high by CEOs of 
America for confidence in the 
business climate; one of three 
states with a Standard and Poor’s 
AAA business rating; ranked in 
the top group by the Index of 
Economic Impact; and one of the 
top three states in attracting new 
jobs and investment. He also, 
noted that Indiana is operating in 
the black while 32 states are 
facing budget deficits.

+++

Pat Calvert, left, received the 
Republican Woman of the Year 
award at last week’s Lincoln Day 
Dinner. The award was presented

Royalty contest set for 
Fall Festival
Kewanna area youth are invited 

to participate in a royalty contest 
in conjunction with this year’s 
Kewanna Fall Festival. 
Contestants must have a sponsor, 
either a business or individual, 
which costs $25. There will be 
two age groups, 11-14 (prince 
and princess) and 15-18 (king and 
queen). Application forms will be 
available soon at local businesses. 
For more information, call Tom 
Mate at 574-653-2055 or 
Kandace Evers at 574-329-1844.

+++
AREA FIVE MENU 

Kewanna Fire Station
Monday, August 4 - Barbecue 

pork sandwich, lima beans, 
carrots, pineapple and milk

Wednesday, August 6 - Oven 
fried chicken, mashed potatoes, 
green beans, applesauce, roll and 
milk

Friday, August 8 - Ham, beans 
and cornbread, cole slaw, 
spinach, apricots and milk 

+++

by Carmella Villasana, president 
of the Fulton County Republican 
Women’s Club.

I + +

Fulton Fun Days, 
August 1, 2 and 3

The annual Fulton Fun Days 
will be held Friday, Saturday and 
Sunday, August 1, 2 and 3, and 
will include a 3-on-3 basketball 
tourney, mushball, a euchre 
tournament, quilt display, 3-on-3 
soccer for grades 5-8, 5K race 
and puppy trot walk, sand 
volleyball, parade (11:00 a.m. 
Saturday), kids games, co-ed 
waffle ball tournament, Texas 
hold’em tournament, bingo, pedal 
tractor pull, free pony and pony 
cart rides, cow patty bingo, food 
and much more.

Friday night’s entertainment 
will be karaoke with Captain 
Crunch and Will Dilts at 7 p.m. 
The Time Travelers will present a 
concert at 6:30 p.m. Saturday 
evening featuring classic, rock 
and country music. The Metea 
Baptist Church will host a gospel 
singspiration Sunday evening, 
August 3, at the park. A free 
picnic supper will begin at 5 p.m.

Those attending the festival 
should bring their own seating. 
Activities start at 6 p.m. Friday 
evening and continue from 6:30 
a.m. Saturday (Masonic breakfast 
on Wright Street) through the 
evening concert.

The theme for this year’s event 
is “My Country: Love It-Lead It”.

+++

Bulldog book sale
Friends of the Fulton County 

Public Library, Inc. will sponsor 
a book sale Saturday, August 2, 
during Fulton Fun Days. The 
event will be held in front of the 
Fulton branch library on State 
Road 25. Hours for the book sale 
will be 9 a.m. to 2 p.m. Book 
prices range from fifty cents for 
romance paperbacks to $1 for all 
other paperbacks and $1.50 for 
hardback books. Videos will be 
available for sale at $1 each.

This is the first time that the 
Friends have taken the book sale 
on the road. If this is successful, 
they want to make this an annual 
event as part of the Fulton Fun 
Days.

+++

Reservations needed 
for 50’s reunion

The Kewanna High School 
graduating classes of 1950 
through 1959 will meet Saturday, 
August 23, at Alejandra’s in 
Rochester for a reunion. There is 
still time to get your reservation 
in. Reservations should be sent to 
George and Pat Hoover, 2185 E. 
Sycamore Dr., Rochester, IN 
46975. When sending in your 
reservation, please include your 
name, address, the year you 
graduated or the years you 
attended school at Kewanna.

A social hour will begin at 5:30 
p.m. with a buffet dinner at 6:30 
p.m. The buffet will include three 
entrees, vegetables and a salad 
and dessert bar. The cost of the 
evening’s festivities is $20 per 
person. All graduates, persons 
who attended Kewanna Schools 
at one time during the 50s, 
friends and acquaintances are 
welcome to attend.

A blood collection day will be 
held Thursday, August 14, from 1 
to 7 p.m. at the Akron United 
Methodist Church. For more 
information or to schedule your 
blood donation appointment, call 
1-800-448-3 543.

The Mill Creek Conservancy 
District will meet in executive 
session at 8 a.m. Monday, August 
4, at the Burke & Heller Law 
Office, 113 E. 10th St., Rochester. 
The purpose of this meeting is to 
discuss litigation that has been 
threatened specifically in writing.

The Caston baseball team was 
one of the high school baseball 
teams in Indiana that helped raise 
money for the American Cancer 
Society scholarship program. The 
program helps young cancer 
survivors reach their goals of 
going to college.

According to a recently released 
study, patients with early 
Alzheimer’s disease who 
exercised regularly saw less 
deterioration in the areas of the 
brain which control memory.

Tri State University at Angola 
will officially become Trine 
University tomorrow (Friday).

Downtown Rochester is now 
listed on the National Register of 
Historic Places. Owners of 
properties in the district can now 
qualify for grants, tax credits and 
other financial incentives to 
preserve their properties.

Chrysler reported last week that 
its financial arm will get out of 
the auto leasing business by the 
end of the month because 
economic conditions have made 
leasing more expensive than 
buying for both consumers and 
the company.

According to data released last 
Friday, the number of 
homeowners facing foreclosure 
more than doubled in the second 
quarter of this year, compared to 
a year ago.

Congress passed a mortgage 
relief bill last Saturday that will 
let homeowners who cannot 
afford their house payments 
refinance into more affordable 
government-backed loans rather 
than lose their homes.

The IU Simon Cancer Center in 
Indianapolis will open officially 
in August. The new $150 million 
cancer center is one of only 63 
designated cancer centers 
nationwide and the only one in 
Indiana.

The Children’s Museum in 
Indianapolis has announced a 
$15.7 million expansion. The 
expansion will add 37,500 square 
feet to the 433,500 square-foot

Waggoner ends term 
as board chairman

Ted A. Waggoner of Rochester 
completed his term as chairman 
of the Board of Trustees of 
Eureka College, Eureka, Illinois, 
on June 30. Waggoner, an 
attorney and partner at Peterson 
& Waggoner LLP, Rochester, 
served as chairman the last two 
years, during which the college 
saw record enrollment growth 
and significant financial growth. 
Waggoner is now serving his last 
year of a six-year term that ends 
in May 2009.

During Waggoner’s tenure, the 
college saw two straight years of 
record enrollment growth and the 
addition of new programs, 
including lifelong learning 
programs like special education 
certification and organizational 
leadership degree completion 
cohorts. Retention rates soared 
and the overall quality of the 
student body increased as 
reflected in higher GPAs for 
entering freshmen and higher 
overall average ACT scores. The 
college is poised for a third 
consecutive record enrollment 
this fall, with an estimated 700 
students enrolled for classes that 
begin August 27.

In addition, Eureka College 
achieved two consecutive years 
of positive financial results under 
Waggoner’s leadership. In 
addition to strong financial 
operating results, multiple capital 
projects were completed, 
including construction of a 1,800 
square-foot wellness center, 
construction of a soccer complex, 
improvements to the football 
stadium and a $2.1 million 
renovation and addition to the 
Dickinson Commons dining 
facility.

Waggoner attributes the 
successes of the past two years to 
the administration of college 
president Dr. J. David Arnold and 
his senior staff, to the efforts of 
the faculty and staff of the 
college, and to the members of 
the Board of Trustees who have 
devoted their time, talents and 
resources to continuing the 
improvements at Eureka College.

Eureka College was chartered in 
1855. It offers academic degrees 
in a wide area of the sciences, 
mathematics, business admin­
istration, social sciences, fine and 
performing arts, humanities and 
education. The college is 
affiliated with the Christian 
Church (Disciples of Christ). 
Waggoner is vice moderator of 
the Christian Church in Indiana.

+++

Rochester License Branch 
HOURS: 

Tues., 8:30 - 7:00 
Wed., Thurs. & Fri. 

8:30 - 5:00 
Sat., 8:30- 12:30 

CLOSED Sun. & Mon. 
+++++

museum and is expected to be 
completed by the time next year's 
King Tut exhibit opens.

i t +



Ruth Ann Anderson had a very 
busy two weeks recently. She 
spent two days at the Fulton 
County 4-H Fair watching her 
great-grandchildren show their 
beef and pigs. She left from the 
fair to go to South Bend to the 
home of her daughter, Becky 
Lincoln. Friday, Ruth Ann, 
Becky and Becky’s 
granddaughter, Kahlen Edwards, 
left for Madison, Wisconsin, to 
spend the weekend with Becky’s 
daughter and her family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dennis Halterman and 
Lauren. Saturday, the group 
visited the Madison City Zoo and 
in the evening they attended a 
concert at the Greenway Mall 
given by one of Madison’s most 
popular dance bands. The band
leader invited the children to 
come up to the dance floor and 
dance as he wanted them to know 
what good music is. Kahlen and 
Lauren, along with a few other 
children, answered his request. 
The band leader came down from 
the stage, stopped Ruth Ann’s 
two five-year-old granddaughters 
and asked them to old hands 
while he got down on his knees 
and serenaded them with a

Sat., August 2nd 
9 am - Noon Only! 

SALT SALE!!
80# Solar Salt 40# Solar Salt 
$7.32+tax $4.49 + tax

40# Iron Fighter 
$5.34 + tax

beautiful harmonica solo, his 
specialty. He then asked them to 
dance for him. Sunday, the group 
ate breakfast at the Original 
Pancake House and went to see 
The House on the Rocks at 
Spring Green, Wisconsin. The 
little girls loved the world’s 
largest carousel. Ruth Ann, 
Becky and Kahlen returned to 
South Bend Monday, bringing 
Lauren for a week’s visit. 
Highlights of the week were a 
visit to Chuck E. Cheese and a 
day spent at the Fair Oaks Dairy 
Farm. Ruth Ann returned to her 
home here Saturday to rest!

Great-aunt Tami Powell 
accompanied Keila Baldwin to 
Riley Hospital in Indianapolis last 
Tuesday evening to visit Avery 
Baldwin, a patient there. Avery 
was dismissed to her home here 
Sunday.
Tami Powell accompanied her

daughter-in-law and grand­
children, Melea Powell, Abigail, 
Ivy and Mitchell, to Indiana 
Beach at Monticello Thursday.

Mitchell Powell was a Monday 
and Tuesday guest of his 
grandparents, Rich and Tami 
Powell, while his mother and 
sisters, Malea Powell, Abigail 
and Ivy, his Grandma Weena and 
a cousin, Melonie, went to 
Merrillville and then on to Shedd 
Aquarium in Chicago.

Leonard and Nancy Evers 
traveled to Indianapolis Saturday. 
They had an enjoyable time 
attending a Mexican fiesta garden

CASA
Court Appointed Special Advocates

Make a difference in a 
child's life. Become a 

trained CASA Volunteer 
and speak up for the 

children of Fulton County.
You can be a voice for children 

in need of services.

Please call today 
5 74-2 23-218 3

Mill Race Complex, Rochester 
40! E. Eighth St, Ste. E 

E-mail:casafu ltoncounty@rtcol.com

Culligan 
Drinking 

Water

party hosted by their 
granddaughter, Andrea Yocum, 
and Peter Konchak. Over 15 
friends and family were present 
for the occasion.

Romayne Wentzel had 
company over the weekend. 
Coming for a visit were her 
children and their families Roger 
and Julie Wentzel, Nicholas, 
Peter and Katya of Falls Church, 
Virginia; Tim and Jeri Wentzel 
and Danny of Hicksville, Ohio; 
Becky and Mike Slentz, John, 
Rachel and Matthew of Butler; 
Don and Amy Wentzel, 
Alexander, Ryan and Derek of 
Fishers; and Carol and Chris 
Holmquest of Munster. Stopping 
by Saturday to visit with 
everyone were Romayne’s sister, 
Maxine Smith of Rochester; 
Doris Wentzel; and Teresa and 
Don Oilman of Winamac.

Mary and Earl Bangel and

www.townehomefurnishings.com
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Barbara and Rob Staub had 
visitors Saturday. Arriving in the 
evening for an extended visit was 
the Bangels’ daughter, Linda 
Bangel of Schoolcraft, Michigan. 
Accompanying Linda on the trip 
and remaining as overnight 
houseguests of the Bangels were

(574) 223-7632 (SOFA)
HOURS Mon.-Fri. 10:00am-6:00pm 
Sat. 9:00am - 5:00pm Closed Sun.

Nancy Pendziszewski and her 
son, Chris.

Fulton County 
Courthouse Hours: 
Mon. - Thurs. 8 to 4

Friday - 8 to 5 
CLOSED Sat. & Sun.

+++++

231 Apache Drive 
Rochester, IN 

46975

574-223-2420 • 888-294-5541
www.culliganfultoncounty.com

mailto:ltoncounty@rtcol.com
http://www.townehomefurnishings.com
http://www.culliganfultoncounty.com
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WOODLAWN HOSPITAL
July 21

Admissions - none published
Dismissals - Dale Ross, Monticello

July 22
Admissions — Martha Deturk, 

Rochester
Dismissals - none published
Births - Kayla Waltz, Rochester, a 

son
July 23

Admissions - none published
Dismissals - none published

July 24
Admissions - James Parrott, 

Lakeville
Dismissals - none published

July 25
Admissions - none published
Dismissals - Kayla Waltz and son, 

Rochester; Charlotte Swafford, 
Kewanna

PULASKI MEMORIAL 
HOSPITAL

July 18
Admissions - Tequia Blankenship,

Winamac; Michelle Hines, 
Logansport

Dismissals - none
July 19

Admissions - Patricia Hunt, Star
City

Dismissals - none
July 20

Admissions - none
Dismissals - Tequia Blankenship,

Winamac; Michelle Hines, 
Logansport
July 21

Admissions - none
Dismissals - Patricia Hunt, Star 

City; Jesse Stamper and Belen 
Brown, Winamac
July 22

Admissions - Sandra Feece, 
Winamac

Dismissals - none
July 23

Admissions - Cecelia Moroni, Knox
Dismissals - Carol Lewis, 

Rochester
July 24

Admissions - Mabel Bachert and
Renata Crissinger, Winamac; Kay 
Cappadora, Lewis

Dismissals - none 
+++

Recycling Dates 
Thurs., July 3rd, July 17th 

and Thurs., July 31st

Brenda Purkey, rn 
Patient Care 
Coordinator

A Nonprofit, Public Benefit Organization

(574) 224-4673

(888) 737-4673

* Website: http://www.rtcol.com/~hospice/

420 Main Street, P.O. Box 621 Rochester, IN 46975

413 N. East Street / Kewanna, IN 46939

(574) 653-2055

MERCHANDISE & CONSIGNMENT

Doors
August 2nd, 2008

Auction Starts 7 p.m. $3.00
Open DINNER

For AU Types of Items for Auction. Start
Preview Make Plans Now To Attend! Serving

At At
4*00nm For Pictures Check Us At auctionzip.com / Pictures of 5:00pm
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DEATHS........
CAROLE M. HAMMAN

Services for Carole M. 
Hamman. 73, Kewanna, will be 
held at 10:30 a.m. Friday, August 
1, 2008, at Harrison-Metzger & 
Rans Funeral Home, Kewanna 
Chapel. Pastor Steve McPeek will 
officiate and burial will be in the 
Kewanna Citizens-IOOF Cem­
etery at a later date. Mrs. 
Hamman died at 1:48 a.m. 
Tuesday, July 29, 2008, at 
Hickory Creek Healthcare Center 
in Winamac.

Born October 4, 1934 in 
Winamac, she was the daughter 
of the late Harry Dee and Ada 
Mae (Adams) Harris. She was 
married May 16, 1953 in 
Kewanna to Ron E. Hamman, 
who survives.

She was a 1952 Kewanna High 
School graduate and a member of 
the Kewanna United Methodist 
Church. Carole was an avid 
reader who also loved spending 
time with family and friends. She 
retired from Winamac Coil 
Spring in Kewanna, after 43 years 
of service.

Survivors include her husband, 
Ron, Kewanna; one son, Scott 
Hamman and his wife Elena of 
Viera, Florida; one daughter, 
Terri L. Lynch and her husband, 
Ed, of Winamac; 10 
grandchildren, Kyle, Eddie, 
Shannon, Heather, Sean, Brent, 
Nikki, Melissa, Amanda and 
Casandra; and eight great­
grandchildren, Brayden, Kamryn, 
Rylan, Maddox, Ashlee, Blake, 
Alex and Christian. She is also 
survived by several nieces and 
nephews. She was preceded in 
death by her parents, one son, 
Michael Hamman, and one 
brother, William Harris.

Friends may call from 2 to 8 
p.m. today (Thursday) at 
Harrison-Metzger & Rans 
Funeral Home, Kewanna Chapel.

Memorial contributions may be 
made to the American Diabetes 
Foundation.

Online condolences may be 
made to the Hamman family at 
www.harrisonmetzger.com.

+++

LAWRENCE JOSEPH 
PERRY

Funeral services were held at 
10:30 a.m. EDT Monday, July 
28, 2008, at St. Peter’s Catholic 
Church, Winamac, for Lawrence 
Joseph Perry, 90, Kewanna. 
Burial was in St. Peter’s Catholic 
Cemetery, Winamac. A Scriptural 
Wake Service was held at 7:30 
p.m. Sunday at Frain Mortuary, 
Winamac. Visitation was also 
held Sunday from 3 to 8 p.m. at 
Frain Mortuary. Mr. Perry died at 
7:40 a.m. Friday, July 25, 2008, 
at Pulaski Memorial Hospital in 
Winamac.

Born December 16, 1917, in 
Pulaski County, he was the son of 
Leujay and Bertha Lebold Perry, 
who preceded him in death.

He was raised in Harrison 
Township of Pulaski County and 
attended school in Harrison 
Township, where he later made 
his home. He was married 
November 3, 1942, at St. Anne’s 
Church in Monterey to Mary Jane 
Brucker, who survives.

He was a successful and 
hardworking farmer for 31 years 
on a farm that has been in the 
family for 90 years. After retiring 
from farming, he served as a 
foreman for the Indiana 
Department of Transportation 
from 1969 to 1978 and served a 
four-year term as Harrison 
Township Trustee. Lawrence 
designed and helped build his 
home and all of his farm 
buildings. He enjoyed many 
family trips to the western states, 
particularly to the Rocky 
Mountain area. Many family 
fishing trips were made to 
Minnesota with his father and 
later with his children. He and his 
wife owned Maple Corner 
Antiques and exhibited at many 
in-state and out-of-state antique 
shows. They particularly enjoyed 
fine antique china and primitives.
Lawrence and his wife were 

active members of St. Ann’s 
Catholic Church in Kewanna and 
are members of St. Peter’s 
Catholic Church in Winamac 
where he was a past member of 
the parish council.

In addition to his wife, he is 
survived by seven children, 
James (Mary Gudas) Perry, 
Piqua, Ohio, Rosemary (Stephen) 
Perry-Hessong, West Lafayette, 
Albert (Joyce Matteson) Perry, 
Evansville, Michael “Mick”, 
Perry, Sr., Winamac, Marilyn 
(Duane) Galbreath, Vonore, 
Tennessee, Kathleen (James) 
Weidner, Salem, Illionis, and 
Jane (Ron) Becker, Zionsville; 20 
grandchildren, Mary Eileen 
Miller, Lawrence Joseph Perry 
III, Christine Gladden, Theresa 
Whalen, Wayne Perry, Diana 
Perry, Michelle Perry, Michael 
Yoder, Lesly Norris, Christopher 
Perry, John Perry, Jennifer 
Gilliam, Stephanie Lemberis, 
Michael Perry, Jr., Duane 
Galbreath, Jr., Allison Galbreath, 
Lydia Weidner, Jack Weidner, 
Hannah Becker and Erica Becker;

Maintenance 
Doctor 

(574) 653-9904
Kitchen Remodeling

Bathroom Remodeling 
“No Job Too Small” 

Fast, Courteous Service... 
797 S. St. Rd. 17 / Kewanna, 

IN 46939a Division of R-Mjr Inc

20 great-grandchildren; and 
several nieces and nephews. He is 
also survived by two sisters, 
Anna Parcel, Winamac, and 
Theresa (Lloyd) Banks, Culver. 
He was preceded in death by one 
son, Lawrence Joseph Perry, Jr.; 
one grandson, Mark Perry; three 
sisters, Viola (Eugene) Smith, 
Mabel (Robert) Cecrle and Helen 
(Isadore) Crist; and one brother, 
Charles Perry.

Memorial contributions may be 
made through the funeral home to 
the Pulaski County Public 
Library, Ancilla College, St.

Peter’s Catholic Church or Sisters 
of Poor Clare, Belleville, Illinois.

+++

Pulaski Memorial 
Hospital Calendar

Prenatal classes will be held on 
consecutive Thursdays, July 31 
through August 28, from 7 to 9 
p.m. in the PMH conference 
center. There will be a 
breastfeeding class from 7 to 9 
p.m. on Thursday, Sept. 4. To 
register, call 574-946-2193 
Monday through Friday from 8 
a.m. to 4 p.m. If you deliver at 
PMH, there is no charge for the 
classes.

Kewanna Community 
Food Pantry

United Methodist Church 
Open Thursdays by 

Appointment
Call 574-653-2201 or 

574-653-9052 
+++

NOTICE TO TAXPAYERS OF BUDGET ESTIMATES AND TAX LEVIES

FULTON COUNTY
Notice is hereby given to the taxpayers of Fulton County, Indiana, that the County 
Council of Fulton County, Indiana, at the Fulton County Office Building, 125 E. 9th 
Street, Rochester, Indiana, on August 19, 2008 beginning at 8:00 a.m. will conduct 
a public hearing on the budget. Following this meeting, any ten or more taxpayers 
may object to a budget, tax rate, or tax levy by filing an objecting petition with the 
proper officers of the political subdivision within seven days after the hearing. The 
objecting petition must identify the provisions of the budget, tax rate, or tax levy that 
taxpayers object to. If a petition is filed, the political subdivision shall adopt with its 
budget a finding concerning the objections filed and testimony presented. Following 
the aforementioned meeting the fiscal body will meet at the Fulton County Office 
Building, 125 E. 9th Street, Rochester, Indiana, on September 5, 2008 at 8:00 a.m. 
to adopt the following budget.

BUDGET ESTIMATE

Complete details of budget estimates by fund and/or department may be seen at 
the office of the Fulton County Auditor.

650423008

Maximum Est. 
Funds To Be

Raised 
(including appeals 
and levies exempt 

from maximum levy 
limitations)

Current
Tax 

Levy
Budget

Fund Name Estimate

County General Fund $6,712,867 $6,069,681 $3,412,224
Cum Bridge Fund $407,100 $441,147 $385,998
Health Fund $272,663 $209,965 $122,232
Cum. Cap. Development Fund $420,000 $328,887 $258,617
Reassessment Fund $208,087 $286,153 $118,372
Hospital Lease Rental $275,000 
Corner Perpet’n/Surveyor 30,600 
Recorders Perpet’n 33,175 
Transfer/Plat Book 30,000 
Courthouse/Annex Lease Payment 450,000 
Tobacco Grant 104,695 
Mortgage Fee Fund -0- 
PHC-Public Health Coordinator 20,000 
Co. Highway Dept. Fund 1,978,608 
Local Roads & Streets 215,000 
Co. Correction Level III Fund 14,000 
Emergency Planning Fund 8,229 
Adult Probation User Fee Fund 238,342 
Adult Administration Fee 25,715 
Juvenile Probation User Fee Fund 6,713 
E-911 Emergency Telephone 277,352 
Hazardous Substance Fund 89,770 
Health Maintenance Fund 41,434 
County Drug Free Fund 20,000 
CEDITFund 172,660 
Accident Report Fund 2,000 
Handgun Application Fund 5,000 
Continuing Education 5,000 
Alcohol & Drug Fund 55,823 
Pre-Trial Fund 51,467 
Co. Convention, Visitor & Tourism 45,000 
Park & Recreation 39,500 
Jury Pay Fund 20,000
Fulton County Host -0- 
Bio Terrorism 18,000

$330,479 $308,799

TOTALS $12,293,800 $7,666,312 $4,606,242
The 2008 estimated maximum levy limitations for this unit is:... . . . . . 5,008,686
The Property Tax Replacement Credit
used to reduce the rate for this unit is:............. ........ $254,273
Taxpayers appearing at the hearing shall have an opportunity to be heard. Pursuant 
to IC 6-1.1-17-13, after the tax levies have been determined, fixed by the appropri­
ate governing body, and the tax rates published by the County Auditor, ten or more 
taxpayers objecting to the levies may appeal to the Department of Local 
Government Finance by filing a petition with the County Auditor. The petition must 
be filed on or before the tenth day after publication of the proposed tax rates 
charged. The County Auditor will then forward the objection petition to the 
Department of Local Government Finance for consideration. However, a group of 
ten or more taxpayers may not initiate an appeal against the notice of tax rates pub­
lished by the County Auditor if less than seventy-five percent (75%) of the objecting 
taxpayers were not objecting taxpayers on the objection petition filed upon publica­
tion of the notice to taxpayers of budget estimates and tax levies published by the 
unit.
Date: July 18, 2008

Denise J. Chandler 
Fulton County Auditor

Kewanna Locals
Those persons who will be 

having birthdays next week (so 
please remember to give them 
your best regards) are: Mike 
Cogdill, Rachel Cogdill and 
Maryellyn Tennent, Aug. 3; 
Robert Artist, Charlie Baldwin, 
Mary Chew, Johan Miller and 
Lanier Redweik, Aug. 4; Brandi 
Briney, Jacob Green, Kerrie 
Green and Linda Reinholt, Aug. 
5; Janet Burkett, Caleb Field, 
Kelly Smith and Joy Troutman, 
Aug. 6; Nathan Graham, Matthew 
McColley, Bonnie Smith, 
Charlotte Swafford and Wilma 
Wilson, Aug. 7; Jennie Galloway, 
Doug Johnston, Barb Steigely 
and Donna Zellers, Aug. 8; and 
David Berry, Alexander 
Gudeman, Andra Kegarise and 
Brayton MacLain, Aug. 9.

There are nine couples who 
will be celebrating their wedding 
anniversaries next week: Mr. and 
Mrs. Jeff Douglass, Aug. 3; Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Hibner and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jon Unger, Aug. 4; Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Bauman Jr. and Mrs. 
and Mrs. David Jones, Aug. 5; 
Mr. and Mrs. Brian Markle and 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve Rude, Aug. 6; 
Mr. and Mrs. Darel Bangel, Aug. 
7; and Mr. and Mrs. Wade Moss, 
Aug. 8.

+++
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SIXTY YEARS AGO 
July 29, 1948

Leo Kubicki, Rt. 3, Kewanna, a 
graduate of Indiana University, 
has accepted a position with the 
People’s Gas, Light and Coke 
Co., Chicago, as a property 
accountant.

Mildred Eddy has leased a 
building in Fulton from Sylvia 
Remienschneider which she will 
remodel and decorate to handle 
antiques and other old furniture 
and dishes.

Arthur Felder and son Forest are 
opening a new body shop and 
fender repair shop this week. The 
shop will be located in the rear of 
Forest Felder’s home, one-half 
block off Main St. on State Road 
17. Arthur has had 20 years of 
experience in this line of work 
and Forest had training while in 
the service. He has also worked at 
the trade in various garages since 
being discharged.

The Mothers Club held its 
annual picnic recently at the 
Culver home of Mrs. Virginia 
Kraning. Mrs. Zora Wilson of 
Kewanna and Mrs. Dorothy 
Smith of Rochester assisted the

COMPLETE LAWN 
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hostess. Election of officers was 
held with Leia Tomlinson elected 
president; Dorothy Smith, vice 
president; and Trella Feidner, 
secretary-treasurer. The noon 
picnic was enjoyed by 17 
members and their children.

Mr. and Mrs. Lincoln Burton 
and son spent the weekend in 
Dearborn, Michigan, as guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Wynn and 
son. While there, they took a boat 
ride on the Detroit River into 
Canada.

Joe Crabill, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
S. J. Crabill, is home with his 
parents after 25 months served 
overseas with the occupation 
troops in Germany.

FIFTY-FIVE YEARS AGO 
July 31, 1953

Justin A. Masteller, 62, a farmer 
residing east of Fulton, died 
Sunday afternoon at Woodlawn 
Hospital following a week’s 
illness. Survivors include a son, 
Robert, Rt. 2, Kewanna.

The Gault reunion was held at 
the Merritt Gault home at 
Fletchers Lake recently with 72 
present. Mrs. Ruth Stevens, vice 
president, conducted the business 
meeting. Officers elected for the 
coming year were Mrs. Stevens, 
president; Mrs. Bessie Kirk, vice 
president; Miss Donna Gault, 
secretary-treasurer; and Mrs. Lola 
Ellis, historian.

Nineteen Air Force ROTC 
cadets from Ball State Teachers 
College reported Sunday to 
Barksdale Air Force Base in 
Louisiana for a four-week 
training course. Included in this

group is Charles Denton, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Denton, Rt. 1, 
Kewanna.

Arthur Anderson and Herman 
McColley went to Potomac, 
Illinois, Sunday to accompany 
their wives and children back 
home after a few days visit in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Adams.

Vivian Montz is spending a 
week at the Christian Church 
Assembly camp at Pierson Mills 
near Wabash.

Sandra Hinderlider has returned 
home from a week’s outing at 
Rest-a-while Camp on Cedar 
Lake.

Ruth Ann and Sue Anderson 
held a slumber party Saturday 
evening at the Anderson cottage 
on Lake Bruce. A wiener roast 
and games were enjoyed by 
Janice Shidaker, Sara Hunter, 
Ruth Ann Reinholt, Judy Miller, 
Joan Engle, Patty Larkin and Joan 
Graffis.

FIFTY YEARS AGO 
July 31, 1958

Charles Lambert Felts, 78, well- 
known retired cigar store owner 
in Rochester and part owner of 
the Kibitzer here, died at 12:20 
a.m. Friday, July 25, at his home 
north of Rochester. He had been 
in ill health for two years. Mr. 
Felts made his home part of the 
time with his son, Dale, 
Kewanna.

A bridal shower was given 
Wednesday evening, July 23, in 
honor of Vivian Holcomb, bride­
elect of Larry Mersch, Rt. 1, 
Kewanna. The hostess was Mrs. 
Jerome Mersch. Miss Holcomb is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ervin Holcomb, Leiters Ford, 
formerly of Kewanna.

The Fulton County Rural Youth 
softball team won its regional 
tournament Sunday at Urbana 
defeating Wabash 7-5 in the 
championship game. Joe Good 
was the wining pitcher, giving up 
four hits. Dick Good and Richard 
Fields were the top hitters for the 
Fulton County squad.

Tom Livengood of Troop 51 
was among 47 scouts and 
scouters of the Three Rivers 
Council who were inducted into 
the Tipicon Lodge Order of the 
Arrow at Camp Buffalo last 
week. The Order of the Arrow is 
a national honorary society for 
campers.

The Grass Creek girl’s softball 
team, sporting a 10-3 record for 
1958, won a four-team tourney in 
Indianapolis recently. Members 
of the team are Jane Hizer, 
Martha Walgamuth, Sandy 
Young, Ann Hizer, Nancy 
Waddups, Martha Berkshire, 
Karen Sadler, Sue Metzger, Kay 
Sadler and Janet Hizer.

Theresa Miller of Kewanna is 
one of 22 nurses graduated from 
Indiana University School of 
Nursing this year named to the 
nursing staff at LU. Medical 
Center in Indianapolis. Miss 
Miller is on duty at the James 
Whitcomb Riley Hospital.

FORTY-FIVE YEARS AGO 
August 1, 1963

Sandra Turner, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Harvey Turner, is on an 
all-expense paid trip to the United 
Nations building in New York 
City. She won the award in a 
speech contest last March, 
sponsored by the Odd Fellows 
and Rebekah lodges.

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Cook of 
Richland Center celebrated their 
golden wedding anniversary 
Sunday in the home of their son 
and daughter-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Cook, Kewanna.

Richard Graffis, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Graffis, has been 
accepted at Taylor University, 
Upland, where he will be a 
freshman this fall.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Hinderlider have rented the 
Blanche Farr property on West 
Main Street and expect to move 
their soon.

THIRTY YEARS AGO 
August 3, 1978

Ron Mullet has been hired as 
assistant basketball coach and 
athletic director at Kewanna. He 
will also serve as varsity baseball 
and cross country coach.

Christy Wentzel, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Covert Wentzel, Rt. 
1, Kewanna, has been admitted to 
the clinical nursing program at 
Goshen College for the 1978-79 
school year.

The Lake Bruce Association 
held its annual meeting Sunday, 
July 30, for the purpose of 
electing officers and directors. 
Chosen to serve were J. A. Euler, 
president; Robert Ellis, vice 
president; Isabel Staggs, 
treasurer; and Ted Rosolowski, 
secretary. Three new directors 
were elected - Don Bayless, 
District 2; Frank Cannon, District 
3; and Sam Parsley, District 4. 
William Link was re-elected for 
another team as the representative 
from District 1.

TEN YEARS AGO 
July 30,1998

Local artist, Diane Tesler, has 
purchased the building at the 
corner of Main and Logan 
Streets, which began to collapse 
last fall. The collapsed portion 
has been removed and Doane 
Masonry of Delphi has begun 
repairing the remaining brick 
walls. Tesler, who divides her 
time between Kewanna and 
Alexandria, Virginia, plans to use 
the building for a studio. Her 
main concern for the present is to 
preserve the old, historic 
building.

Ramona Jones has opened a 
beauty shop in Kewanna at the 
north end of the building which 
houses the Kenmar Suds 
Laundromat on North Logan 
Street.

Ron Lockhart of Ronys’ Engine 
Service, Kewanna, was in 
Louisville, Kentucky, over the 
weekend where he attended the 
International Lawn and Garden 
Expo. While there, he 
successfully completed the 
Briggs & Stratton master service 
technician exam and is now a 
certified master service 
technician.

Helen Shadle, Kewanna’s oldest 
citizen, died shortly after 
midnight Wednesday, July 29. 
She was 103 years old. Helen was

Julie Birge and Babe Markley of 
here and Judy Markley and Mrs. 
Bill Gupton of Winamac visited 
recently with Florence Thomas at 
Hickory Creek of Winamac. 
Florence will be 98 in October 
and is doing fine.

Barb and Jon Gast were among 
those who enjoyed attending the 
spaghetti supper Saturday 
evening. The meal was hosted by 
the Pleasant Hill United 
Methodist Church. Afterward, the 
Gasts visited with Virgil and 
Ruby Fauser.

Wilma Wilson had visitors 
Saturday. Arriving in the evening 
for a chat and joining her for 
supper were her daughter and 
son- in- law, Mary Lou and Bill 
Foerg of Royal Center.

Tom and Linda Garner were 
among those who enjoyed 
attending the annual Culver 
Lions’ corn roast Saturday 
evening. Accompanying them for 
the event were their children and 
their families Amanda and Don 
Wassermann, Zach and 
Mackenzie of Valparaiso; Missy 
and Steve Young, Trey, Brianna, 
Kaylyn and Stevanna of Twelve 
Mile; and T.J. and Ashley Garner.

Mildred McColley had several 
callers Sunday, July 27. Joining 
her for a day- long visit were her 
sons and their families, Ron and 
Karon McColley of Frankfort and 
Steve and Ruth Ann McColley 
and Matt of Muncie; her 
grandson and his family, Rush 
and Mendi McColley and Allison 
of West Lafayette; and her 
granddaughter and her family, 
Ginger and Chris Batta and 
Carter of West Lafayette. In the 
afternoon, the family attended the 
McColley family reunion in 
Akron.

Jackie Heidenreich was a 
Sunday afternoon guest of her 
granddaughter and family, Jenny 
and Marcus Kay, Ellei and Ema. 
Also joining the Kay’s for a visit 
and cookout were Jenny’s 
parents, Vickie and Mike Molitor.

Earl, Mary and Linda Bangel 
and Rob and Barbara Staub were 
joined by the Bangels’ son and 
his family, Louis and Jean Bangel 
and Joyce of Winamac, for a visit 
Sunday afternoon.

Bruce and Renee Colley 
entertained guests from Illinois 
this past weekend. The occasion 
was the 5th annual get-together 
for the employees of Trainor 
Business Forms & Printing where 
Renee is employed. Their guests 
included Bill and Norma Morley 
of Buffalo Grove, Illinois, Pamela 
Benitez from Des Plaines, 
Illinois, and Pamela Geisler, who 
brought her mother, Joan Millard. 
The Morleys spent the night at 
the cabin they rented from Tom 
and Arlene Puralewski. They 
enjoyed their visit so much that 
they’re hoping to make a return 
trip.

born in the 19m century, lived 
through most of the 20th century, 
and had hoped to see the 21st 
century.
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Public Notice
NOTICE OF REAL
PROPERTY
TAX SALE
Fulton County Indiana
BEGINNING 10:00 am, 9/5/2008 
Commissioners Room TIME 
STATE OF INDIANA
Fulton County
Pursuant to the laws of the Indiana General 

Assembly, notice is hereby given that the 
following described property is listed for sale 
for delinquent taxes and/or special 
assessments. The county auditor and county 
treasurer will apply on or after 8/19/2008 for a 
court judgment against the tracts or real 
property for an amount that is not less than the 
amount set out below and for an order to sell 
the tracts or real property at public auction to 
the highest bidder, subject to the right of 
redemption. Any defense to the application 
for judgment must be filed with the Fulton 
County CIRCUIT Court before 8/19/2008. The 
court will set a date for a hearing at least 
seven (7) days before the advertised date of 
sale and the court will determine any defenses 
to the application for judgment at the hearing. 
Such sale will be held 9/5/2008 at the 
Commissioners Room and that sale will 
continue until all tracts and real property have 
been offered for sale.
Property will not be sold for an amount which 

is less than the sum of;
(A) the delinquent taxes and special 
assessments on each tract or item
of real property; and
(B) the taxes and special assessments 

on the real property that are due and 
payable in the year of the sale, 
whether or not they are delinquent; 
and

(C) all penalties due on the 
delinquencies, and

(D) an amount prescribed by the county 
auditor that equals the sum of:
(1) twenty-five($25) for postage 

and publication costs; and
(2) any other costs incurred by the 

county that are directly
attributable to the tax sale; and 

(E) any unpaid costs due, under
subsection (b), from a prior tax sale; 
and

The 2007 pay 2008 taxes have not been 
determined as of the date of this notice. The 
amounts listed for the minimum bids include 
an estimate of the entire 2007 pay 2008 taxes. 
The estimate was calculated by adding the 
2006 pay 2007 first and second installments 
together and then adding an additional five 
percent (5%). There may be additional taxes 
due resulting from actual amounts calculated 
for 2007 payable 2008. If the actual 2007 pay 
2008 taxes are calculated at the time of the 
sale, the minimum bids will be changed to 
reflect the actual amounts.
To remove a property from the tax sale the 

entire Amount for Judgment must be paid. No 
property listed below shall be sold if, at any 
time before the sale the Total Amount for 
Judgment is paid in full. If the real property is 
sold in the tax sale, the amount required to 
redeem such property will be 110% of the 
minimum bid for which the tract or real 
property was offered at the time of sale, as 
required by IC 6-1.1-24-5 if redeemed not 
more than six (6) months after the date of sale, 
or 115% of the minimum bid for which the tract 
or real property was offered at the time of 
sale, as required by IC 6-1. 1-24-5 if redeemed 
more than six (6) months after the date of 
sale, plus the amount by which the purchase 
price exceeds the minimum bid on the real 
property plus ten percent (10%) per annum on 
the amount by which the purchase price 
exceeds the minimum bid on the property. All 
taxes and special assessments upon the 
property paid by the purchaser subsequent to 
the sale, plus 10% per annum interest on those 
taxes and special assessments, will also be 
required to be paid to redeem such property. 
In addition, IC 6-1.1-25-2 (e) states the total 
amount required for redemption may include 
the following costs incurred and paid by the 
purchaser or the purchaser’s assignee or the 
county before redemption: (1) The attorney’s 
fees and cost of giving notice under IC 6-1.1- 
25-4.5. (2) The costs of title search or
examining and update the abstract of title for 
the tract or item of real property. The period 
of redemption shall expire one year from the 
date of sale for a property sold on the tax sale. 
The period of redemption may expire one 
hundred twenty (120) days from the date of 
sale for a property not sold in the tax sale if 
the county intends to pursue title to the parcel.
If the tract or item of real property is sold for 

an amount more than the minimum bid and the 
property is not redeemed, the owner of record 
of the property who is divested of ownership at 
the time the tax deed is issued may have a 
right to the tax sale surplus.
The Auditor and Treasurer specifically 

reserve the right to withhold from the sale any 
parcel which has been listed in error, or which 
otherwise become ineligible for sale either 
prior to 9/5/2008 or during the duration of the 
sale.
This notice of real property tax sale, and the 

tax sale itself are undertaken and will be 
conducted pursuant to the requirements of the 
laws of the State of Indiana which regulate the 
sale of land for delinquent taxes, pursuant to 
I.C. 6-1.1-24-1 et seq.
The Auditor’s Office does not warrant the 

accuracy of the key numbers or street 
addresses published herein and any 
misstatement in the key number or street 
address does not invalidate an otherwise valid 
sale.
Registration For Bidding
On the Tax Sale:
If you are interested in bidding on the tax sale 

you may register online at https://www.sri- 
taxsale.com/reqistration/.

Please arrive the morning of the tax sale 
early enough to receive your bid number. Do 
Not arrive too close to the start of the sale, you 
may not receive your number for the start of 
the auction.
Please bring your registration form and W9 

form with you the morning of the tax sale. You 
will be able to print these forms from the 
registration web site. You will need these 
forms to obtain your bid number.

Dated: 0 7/25/2008

2528001 25001-101007-00 $ 244.15
Sullivan William Sr & Kimberly Lot 73 Leiters 
Ford Overmyer Add 7462 STORM ST 
LEITERS FORD, IN
2528002 25001-101026-00 $ 100.92
Chumley Lyndee Nicole Rr Rt Way Adj Lot 15 
Kelseys23' W Side Lot 16 NE CORNER OF 
OLD SR 17 AND OLSON RD INTERSECTION

2528003 25001-102014-00 $ 134.73 Bedell 
James Lot 17 Blk 17 Tipp Shores Unit 3 ON 
HICKORY LANE W OF ASPEN LANE
2528004 25001-104000-00 $1,868.89
Wright Dawn Pt E1/2 Ne 7-31-1 2.8 A 11089 
W 675 N MONTEREY IN
2528005 25001-106018-00 $2,340.88 Jones 
Samuel F & Bobbi NW Cor SW NW 15-31-1; & 
NE Cor SE NE 16-31-1Total 3.48a per 
survey/deed 8998 WASHINGTON ST 
DELONG, IN
2528006 25001-106036-01 $139.10 Carter 
Blanche A Parcel In Ne Ne Of 26-31-1 1 a W 
OF 6955 W OLSON RD ROCHESTER IN
2528007 25001-107010-00 $ 201.84 Cook
Howard D Jr Lot 31 Blk 24 Tipp Shores Unit 4 
NE OF 9164 TROY DR ROCHESTER IN
2528008 25001-108032-10 $ 493.79 
Cummins Steven E & Geroldine K-1/2; & Crone 
Keith J & Jodie L-1/2 Lots 3 & 4 Indian Bridge 
Camp. 10469 W 700 N CULVER IN
2528009 25001-110006-00 $ 100.75 Jeffers 
Clovis & Mary S %dennis Jeffers E Mid Div Nw 
Nw 23-31-1. .07 A. SE OF 7934 W OLSON RD 
ROCHESTER IN
2528010 25001-110016-00 $ 242.80 Reilly
Bernard M Lot 5 & 6 Blk 5 Tipp ShoresUnit 1 
Less .05a W Line. E SIDE OF SR 17 ACROSS 
FROM 10058 W 650 N ROCHESTER IN
2528011 25001-112022-20 $ 570.21 Stone 
Leonard & Pamela Lots 24 & 25 Gambys. 
4596 WEST ST. LEITERS FORD, IN
2528012 25001-112100-00 $ 532.43 
Reichard Rodney A Fr Pt Sw Qtr 19-31-1 5a 
11532 W 400 N ROCHESTER IN
2528014 25001-113053-01 $ 109.09
Clingler William L & Michelle R Sw Cor Ne Se 
Ne 8-31-1 .41a.Changed Per Survey W OF 
6535 N 100 W CULVER IN
2528015 25001-113057-00 $ 231.89
Clingler William L & Michelle R Sw Ne Se Ne 
8-31-1 1.0a. 6535 N 100 W CULVER IN
2528017 25001-115005-00 $ 440.09 
Orbank Robert P & Julianna C/O Julianna
Orbank Lot 36 Blk 24 Tipp Shores Unit 4 
Troy Dr Tipp Shrs
2528018 25001-115009-00 $ 440.09 Lohse 
Lloyd H Lot 21 Blk 11 Tipp Shores Unit 2 
Walnut Ln
2528019 25001-115019-00 $ 187.34 
Roberts Claudette Etal Lot 15 Blk 11 Tipp 
Shores Unit 2 6051 CEDAR LN ROCHESTER 
IN
2528020 25001-116016-00 $ 373.84 Harner 
Lisa D Ne Ne Nw 5-31-1 .33aAka Tract 16. 
10561 W 800 N CULVER IN
2528021 25001-116018-00 $171.85 Dunn 
Darrell R Lot 18 Blk 11 Tipp Shores Unit 2 E 
OF 9658 W SECTION DR ROCHESTER IN
2528022 25001-116029-80 $317.82 Goble 
Michael L & Goble Phyllis Lots 6 & 7 Mahlers 
Ford Site. 6629 HAZEL RD MONTEREY IN
2528023 25001-117016-00 $1,317.78
Tinglof Phyllis A Quail Creek Lot 16. 7779 
QUAIL CREEK RUN CULVER IN
2528024 25001-117017-00 $1,102.22 
Crane Kevin L Quail Creek Lot 17. 7797 
QUAIL CREEK RUN CULVER IN
2528025 25001-118001-00 $ 420.14
Ramacci Vincent R & Josephine Lots 5, 6 & 7 
Blk 24Tippecanoe Shores Unit 4. W OF 9480 
LYNN DR ROCHESTER IN
2528026 25001-118012-50 $114.55 Cook 
Howard D Jr Tr N D E Ne 16-31-1 4.50aS Div 
Se 9-31-1 2.50a E OF 9480 LYNN DR. 
ROCHESTER IN
2528027 25001-118014-00 $ 440.34 Reed 
Clotee C/O Augustus Jones Lot 14 Marshland. 
CORNER OF WASHINGTON ST AND OLD SR 
17; E OF 9087 WASHINGTON ST DELONG IN
2528028 25001-118050-00 $ 440.09 Jones 
Sam & Jones Bobbi Lot 28 Blk 11 Tipp Shores 
Unit 2 6130 Walnut Ln
2528029 25001-119034-00 $ 395.45 
SHAUGHNESSY JEAN ETAL C/O NANCY 
RICHARDS LOT 1 BLK 6 TIPPECANOE SHORE 
UNIT 1 LAND W OF 9941 PINE DR 
ROCHESTER IN 46975
2528030 25001-119102-00 $ 526.16 
HARTLE STACY L & LISA Mid Div SW SW 1- 
31-1 2a 6876 W 700 N CULVER IN 46511
2528031 25001-119102-01 $ 271.83 
HARTLE STACY L & LISA SE CORNER SW SW 
1-31-1 3ac LAND E OF 6876 W 700 N 
CULVER IN 46511
2528032 25001-119104-57 $ 295.02
Sullivan William J Sr & Kimberly A Lot 72 
Leiters Ford. 7478 STORM ST LEITERS 
FORD, IN
2528033 25001-120026-01 $ 332.82 
Peterson Joseph C Lots 12 & 13 Blk 9 Tipp 
Shores Unit1 9880 ERIE DR ROCHESTER IN
2528034 25001-120030-00 $ 194.37 Troyer 
Lewis & Wilma Erie Rr Rt/Way 15-31-1 .81a. 
8946 WASHINGTON ST DELONG IN
2528035 25001-123003-00 $ 829.39 Papp 
Rickie A; Papp David L; Papp Margaret R; 
Daniel Ramona Lot 9 Sycamore Bend. 9196 
SYCAMORE BEND ROCHESTER IN
2528036 25001-123019-10 $ 414.67 Dunn 
Darrell R C/O Roger W. Nystrom Lot 17 Blk 11 
Unit 2 Tipp Shores 9658 SECTION DR 
ROCHESTER IN
2528037 25001-123034-30 $1,106.17 Cook 
Howard D Jr Lots 28, 29, & 30 Tippecanoe 
ShoresBlock 24 Unit 4 9164 TROY DR 
ROCHESTER IN
2528038 25001-123034-57 $ 190.95 Lewis 
Raymond D & Doris K Lot 37 Blk 24 Tipp 
Shores Unit 4 ACROSS FROM 9164 TROY DR 
ROCHESTER IN
2528039 25001-123048-00 $85,778.05 
West Holding Company Sw Sw 16-31-1 36.2a 
9997 W 525 N ROCHESTER IN
2528040 25001-179020-00 $1,167.71 
Chumley Lyndee Nicole Marshland Lot 15 & 
23' W Side Lot 1 5675 N 900 W DELONG IN
2528041 25002-101006-00 $ 309.98 Jones 
Samuel F & Jones Bobbi J Sec 1 Lots 187 & 
190 Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. First 
St King Lk
2528042 25002-102002-00 $ 310.41 Ousley 
Tim Sec P Lots 50 Thru 61 Kings Lake 
Resort. Center St Kings Lk
2528043 25002-102035-00 $ 288.19 
Boatright Lillard & King Minne C/O Marvin 
Boatright Sec B Lots 447 & 448 Kings Lake 
Resort. Calumet St Kings Lk
2528044 25002-102044-37 $ 109.09 Boyce 
Clifford V Jr Sec 1 Lots 229 Thru 232Edmond 
Resort Properties. W SIDE OF WILSON AVE 
S OF 600 N

2528045 25002-102049-00 $389.98 Clinger 
Darlina & Clinger Shawine Sec C Lot 110 & 
111 Kings Lake Resort Illinois St Kings Lk
2528046 25002-102067-00 $ 106.36 Ousley 
Tim Sec D Lots 246, 247 & 248Kings Lake 
Resort. N OF 5013 OLD SR 17 ROCHESTER 
IN
2528047 25002-102069-00 $ 378.48 Ousley 
Tim Sec G Lots 106 Thru 115 Kings Lake 
Resort. Columbia St Kings Lk
2528048 25002-102076-00 $405.53 Clinger
Darlina & Clinger Shawine Sec C Lots 124 & 
125 Kings Lake Resort, also RR adj to lots
III St Kings Lk
2528049 25002-102079-15 $ 100.92 Ward 
Earl Jr Lots 128 & 129 Sec A Kings 
LakeResort. S SIDE INDIANA ST W OF SR 17
2528050 25002-102081-37 $ 620.74 Brown 
James C/O Bertha & Ernest Teague Sec A 
Lots 328 Thru 331 Kings Lake Resort.
Calumet St King Lake
2528051 25002-102089-00 $ 355.03 
Rhodes Samuel & Charlotte C/O Myles Todd
Sec H Lots 5 Thru 8 Also 52 Thru 55 Kings 
Lake Resort. Columbia St King Lake
2528052 25002-102109-00 $ 924.87 Butler
Chester & Earline Sec B Lots 501 & 502Kings 
LakeResort. 9314 W 525 N ROCHESTER IN
2528053 25002-102112-00 $ 123.99 Buxton 
Willard K C/O Elaine Dinwiddie Sec B Lots
465,466 & 467 Kings Lk S SIDE CALUMET ST 
W OF WABASH ST
2528054 25002-102113-00 $ 569.41 Lucas
Charles Lots 68 & 69 Sec A Kings Lake 
Resort. Ind St Kings Lk
2528055 25002-103006-00 $ 120.02
Campbell Charles & Georgia Sec Q Lots 82 
Thru 87Kings Lake Resort. N SIDE MIDDLE 
ST W OF OLD SR 17
2528056 25002-103023-00 $389.98 Clinger 
Darlina & Clinger Shawine Sec C Lots 106 & 
107 Kings Lake III St Kings Lk
2528057 25002-103026-00 $124.05 Clinger 
Darlina Kings Lake Sec C Lots 11, 12 & 13 N 
SIDE OF INDIANA ST. W OF STATE ST
2528058 25002-103040-00 $ 567.25 Clark 
Mildred Sec F Lot 18 Kings Lake Resort. 
Colorado St Kings Lk
2528059 25002-103041-00 $ 626.72 Clark 
Mildred Sec X Lots 20 Thru 23 Kings Lake 
Resort. Penn St Kings Lk
2528060 25002-103064-00 $626.72 Comer 
Winnell Etal C/O Davie Winnell Sec A Lots 64 
Thru 67 Kings Lake Resort. Ind St Kings Lk 
2528061 25002-103067-00 $ 109.09 
Conway Willie & Annie B Sec 2 Lots 103 & 
119Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. S SIDE 
OF CEDAR ST EOF SR 17
2528062 25002-103072-00 $ 567.25 
Cowherd Elizabeth C/O Jim Hammond Sec A 
Lots 381 & 382 Kings Lake Resort. St Rd 
17
2528063 25002-103075-53 $ 657.01
Crawford Elbert M Jr & Delores Sec P Lots 67 
Thru 71 Kings Lake Resort. Center St 
Kings Lk
2528064 25002-103083-00 $ 556.21
Bradford Tommy & Mary Sec F Lots 65 Thru 
76 Kings Lake Resort. Drexel King Lake
2528065 25002-103085-00 $ 301.35 
Culberson Harold W & Lorene D Sec B Lot 
500 Kings Lake Resort. 525 N
2528066 25002-104002-00 $ 641.83
Daniels George D & Eula C Sec 1 Lots 80, 81 
& 104 Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. 
1000 W
2528067 25002-104005-00 $ 320.63 Darby 
Jefferson & Josephine Sec 2 Lots 33 & 
47Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. N SIDE OF 
BIRCH ST EOF SR 17
2528068 25002-104007-50 $ 407.46 Davis 
Carrie B Sec A Lots 56, 57 & 58 Kings Lake 
Resort. Indiana St Kings Lk
2528069 25002-104007-55 $ 407.46 Davis 
Carrie B Sec B Lots 337, 338 & 339 Kings 
Lake Resort. Prarie Kings Lake
2528070 25002-104031-00 $117.28 Devera 
Adele K Sec 1 Lots 342 Thru 347Edmond 
Resort Properties. W SIDE OF ROBERTS AVE 
N OF MCCALL ST
2528071 25002-104032-00 $ 123.99 Dial 
Betty & Day Angelo Sec A Lots 248, 249 & 
250Kings Lake SW CORNER OF PRAIRIE ST 
AND SR 17 INTERSECTION
2528072 25002-104051-00 $ 136.38 Dixon 
Jimmie Lee & Margie Ree C/O Myles Joe & 
Alice Sec 1 Lots 263 Thru 272Edmond Resort 
Properties. NW CORNER OF MCCALL ST 
AND WILSON AVE INTERSECTION
2528073 25002-104053-00 $ 117.28 
Dobbins Grattin Eloise & Etal C/O Davis 
Grattin Mrs Sec F Lots 50, 56, 57, 104, 105 & 
106Kings Lake Resort. N SIDE OF MONTANA 
ST W OF COLORADO ST
2528074 25002-104054-00 $ 551.72 
Donaldson Steven Etal Sec E Lots 231 Thru 
234 Kings Lake Resort. State St
2528075 25002-104055-00 $ 581.04 Doss 
Preston Y Sec H Lots 1 & 2 Kings Lake 
Resort. Columbia St Kings Lk
2528077 25002-105004-00 $ 103.63 
Edwards Arneva Sec D Lots 307, 308 & 
309Kings Lake Resort. S SIDE OF ELLIS E OF 
OLD SR 17
2528078 25002-105009-00 $ 407.46 
Edwards Joseph & Daniel Sec 3 Lots 106 & 
107 Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. Maple 
St Kings Lake
2528079 25002-105010-00 $ 178.93 
Edwards Arneva Sec B Lots 211 Thru 216 
Kings Lake Resort 5419 WABASH ST 
ROCHESTER IN
2528080 25002-105019-10 $ 567.25 Ewing 
Thomas Leroy Sec R Lot 11 Kings Lake 
Resort Middle St Kings Lk

2528081 25002-105020-00 $ 109.09 Jones
Robert L Jr Kings Lake Mont Ld Sec 1 Lots 86 
&99 N SIDE CEDAR ST W OF MAPLE ST
2528082 25002-105021-00 $ 431.03 Jones 
Robert L Jr Sec 2 Lot 129 Kings Lake Mont 
LandDev Sec 2 Lot 140 Kings Lake MontLand 
Dev 9602 ELM ST ROCHESTER IN
2528083 25002-105022-00 $ 656.58 Ezzell 
Melvin A & Walter G Sec B Lot 269 Thru 274 
Kings Lake Resort. Prarie Kings Lake
2528084 25002-106009-00 $611.49 Forster 
Genie C/O Long Genie Sec 1 Lots 168 Thru 
171 Edmond Resort Properties. Rear 600 N
2528085 25002-106016-00 $130.91 Ousley 
Tim Sec E Lots 49 Thru 56Kings Lake Resort. 
S OF 9211 W 525 N ROCHESTER IN

2528086 25002-107038-00 $ 556.58 Grady 
Howard W & Ida N Sec B Lots 27 & 28 
Kings Lake Resort. Ill St Kings Lk
2528087 25002-107042-00 $ 720.72 Gray 
Ulicious Etal C/O Marvin Gray Sec A Lots 347 
Thru 351 Kings Lake Resort. Calumet St 
Kings Lk
2528088 25002-107043-00 $ 648.73 Gray 
Ulicious I Etal C/O Marvin Gray Sec B Lots 
480 & 481 Kings Lake Resort. Calumet St 
Kings Lk
2528089 25002-107044-00 $ 659.47 Gray 
Ulicious Etal C/O Marvin Gray Sec D Lots 34
& 35 Kings Lake Resort. 525 N
2528090 25002-107047-11 $2,693.50
Cummings Ronald & Arnee Sec D Lots 234 
thru 245Kings Lake 5013 OLD US 17 
ROCHESTER IN
2528091 25002-107059-00 $641.83 Griffin 
Glenn & Ollie Sec 3 Lots 396 Thru 400 
Edmond Resort Properties. Johnson Ave 
Edmond R
2528092 25002-107061-00 $ 100.92 Griffin 
Lawrence Sec M Lots 34 & 35Kings Lake 
Resort. W OF 9413 OKLAHOMA ST 
ROCHESTER IN
2528093 25002-107063-00 $ 100.92
Sylvester Joseph W Sec B Lots 222 & 
223Kings Lake Resort. W OF 5419 WABASH 
ST ROCHESTER IN
2528094 25002-108000-56 $ 291.91 Hall 
Essie Mae Sec Q Lots 76 Thru 81 Kings Lake 
Resort. N SIDE OF MIDDLE ST W OF OLD SR 
17
2528095 25002-108000-76 $ 652.83 Hall 
James R Sr & Hortense E Sec U Lots 6 Thru 
10 Kings Lake Resort. Angie St Kings Lk
2528096 25002-108021-00 $ 567.98 Harris 
George & Jennie Sec A Lots 122 & 123 
Kings Lake Resort. Indiana St Kings Lk
2528097 25002-108026-00 $ 581.04 Harris 
Pearl H Sec C Lots 279 & 280 Kings Lake 
Resort also RR adj to lots Prairie Kings Lk
2528099 25002-108042-00 $389.98 Clinger 
Darlina & Clinger Shawine Sec C Lots 180 & 
181 Kings Lake Res Ind St Kings Lk
2528100 25002-108063-00 $ 112.69 Hill 
Robert & Hazel C/O Etolia Woodson Me Carthy 
Sec E Lots 212 & 213Kings Lake Resort. N 
SIDE OF STATE ST N OF PARKING AREA
2528101 25002-108064-00 $ 343.70 
Brumsfield Ernest & Paris Sec K Lots 19 Thru
2 5 Kings Lake Resort. Virgina St
2528102 25002-109001-00 $ 567.25 Ivey 
Henry C/O Rainer & Evelyn Zawadski Sec B 
Lot 441 Kings Lake Resort. Calumet St
2528103 25002-110010-00 $ 389.74 
Jackson George & Henrietta Sec 3 Lots 466, 
467 & 468 Edmond Resort Properties. 
1000 W
2528104 25002-110030-00 $ 100.75 
Johnson Beryl R C/O Richard Earp Edmond 
Resort Sec 1 Lots 350 & 351 W SIDE OF 
ROBERTS AVE N OF MCCALL ST

2528105 25002-110038-00 $ 106.36
Johnson Josephine Etal Sec A Lots 162, 163 
& 164Kings Lake Resort; Also Vacated 
roadway adj lots N SIDE OF PRAIRIE ST. 
BETWEEN SR 17 AND MICHIGAN ST
2528106 25002-110047-00 $468.70 Clinger 
Darlina & Clinger Shawine Sec C Lots 117 - 
123 Kings Lake Res III St Kings Lk
2528108 25002-110050-00 $620.74 Jones 
Augustus S & Sarah Sec B Lots 21 Thru 24 
Kings Lake Resort. Ill St Kings Lk
2528109 25002-111012-00 $ 100.92 Keno 
Clarence E C/O Mavis E Keno Sec E Lots 126 
& 127Kings Lake Resort. N SIDE OF E ELLIS 
E OF STATE ST
2528110 25002-111014-00 $764.29 Kilgore 
Shirley F Annabelle Sec 2 Lots 220 & 226 
Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. 0 475 N
2528111 25002-111021-00 $ 850.06 King 
Louis R & Lorene Sec R Lot 85 Thru 88 Kings 
Lake Resort Sec R Lots 80, 81 & 82 Kings 
Lake Resort 4558 N Old St Rd 17
2528112 25002-111024-00 $ 332.36 Jones 
Samuel F & Jones Bobbi J Sec A Lots 184 
Thru 189 Kings Lake Resort. Prairie Kings 
Lk
2528113 25002-112003-00 $ 591.54 Lakes 
Julius Sr & Julia & Bailes Barbara Sec 2 Lots 
195 & 210 Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. 
First St Kings Lk
2528114 25002-112009-50 $1,777.65
Givens Anna & Me Elroy Dorothy Sec C Lots 
258, 334 & 335 Kings Lake Resort. 
Calumet St Kings Lk
2528115 25002-112015-50 $ 100.75 Rose 
James L Jr Sec C Lot 51 Kings Lake Resort. 
E SIDE OF STATE ST N OF 5437 STATE ST 
ROCHESTER IN
2528116 25002-112021-00 $567.98 Liddell 
Fulton & Alice Sec D Lots 325 & 326 Kings 
Lake Resort. Ellis Kings Lk
2528117 25002-112026-00 $ 122.74 Lively 
Angela Sec H Lots 104 Thru HOKings Lake 
Resort. E OF 9320 OHIO ST ROCHESTER IN
2528118 25002-112029-00 $171.85 Lomax 
Dorothy Sec O Lots 62 Thru 77Kings Lake 
Resort. E OF 4719 SR 17 ROCHESTER IN
2528119 25002-112030-00 $114.55 Lomax 
Lea & Dorothy C/O Ward James & Dorothy 
Sec F Lots 113 Thru 116Kings Lake Resort. S 
CORNER OF COLORADO ST AND MONTANA 
ST
2528120 25002-113001-00 $ 429.20 Basile 
Adam % Smith Rayfield & Della Sec A Lots 
136 Thru 139 Kings Lk Indiana St Kings Lk
2528121 25002-113004-00 $ 103.63 Maclin 
Floyd C & Edwina C C/O Richard Earp Sec 1 
Lots 365, 366 & 367Edmond Resort 
Properties. NE CORNER OF MCCALL ST AND 
PETTIGREW AVE INTERSECTION

2528122 25002-113005-00 $ 112.69 Clark 
Shemiah & Mary Sec M Lots 36 & 37Kings 
Lake Resort. SW CORNER OF VERMONT ST 
AND OKLAHOMA ST INTERSECTION
2528123 25002-113026-00 $ 702.95 
Maxwell Edward Sec 1 Lots 33 Thru 36 Less 
N 21' Edmond Resort Properties. First St 
Kings Lk
2528124 25002-113027-00 $ 581.04 Mayes 
Jesse & Juanita Sec 1 Lot 205 Kings Lake 
Monterey Land Dev. First St Kings Lk
2528125 25002-113035-00 $ 573.23 
Milhouse Horace & Virginia C/O Wildwood 
Corp Sec 2 Lots 500 & 501 Edmond Resort 
Properties.
2528126 25002-113040-00 $ 144.57 Miller 
Lionel H & Miller Armentha P; Jackson Mae L 
Sec 1 Lots 229 & 244Kings Lake Monterey 
LandDev. N SIDE 475N E OF 1000 W
2528127 25002-113043-00 $ 637.97 Miller

Zettie Sec 2 Lots 198 & 207 Kings Lake 
Monterey Land Dev. First St Kings Lk
2528128 25002-113049-00 $ 396.13
Mitchell Mabel M Sec V Lots 51 Thru 59 Sec 
V Lots 64 Thru 68 Kings Lake Resort East 
Ohio St Kings Lk
2528129 25002-113066-00 $ 125.48 Moore 
Sammie E & Alice Sec L Lots 5 Thru 11 Kings 
Lake Resort. S SIDE OF CALIFORNIA ST W 
OF PENN ST
2528130 25002-113071-00 $401.37 Moran 
Sarah D & Davis Willria Sec K Lots 85 Thru 88 
Kings Lake Resort. California St Kings Lk
2528131 25002-113089-86 $141.84 Myles 
Joseph & Alice Sec 1 Lots 92 Thru 99Sec 1 
Lots 100 & 101 Edmond Resort Properties N 
OF 5750 N 1000 W ROCHESTER IN
2528132 25002-114008-00 $ 407.46 
Newbill Adell & Dannie C/O Charone Logan 
Sec C Lots 225, 226 & 227 Kings Lake 
Resort. Prairie Kings Lk
2528133 25002-115001-00 $ 573.23 Oates 
Fred Sec F Lots 4 & 5 Kings Lake Resort. 
Penn St Kings Lk
2528134 25002-115012-00 $117.28 White 
Robert Allan Sec 1 Lots 87 Thru 91 Edmond 
Resort 5750 N 1000 W ROCHESTER IN
2528135 25002-116003-00 $117.28 Parks 
Ruth Daniels Etal Sec 2 Lots 217, 218, 228 &
229Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. E OF 
9730 W 475 N ROCHESTER IN
2528136 25002-116016-00 $ 418.32
Perkins John W & Sue Sec 3 Lots 29 & 30 
Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. Oak St Kings 
Lk
2528137 25002-116026-00 $389.98 Clinger 
Darlina Sec C Lots 48 & 49 Kings Lake 
Resort. State St
2528138 25002-116027-01 $1,566.04 
Brumfield Earnest Jr Sec J Lots 67 Thru 
85Kings Lake Resort 9420 VIRGINIA ST 
ROCHESTER IN
2528139 25002-116029-00 $141.84 Porter 
Cleo C & Franklin Evelyn C/O Parker Cleo 
Porter Sec F Lots 33 Thru 37 Kings Lake 
Resort N SIDE OF COLORADO ST W OF 
SHORT ST
2528140 25002-118003-00 $ 573.23 
Radford Horace & Marcella C/O Woods 
Marcella Sec B Lots 54 & 55 Kings Lake 
Resort. Illinois St Kings Lk
2528141 25002-118019-00 $608.75 Reese 
Delora Sec 2 Lots 173 & 190 Kings Lake 
Monterey Land Dev. First St Kings Lk
2528142 25002-119011-20 $ 567.98 
Scurlock Harvey C/O Ewing Thomas Sec B 
Lots 3 & 4 Kings Lake Resort. Illinois St
2528143 25002-119025-50 $122.74 Strong 
Carlene & Slaughter T F Lots 177 Thru 183 
Edmond Resort PropSec 1 W OF 5750 N 1000 
W ROCHESTER IN
2528144 25002-119027-00 $117.28 Smith 
Berniece Sec P Lots 72 Thru 76Kings Lake 
Resort. N SIDE OF CENTER ST W OF OLD SR 
17
2528145 25002-119028-00 $ 100.92 Smith 
Berniece Sec R Lots 13 & 14Kings Lake 
Resort. N OF 4558 N OLD SR 17 
ROCHESTER IN
2528146 25002-119032-00 $111.83 Smith 
John R Sec C Lots 273 Thru 276Kings Lake 
Resort. S SIDE PRAIRIE ST W OF THE 
RAILROAD
2528147 25002-119046-00 $355.03 Wilson 
Rosettie Sec K Lots 7 Thru 14 Kings Lake 
Resort. Oakwood St
2528148 25002-119053-00 $ 106.36 
Stanton Ellsworth lii & Ruth C/O Levy Ruth 
Sec B Lots 544, 545 & 546Kings Lake Resort. 
W OF 9602 W 525N ROCHESTER IN
2528149 25002-119053-85 $941.69 Smith 
Rayfield E & Della M %David M Zook Bet Lots 
516 & 517 128' X 177' E Of Lot 517 Sec B 
Kings Lake 16-31-1 .52a 9464 W 525 North
2528150 25002-119074-75 $687.46 Strong 
Juanita F Lots 172, 173, 188 Thru 192 
Edmond Resort Prop Sec 1 Rear 600 N
2528151 25002-120006-00 $ 109.09 Taylor 
Gilbert Leon Sec 2 Lots 84 & 92Kings Lake 
Monterey Land Dev. W OF 9404 OLD SR 17 
ROCHESTER IN
2528152 25002-120013-00 $ 444.95
Teague James % David M Zook Sec B Lots 43 
Thru 47 Kings Lake Resort. Illinois St
2528153 25002-120017-00 $442.48 Terry 
Louise %David M Zook Sec B Lots 224 Thru 
228 Kings Lake Resort. Indiana St
2528154 25002-120019-00 $418.43 Theus 
George Etal Sec 1 Lots 37 & 48 Kings Lake 
Monterey Land Dev. Birch St
2528155 25002-120022-00 $ 326.68 Jones 
Samuel F & Jones Bobbi J Sec B Lots 376 
Thru 380 Kings Lake Resort. Federal St
2528156 25002-120035-00 $ 620.74 
Morgan Vincent Sec B Lots 368, 369, 369a & 
370 Kings Lake Resort Oakwood St
2528158 25002-120042-00 $2,192.94 
Holifield Joseph H & Holifield Johnny P Sec E 
Lots 30 Thru 35Kings Lake Resort, also RR adj 
to lots 9139 W 525 N ROCHESTER IN
2528159 25002-122005-00 $ 567.25
Vaughn Frederick 0 & Maxine L C/O Thomas 
Maxine Mrs Sec C Lot 290 Kings Lake Resort 
Calumet St
2528160 25002-120050-00 $ 111.83 Tucker 
Jennie Sec 2 Lots 502 Thru 505Edmond 
Resort Properties. S OF 5734 N 1000 W 
ROCHESTER IN
2528161 25002-121004-00 $ 261.90 
Brumfield Ernest & Paris Sec J 94 Thru 105 
Kings Lk Resort N SIDE OF VIRGINIA ST 
ACROSS FROM 9369 VIRGINIA ST
2528163 25002-122003-00 $ 100.92 Vann 
Margaret L & Jackson Frances & Jackson 
Darrin Sec D Lots 144 & 145Kings Lake 
Resort. W OF 9583 OAKWOOD ST 
ROCHESTER IN
2528165 25002-123001-00 $100.92 Walker 
Alberta CIO Smith Chrysolia E Sec B Lots 482 
& 483Kings Lake Resort. N OF 9512 W 525 N 
ROCHESTER IN
2528166 25002-123064-00 $ 114.55 
Williams Launce & Ollie Sec 1 Lots 64, 73, 88 
& 97Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. NE 
CORNER OF MAPLE ST AND CEDAR ST 
INTERSECTION
2528167 25002-123067-00 $ 549.98 Smith 
Terri Marie Woods Etal Sec 2 Lots 8, 9, 18 & 
19Kings Lake Monterey Land Dev. S SIDE OF 
ASH ST. W OF OLD SR 17
2528169 25002-123069-00 $1,164.50 Smith 
Terri Marie Woods Etal Sec U Lots 11 Thru 59 
Kings Lake Resort Angle St
2528170 25002-123076-00 $ 643.26
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Williams Silas & Flordia Mae Sec 1 Lots 113, 
120, 137 & 144 Kings Lake Monterey Land 
Dev. Cedar St
2528171 25002-123077-00 $ 100.92 
Williams Susie Sec 2 Lots 419 & 420Edmond 
Resort Properties. S OF 5730 N 1000 W 
ROCHESTER IN
2528172 25002-123092-00 $114.55 Ward 
Earl Jr Sec A Lots 134 & 135 Kings Lake 
Resort S SIDE OF INDIANA ST W OF SR 17
2528173 25002-123110-00 $ 144.57 
Waterford Harry Sec 2 Lots 221 & 225Kings 
Lake Monterey Land Dev. N SIDE OF 475 N W 
OF FIR ST
2528174 25002-123112-00 $ 117.28 
Wolford Ino L C/O Richard Earp Sec 1 Lots 
368-373Edmond Resorts Prop. E SIDE OF 
PETTIGREW AVE N OF MCCALL ST
2528175 25002-123113-00 $ 100.92 
Wolford Lydia Ann C/O Eugene Turner Sec A 
Lots 204 & 205Kings Lake Resort. N SIDE OF 
PRAIRIE ST E OF 1000 W
2528176 25002-123122-00 $ 123.99 
Woodson Etolia D Sec M Lots 85, 86 & 
87Kings Lake Resort. N OF GEORGIA ST W 
OF PENN ST
2528177 25002-123128-00 $ 332.38 Jones 
Samuel F & Jones Bobbi J Sec R Lots 23 Thru 
28 Kings Lake Resort. Middle St
2528178 25002-123129-00 $405.37 Jones 
Samuel F & Jones Bobbi J Sec Q Lots 72 Thru 
75Kings Lake Resort. N SIDE OF MIDDLE ST 
W OF OLD SR 17
2528181 25002-127001-50 $ 109.09 Me 
Clane J D Jr Lots 14 & 15 Kings Lake 
MontereyLand Dev Sec 1 SW CORNER OF SR 
17 AND ASH ST INTERSECTION
2528182 25002-179004-00 $ 620.74 
Morgan Vincent Lots 234 Thru 237 Sec B 
Kings Lake Resort. Prairie
2528183 25003-101003-00 $3,368.77 Wise 
Micheal L E 1/2 Sw 2-30-4. 77.84a 10286 E 
100 N AKRON IN
2528184 25003-103011-10 $1,163.49 
Mikesell Tim Lot 28 Rooney's 62 SCOTT ST 
ROCHESTER IN
2528185 25003-103012-00 $ 280.25 
Mikesell Tim Lot 25 Rooney's NE CORNER 
OF 650 E AND C ST INTERSECTION
2528186 25003-103020-00 $2,755.80
Stapleton Wesley & Debra Boone Park Lots 1 
&18b 1221 LAKESHORE DR AKRON IN
2528187 25003-103030-00 $1,593.63 Day 
Lorri D & Runyon Roger I Sw C Sw 1/4 Nw 1/4 
20-30-5. 2.75ANwCSw. 13008 E STATE RD 
114 AKRON IN
2528188 25003-103039-00 $2,114.25 Day 
Dorothy Pt S D W 1/2 Ne,19-30-5 .70 1383 
Village Lane
2528189 25003-103068-00 $ 145.08 Floyd 
Shirley A Sm Fr Pt Of Sw Ne 19-30-5 .62a 
1376 S 1275 E AKRON IN
2528190 25003-104016-16 $1,140.96 
Shriver Darrell R; Shriver Kristin S; Shriver 
MiloR Pt Sw Ne 19-30-5 .68a & Ne Nw Se19- 
30-5 .84a Also Easement 12655 E STATE RD 
114 AKRON IN
2528191 25003-104200-00 $ 109.00 Day 
Tim & Lorri Nw Cor Nw D Sw 30-30-5 .18a S 
OF 13008 E STATE RD 114 AKRON IN
2528192 25003-105008-57 $1,266.02
Eltenwood Gary B & Karen S N1/2 & S1/2 Ne 
1-30-4 6.726a 1440 N 1200 E AKRON IN
2528194 25003-107032-10 $ 950.71 
Grossman Ronald & Patricia M D Sw 12-30-4 
24.00a E OF 10971 E 50 N AKRON IN
2528195 25003-107032-11 $2,182.62 
Grossman Ronald & Patricia Ne Div Se 11-30- 
4. 26.00a 10971 E 50 N AKRON IN
2528196 25003-107113-00 $2,533.41 Igo 
Bruce L & Shannon W Of Rd S Div Nw Se 24- 
30-4 1.a 1722 S ST RD 19 AKRON IN
2528197 25003-108005-01 $ 446.76 
Hemingway Joshua B Boone Park Lot 18a. 
ACROSS FROM 1170 S LAKESHORE DR 
AKRON IN
2528198 25003-108024-00 $3,965.83
Harter Joseph E Jr M D (s Of 14) W 1/2 Ne 22- 
30-4 12.987a 9553 E ST RD 14 AKRON IN
2528199 25003-108064-00 $1,105.87 
Fetrow Eleanor M E Mid Div W1/2 Sw 20-30-5 
2.03a. 13181 E ST RD 114 AKRON IN
2528200 25003-111024-00 $1,480.77 
Rogers Richard & Pamela J Nw Se 24-30-4 
10aBldg Lease To 003-17000-00 
HoffmanEasement to town of Akron 1690 ST 
RD 19 S AKRON IN
2528201 25003-112020-00 $446.00 Arnett 
Robert & Roller Brian Lot 4 New Harrisburg - 
Nelsons. 3858 S 1600 E SILVER LAKE IN
2528202 25003-113019-00 $1,130.14 Jones 
Donald R & Dora R & Furnivall Kathryn Sarah 
Rose 2O'X100'ln Mid Div E1 /2 Sw .046a,13-30- 
4 150'X100' E Side Se Sw. .34a 836 S ST RD 
19 AKRON IN
2528203 25003-113048-00 $ 965.54 
Rensberger Brian & Kelley Se Nw 12-30-4. 
9.715 A 11224E50N AKRON IN
2528204 25003-116001-00 $ 572.50 
Steinberger Freda F Nw C Nw 1/4 Se 29-30-5. 
.34 A. 1375 East
2528205 25003-116062-00 $944.35 Lewis 
Craig T & Laura L Mid E1/2 Se 25-30-4 5.97a 
2651 S ST RD 19 AKRON IN
2528206 25003-118024-18 $2,756.65 Reed 
George li & Pam N D Nw Sw 15-30-4. 20 A 
505 S 900 E AKRON IN
2528207 25003-118030-00 $343.19 Nelson 
Chad E & Jenny L Tr In S Div Ne Nw 12-30-4. 
2 A 732 N SR 19 AKRON IN
2528208 25003-119015-55 $1,091.19 
Butler Becky Jo & Golladay Cynthia Lu Pt Sw 
Cor Sw 24-30-4 .30aAka Lot 11 Savatowla Hts 
1693 TOWN LAKE RD AKRON, IN
2528209 25003-119040-00 $2,712.03 
Shambaugh Fred & Diane W D Ne Nw 20-30- 
5. 5 A. 1041 S 1325 E AKRON IN
2528210 25003-119101-00 $ 228.79 Huse 
Barbaras Lots 1, 2, & 3 Athens Grant 6351 
ST RD 14 E ROCHESTER IN
2528211 25003-119159-00 $2,310.28 
Shoemaker Robert E Revocable Trust Mid Div 
W1/2 NW SE 32-30-4 2.94aLe to & trustee- 
Robert E ShoemakerContract to Michael 
Howard & Cindy Lou Biltz 7608 E 375 S 
AKRON IN
2528212 25003-121000-00 $1,020.50 
Howard Ranzel & Jaime W Div M Pt E1/2 Sw 
1/4 N Of Creek32-30-4 2.327a Also Easement 
7321 E 375 S AKRON IN

2528214 25004-102004-50 $2,004.36
Bailey Eleanor M Lot 122 Whitt. 317 
MISHAWAKA ST AKRON IN
2528215 25004-102008-00 $3,237.30
Sparks Jewel Lot 32 Citizen'S 2nd Add. 410 
North Maple Street
2528216 25004-102040-00 $ 562.90
Burnett Arthur & Ella C/O Jean Smith Lot 27 
Railway Add E OF 702 E MAIN ST AKRON IN 
2528217 25004-102040-01 $ 913.40
Burnett Arthur & Ella C/O Jean Smith Lot 50
Railway Add 501 S PINE ST AKRON IN
2528218 25004-103016-16 $ 369.86
Coughenour Anna Lot 52 Railway Add. 720 
E MAIN ST AKRON IN
2528219 25004-108036-00 $ 222.93 Gast
Karl D Lot 195 Slaybaugh'S. 517 E 
ROCHESTER ST AKRON IN
2528221 25004-118003-00 $1,000.73 Hall
Lloyd Lot 231 A Hoffman'S AddLot 230 A 
Hoffman'S Add 314 S PINE ST AKRON IN
2528222 25004-118010-01 $4,212.74
Harger Phillip L Lots 208 & 209 Hoffman'S 
318 S CHERRY ST AKRON IN
2528223 25004-119019-00 $444.65 Shriver 
Beverly M Lot 53 Railway 715 E MAIN ST 
AKRON IN
2528224 25004-127000-76 $3,192.22
Fisher Marcia L Less 37 Ft E Side Lot 68 O 
P20 Ft E Side Lot 69 O P 201 E ROCHESTER 
ST AKRON IN
2528225 25005-101010-00 $ 145.65 Nells
Daniel & Crystal Pt W 1/2 Ne Frl 3-29-2. .27 
A. S SIDE OF 400 SW OF 200 W
2528226 25005-102050-00 $ 822.54
Brumfiel Max E & Elizabeth L Lot 59 Shaffers 
Pleasant View 2nd 6342 N LAKESHORE DR 
AKRON IN
2528227 25005-104002-00 $1,796.58
Minglin Bryan L & Kelly R Lot 2 Ira C & Myrtle 
B Smith AddTo Lake Nyona N OF 3070 SE 
LAKESHORE DR MACY
2528228 25005-104017-00 $1,175.86 Dice
James R & Vickie S W Div S 1/2 Se 39 Mrl. .56 
A 858 W 700 S ROCHESTER IN
2528229 25005-106005-12 $171.87 Davis
Cecil; Woodward Frankie Lot 2 Captin El 
Dorado Add 16-29-3 ACROSS FROM 6356 N 
SUNSET BLVD MACY IN
2528230 25005-106006-12 $ 239.49 Davis
Cecil; Woodward Frankie Lot 3 & N1/2 Of Lot 
4 El Dorado Add 16-29-3 N OF 6373 N 
SUNSET BLVD MACY IN
2528231 25005-106008-47 $3,393.02 Houk
Ralph E Jr & Beth A PtW1/2Sw 42 Mrl .90a 
9814 S ST RD 25 ROCHESTER IN
2528232 25005-106010-00 $1,102.57
Fagan John J S Pt Nw Sw 16-29-3 10.50a 
6511 S 200 E MACY IN
2528233 25005-106012-50 $2,236.60 Cook
Stephen E & Cook Donald Frank Ne C Se Nw 
10-29-3. 1 APtSe Nw 10-29-3. 1.35 A. 3516 
E 550 S ROCHESTER IN
2528234 25005-106022-00 $901.51 Alter
Michael R & Beth A Shaffers Lakeside Lots 
15, 35, 36,37& 20' Ne Side Lot 38 Also Tri Lot 
38.05a 3270 E MAIN ST MACY IN
2528236 25005-107021-02 $3,691.58 Nells
Daniel & Crystal W1/2 Ne, Se Nw & Ne Sw 3- 
29-246.92a 4250 S 225 W ROCHESTER IN
2528238 25005-109005-00 $ 787.68 Goff
Trenton J & Jennifer L Pie Vw 3rd E Side 76 E 
Side Tr AdjWSide PI View 16-29-3 .04 Easem E 
SiDeLtIO 6590 S SUNSET BLVD MACY IN
2528239 25005-110010-00 $111.23 Davis
Cecil W Lot 22 Cpt EI'Dorado 1st AddLot 23 
Cpt EI'Dorado 1 st Add 6343 N SUNSET BLVD 
MACY IN
2528240 25005-111002-30 $ 855.73 Zell
Michael D Lot 6 Mack'S Park. 7293 S 325 E 
MACY IN
2528241 25005-112032-00 $816.10 Cook
Stephen E Lot 23 Knoll'S 2nd Add S Mud 
Lake.Lot 22 Knoll'S 2nd Add S Mud Lake 
2710 S KNOLL DR MACY IN
2528242 25005-113039-51 $1,807.52
Dowden Robert S % Robert Scott Sw Ne 27- 
29-3 1.40a 3628 E 825 S MACY IN
2528243 25005-113100-00 $ 253.73 Davis
Tracey Lynne S 35.1 X 119’ln Mid Div N1/2 
S1/2 NE16-29-3 .10 Acres Per Survey N of 
6332 N Sunset Blvd Macy IN
2528244 25005-118026-10 $1,563.57
Janowski Kenneth J & Sandra E Lot 8 
Calloway Add.Contract to Giallombardo John 
2611 SE Lakeshore Dr. Macy IN
2528245 25005-119016-00 $ 408.25
Vorhees Ron Lot 11 Less 107’ S Pt Capt 
EI'DoradoLot 12 Capt EI'Dorado Add Sof 
6380 N Sunset Dr Macy, IN
2528246 25005-119017-02 $1,661.29
Vorhees Ron Lots 13, 14, 15 & S 1/2 Lot 
16Capt EI'Dorado 1st Add 6380 N Sunset Dr
Macy IN
2528247 25005-119090-00 $2,364.60 Smith 
Edward A & Debra W Div S 1/2 Se 10-29-2 4a 
2384 W 600 S Rochester, IN
2528248 25005-123054-00 $ 200.34 Davis
Cecil; Woodward Frankie Lot 1 Captain 
EI'Dorado'S Add S of 6343 N Sunset Blvd
Macy IN
2528249 25005-127010-00 . $ 100.75
Hardacre David W & Hardacre Debra K Lot 
28a Zartman Add To Nyona Lake. Behind 
3137 SE Lakeshore Dr Macy IN
2528250 25006-103009-00 $ 632.13 Nice
James & Angela Lot 68 O P. 101 E Brown St 
Fulton IN
2528251 25006-114002-50 $3,574.60 Smith
Robert M Sr 31 1/4'S Side 0 P Lot SWof704 
N St Rd 25 Fulton IN
2528253 25006-119002-10 $ 573.04 Miller
William D Lot 3 Less 31’3 S Side O P. 704 N 
St Rd 25 Fulton IN

2528255 25007-107042-00 $377.61 Groves 
Charles T & Antonia 1/2 Groves Robert J & 
Denise Y 1/2 Lot 22 Camp Shohola. S of 
3521 Camp Shohola Dr Rochester IN
2528256 25007-107043-00 $338.39 Groves 
Charles T & Antonia Groves Robert J & Denise 
Y Lot 23 Camp Shohola. S of 3521 Camp 
Shohola Dr Rochester IN
2528257 25007-108110-00 $848.62 Artist
James P & Artist Lorrie E Center Ne Ne 12- 
31-3 1.67a. 6907 N State Rd 25 Rochester IN
2528258 25007-113114-00 $1,708.86
Marshall Tonia & Nichols Walter R SE Cor SE 
SW 32-31-4 3.02a 7450 E 200 N Alkron IN
2528260 25007-121001-00 $ 544.57
Bradley Lucas G Ne Se Nw 22-31-3 7.10a 
4800 N 350 E Rochester IN
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2528261 25007-122020-00 $ 950.00 
Woodcox Christopher L Mid Div S Se 14-31-3 
1.52a. 4798, 4796, 4794, 4792 E 500 N 
Rochester, IN
2528263 25007-126006-50 $1,487.18
Howard Sonya K & Overmyer Dustin A Mid E 
Of Hwy 25 Ne Sw 22-31-3 .84a. 4337 N St Rd 
25 Rochester IN
2528264 25008-103027-50 $1,113.30
Sturgill Robert Jr Ne C Ne Ne 1.07 25-31-2 
3978 n Meridian Rd Rochester IN
2528265 25008-107004-00 $ 288.03 
Honkomp Terry Lots 29 & 30 Tiosa607-00002- 
00 W of 6814 N Walnut Rochester IN
2528266 25008-109000-76 $899.63 Fugate 
Frank & Ada Nw Sw 20-31-3 1.50a 1195 E 
450 N Rochester IN
2528268 25008-110010-00 $1,049.57 Ward 
Earl Wagner Park Lot 21 & Parkwayl 9-31-2 
.107a 5187 Beaman Ln Rochester IN
2528269 25008-116007-00 $635.02 Pfeiffer 
Louis R & Virginia 300' X 290' E Div S 1/2 Nw 
Adj MichRd 29 Mrl. 1.84 A. 3618 N Old US 31 
Rochester IN
2528270 25008-116010-49 $ 123.73 Fugate 
Frank & Ada J Tr In Nw Cor N1/2 Sw 20-31-3 
.47a. Wof 1125 E 450 N Rochester IN
2528271 25008-119012-00 $15,023.08
Brooks Todd M & Lisa M Tracts 1 & 2 20-31-2. 
40.00 A. 4396 Biocourt Rochester IN
2528272 25008-119012-50 $916.93 Gaines 
Richard W Tr S Div E 1/2 W 1/2 Nw16-31-3 
.721 a 2154 E 550 N Rochester IN
2528273 25008-119036-00 $1,135.76
Fugate Frank & Ada J Tr In Nw Cor N 1/2 Sw 
20-31-3.1.475 A. 1049 E 450 N Rochester IN
2528274 25008-122003-00 $ 254.93 Vice 
Jesse E Rev Living Trust Lot 34 Wagner Park 
First Add. 4981 Biocourt Dr Rochester IN
2528275 25009-102163-00 $2,349.53 Dell 
Dennis M & Dell Debra J T/C 100' X 185' W Pt 
Se 6-30-3. .42 A.(lot 7 Fox Run) 1184 W 6th 
St Rochester IN
2528276 25009-103083-10 $ 991.11
Suemegi Joseph M E1/4 Mid Nw Nw 35-31-2 
1.0a. 2880 Batchelor Rd Rochester In
2528277 25009-103084-00 $158.39 Jordan 
Marvin Mid Div Se N1/2 Of Easement NwNw 
35-31-2 1.0a. W of 2880 Batchelor Rd 
Rochester IN
2528278 25009-103128-01 $ 514.78 
Easterday Howard N Lot #22 In Sec 3 Fair 
Oaks Sub Div 3761 Strawberry Ln Rochester
2528280 25009-105024-00 $ 709.24 Eiler 
Robert A E1/2 N1/2 Ne Ne 28-31-3 8.91a. 
2930 E 375 N Rochester
2528281 25009-106025-00 $1,868.02 
DeFranco Bobbie Sw Cor E Div Sw 34-31-2 
2.78a. 2772 W 200 N Rochester
2528282 25009-106046-20 $ 378.72 Gross 
Rodney & April Lot 23 Riverview. N of 4838 
Trails End Rd Rochester

2528283 25009-108003-00 $968.21 Hoover 
Stewart A Se Se 14-30-3 1a 750 S 500 E 
Rochester
2528284 25009-108109-00 $3,339.25 Hill 
James Joseph Trust Tri In W Div Se S Of 
Highway 1411-30-3. 2.50 A. 4651 E St Rd 14 
Rochester
2528285 25009-111035-00 $1,384.19 Smith 
Paul Martin E Side Sw Nw 24-30-3 15a Forest 
Land NW of 5413 E 150 S Rochester
2528286 25009-111091-00 $ 451.89 King 
Donald R W Pt N 1/2 27-31-2 .50a 2756 W 
Olson Rd Rochester
2528289 25009-114103-00 $ 668.84
Bogseth Jason & Melinda K Lot #3 River Run 
Estates .88a 1462 W Olson Rd Rochester
2528290 25009-114303-00 $1,860.33 
Buskirk Patricia K Lot #3 Box Car Estates 
1.04a 3271 Adele Dr Rochester
2528291 25009-115000-00 $2,209.21 Hill 
James Joseph Trust Hill James Joseph 
Trustee Lot 3 Oak Hill Subdivision. 4523 
Oakhill Ln Rochester
2528292 25009-115001-00 $2,271.43 Hill 
James Joseph Trust Hill James Joseph 
Trustee Lot 1 Oak Hill Subdivision. 204 
Oakhill Dr Rochester
2528293 25009-115002-00 $2,020.85 Hill 
James Joseph Trust Hill James Joseph 
Trustee Lot 2 Oak Hill Subdivision. 4533 
Oakhill Dr Rochester
2528296 25009-118032-00 $3,167.71 Reed 
David W Pt N 1/2 36-31-2. .79a E Side of 
Olson Rd and Forrest Ln
2528297 25009-118035-09 $ 327.48 
Gamble Joseph A Reed Subdivision Lot 9 
1867 Bachelor Ln Rochester
2528298 25009-119264-00 $ 506.89 
Weyant Dewayne H & Anna S Ed Se 22-30-3 
9a 3972 S Wabash Rd Rochester
2528299 25009-120072-16 $811.64 Tyler 
Jason SePtS 1/2 Se 32-31-2. 2.385 A. 2068 
N 400 W Rochester
2528301 25009-123149-00 $3,821.57 
Bowen Ruben; Bowen Peggy; & Bowen Pam 
J/T full rights of survivorship Lot 27 Bel Wood 
Acres Ruben Bowen, Peggy Bowen and Pam 
Bowen, joint tenants with Full Rights of 
Survivorship 1169 S Appletree Ln Rochester
2528302 25009-127015-80 $3,451.22
Wilkison Stacy K Lot 21 Bel Wood Acres. 
2174 Sycamore Dr Rochester
2528304 25010-102010-00 $ 972.05 
Baillieul Robert G 80' W End Of Lots 501, 502, 
503 & 504Holmes. 203 E 14th St Rochester
2528305 25010-102040-00 $1,857.15
Solmos Thomas E Lot 128 R I Co. 341 
Indiana Ave Rochester
2528306 25010-102058-00 $1,838.31
Bartley David A Lot 195 S & B. N of 213 
Fulton Ave Rochester
2528307 25010-102167-04 $1,241.23 Maple 
James A 41 1/2' N Side Lot 1 Sturgeons. 
1201 Pontiac St Rochester
2528309 25010-103005-00 $1,554.07 C&S 
Enterprises 82 1/2 E End S1/2 Lot 46 N P3' 
Strip Se Pt N 1/2 Lot 46 Np 210 E 6th St 
Rochester
2528310 25010-103005-01 $1,533.51 C&S 
Enterprises N P 26’2 E End S 1/2 Of 82 1/2' 
EEnd Lot 46Combined with 010-103005-00 per 
Auditor's Office & previous deeds 02/06/2007 
210 E 6th St Rochester
2528311 25010-103011-00 $1,660.41
Calhoun Larry J Lot 140 Univ. Elm St
2528312 25010-103012-00 $1,532.39
Calhoun Larry J Lot 141 Univ Less 27 Ft W 
Side Pine St
2528314 25010-103118-00 $ 796.87 Lewis

Tommy D & Tate Angelica Lot 5 S Prt Aults. 
203 Monticello Rd Rochester

2528315 25010-103155-00 $ 706.40 
Graovac Dragosav & Ruth M Lot 101 Univ. 
1631 Bancroft Ave Rochester
2528318 25010-106001-00 $1,980.45
Doran Trust N 1/2 Except Nw C 51.2' Off W 
End & N47.5' Off E End Of N 1/2 Lot 22 O P 
719 Miain St Rochester
2528319 25010-106053-46 $11,884.75
Rogers Laurence & Janan K Lot 11 Mar Jon 
CourtLot 12 Mar Jon Court 120 E 18th St 
Rochester
2528320 25010-106086-00 $2,889.73 
Ranstead Joshua J 41 1/4' S Side Lot 487 R & 
H. 130 E 14th St Rochester

2528322 25010-107017-56 $ 243.22 Kuhn 
James & Elizabeth S Mid Pt Lot 626 R & H. 
724 Race St Rochester
2528323 25010-107037-00 $6,057.56 B&Y 
Properties Lie Lot 50 Op S 1/2. 428 Main St
2528324 25010-107051-00 $4,969.52 
Kinninger Timothy M & Kimberly K N P Lot 
105 600 Jefferson ST Rochester
2528325 25010-107101-00 $2,812.68 
Rogers Pamela J & Richard Lot 137 Manitou 
Heights Sect B 1608 Ewing Rd Rochester
2528326 25010-107146-00 $5,407.12 Gable 
Delora A Lot 2 Mitchell Park 1717 Mitchell 
Dr Rochester
2528328 25010-108142-00 $1,790.37 Horn 
Todd 100' W End Lot 36 O P. 401 Main St 
Rochester
2528330 25010-108167-00 $ 346.84 
Howard Christopher P Lot 615 R & H. S Side 
of 12th St E RR
2528332 25010-111123-00 $2,468.48
Harlow David A & Cindy A Lot 7 Shobes 1st 
Add & 15' X 50' OutOf N Pt 28.79a 15-30-3 
.03a.also easements per Court Order 
#0402810 07/08/2004 3129 Country Club Dr 
E Rochester
2528333 25010-112001-00 $2,406.77
Vogler Dawn R O'Dell 55' Mid Pt Lot 142 N P 
227 W 7th St Rochester
2528334 25010-112073-10 $3,310.96
Fugate Ada J E1/2 N1/2 82 1/2'X 41 1/4'Lot 13 
Op 602 Madison St Rochester
2528335 25010-112074-00 $3,496.25 Lowe 
Robert P Lot 575 R & H. 12th Street
2528336 25010-113007-00 $ 973.59 
Boardman Raymond W E 1/2 Tr In S 1/2 Se N 
Of Warsaw Rd31 Mrl 89' X 60'. 342 E 4th St 
Rochester
2528337 25010-113035-01 $ 387.95 
Rannells W Scott Lot 59 & 60 Ferndale S 
Side of SR14 across from 1811 E "SR 14 
Rochester
2528338 25010-113036-00 $ 341.70 
Rannells W Scott Strip 40' X 135' N Line Ne 
Se9-30-3. .60 A. S Side of SR 14 across from 
1811 E Sr 14 Rochester
2528339 25010-113061-00 $ 952.96 Miller 
Charles N Lot 320 & Pt Lot 319 R & H; &22 
1/2' S Side N1/2 of E 82' Lot 319 R & H 1012 
Franklin Rochester
2528340 25010-113081-00 $ 459.88 EMC 
Mortgage Loan Trust Lot 393 R & H. 1214 
Elm St Rochester
2528341 25010-118036-00 $1,365.53 
Overmyer Randy W Lot 12 Less 18' N Side 
Noftsgers. 417 W 5th St Rochester
2528342 25010-119036-10 $1,323.75 Clark 
Mark & Kathy Pt Lot 1 L R & K& Se Sw 31 Mrl. 
240 Erie St Rochester
2528343 25010-119157-00 $183,506.98 
Smith Robert M Lots 397-398; Pt 399; Pt 406; 
& 407-408 Lords W Side of Fulton Ave S of 
RR
2528344 25010-119165-00 $2,052.37 
Brown Tillman R 110' X 11 Rods Nw Cor Of Tri 
S 1/2Se32 Mrl. .42 A. 1420 Monroe St 
Rochester

2528345 25010-119166-00 $ 845.14 Doran 
Trust Nw 1/4 Tr 51.3'X 20.6'Lot 22 OP. 719 
Main St Rochester
2528346 25010-119253-00 $1,074.83
Heishman Travis & Samantha 18 1/2' X 123 
3/4' S Side Lot 68 OP27 1/2' X 123 3/4' N Side 
Lot 67 OP. 625 Jefferson St Rochester
2528347 25010-119523-00 $ 295.50 
Damico Donald & Gloria Revocable Living 
Trust Lot 23 Minglewood. E of 808 Mitchell 
Dr Rochester
2528348 25010-123004-10 $1,533.27
Wagoner Edith M & Wagoner Bev S 1/2 Less 
82 1/2' E End Lot 46 N P. 531 Madison St531 
Madison St Rochester
2528349 25010-123122-00 $1,297.23
Enyart William F li Lot 70 R I Co.Contract To 
Don E & Tammy S Paxton 339 Ohio St 
Rochester
2528350 25010-123136-47 $ 493.29 Minks 
Joseph & Kimberly Lot 390 R & H. 1130 Elm 
St Rochester
2528352 25012-102000-50 $ 614.20 Alm 
Lester J & Verna E Lot 134 Toner'S. 310 E 
Aurora St Rochester
2528353 25012-102005-00 $1,658.60
McGee Debra 1/3; Winegardner Claudia 1/3 
Besse David 1/3 Lots 136, 137, 138 & 139 
Toner’S 203 N East St Kewanna
2528354 25012-102021-03 $ 620.47
Mikesell Tim S D W D E/2 Nw 1.176a 27-30- 
1 Pt S D E D Nw .19a 27-30-1 Wof 516 Main 
St Kewanna
2528355 25012-102021-04 $ 637.58 
Mikesell Tim 124’X305' Adj Rr W Sd Se Nw 
,55a. E of 209 N Railroad St Kewanna
2528357 25012-108024-00 $124.21 Hines 
Robert L W 1/2 Lot 21 O P. E of 117 W Main 
St Kewanna
2528359 25012-113005-00 $ 694.15 
Clupper Mark L & Julie Linon 75' X 171' Nwc 
Aurora St & St Rd 1728-30-1. .33 A. 202 N 
Troutman St Kewanna
2528360 25012-114004-00 $ 183.50
Martindale Joseph W & Cecelia L Tr 16. Ne 
Se 28-30-1 .25 A. 410 S Logan St Kewanna
2528362 25012-118006-37 $ 643.31
Mitchell Crystal Lot 226 A D Toner'S. 413 N 
Smith St Kewanna
2528363 25012-119022-02 $905.69 Kasten 
Thomas PContract to Scott A & Crystal 
Mitchell Lot 227 A D Toner'SLots 228 & 229 
Toner'S 3rdContract to Scott A & Crystal M 
Mitchell 313 E Liberty St Kewanna
2528364 25012-122001-77 $3,341.29 
Cronk Ronald R Lot 344 Russells 204 E 
Maple St Kewanna
2528366 25013-113008-00 $ 106.33 Rigney 
Daniel & Michelle In N 1/2 Sw Ne 22-29-1. .17 
A. E of 7364 S St Rd 17 Kewanna

2528367 25013-115009-50 $1,362.18 
Mcpherson Nathaniel D & Bonita 135' S Of Ne 
Cor Se 1/4 Se 1/430-29-2. 1 A 8760 S 500 W 
Kewanna

2528368 25013-115999-00 $3,112.53 
Weaver Phillip E Revoc Trust Weaver Phillip E 
Trustee E Mid Se 30-29-1 .95a 8686 S 1100 
W Kewanna

2528369 25013-118019-00 $907.91 Rouch 
George Richard & Betty L C/O Robbins Chera 
L Sw Ne 7-29-2 29a E of 5412 W 550 S 
Kewanna

2528370 25014-107014-00 $ 972.74 
Jackson Beverly A Sw Pt Se Se 4-30-1 .25a; 
81/2 Rd X 13.9 RdSe C Se 4-30-1 .738a. 1075 
N 900 W Kewanna
2528371 25014-108018-10 $464.45 Herrill 
Estella M C/O Jerry Rice Ne Pt Se Se 4-30- 
1..60a 12222 N 900 W Kewanna
2528373 25014-111008-50 $1,225.58 
Jackson Beverly Se Cor Se Se 4-30-1. .262 A. 
S of 1075 N 900 W Kewanna
2528374 25014-113002-00 $ 278.16 Rice 
Gerald L & Karen A In Se Cor Se 4-30-1. .18 
A. Mid DivE Side Se 18' N End 4-30-1 .05a 
1243 N 900 W Kewanna
2528375 25014-114011-00 $1,252.42 
Jackson Beverly A 576.18' By 311.52' Ne Cor 
Ne9-30-1. 4.20 A. 9020 W 100 N Kewanna
2528376 25014-115100-00 $1,127.10 
Jackson Joshua Lewis & Greta M Nw Cor Of 
Ne Nw 3-30-1 3.67a 8717 W 200 N Kewanna
2528378 25015-101006-50 $1,024.36 Oyler 
James C Lot 49 Showley'S Tr S Of Lot 
49Showley'S 2nd Div. .04 A. 1212 N Main St 
Kewanna
2528379 25015-102005-03 $460.83 Griffin 
Earl G Lot 54 Bay 2nd 993 Main ST 
Kewanna
2528380 25015-102030-00 $1,274.26 
Benninghoff David & Jennifer J Lot 15 Wynns 
Bay.Also 58' E Side Lots 16 & 17 Wynns 
11702 Railroad St Kewanna
2528381 25015-103004-00 $2,182.54 
Heiden Gary L & Marilyn D Pt Ne 1/4 Ne 7-30- 
1 19.69a 11070 W 75 N Kewanna
2528382 25015-108014-00 $ 744.35 Owens 
Robin A Ne E1/2 Ne 7-30-1 .77a 11031 & 
11081 Lakeview Ln Kewanna
2528383 25015-116001-00 $2,472.86 
Steffek Stacy C & Tracey Lot 46a Overmyer'S 
2nd Add, 100'X12'Tri W Side Lot 47a, 100'X 
21.6'Overmyer'S 3rd. 11218 W Lakeshore Dr 
Kewanna
2528384 25015-119015-00 $2,403.98 
Weaver Dianna K Se Se Ne 29-30-1 4.41a.
10050 W 250 S Kewanna
2528386 25015-123008-51 $1,646.28 Walz 
Donald J Attn Kristi Waltz Lot 71 Wynn'S Bay 
Lot 2ndLot 72 Wynn'S Bay Lot 2nd N of 11656 
South Park Kewanna
2528388 25002-120046-00 $ 573.23 
Claiborne William C/O Ernest Teague Sec B 
Lots 426 & 427 Kings Lake Resort Calumet 
St
2528389 25002-120030-00 $ 401.38 
Thompson Ceasar & Chogia Sec D Lots 130 
thru 133 Kings Lake Resort Oakwood St

I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true list 
of lots and land returned delinquent for the 
nonpayment of taxes and special assessments 
for the time periods set forth, also subsequent 
delinquent taxes, current taxes and costs due 
thereon and the same are chargeable with the 
amount of tax, etc., with which they are 
charges on said list.
Given under my hand and seal this 25th day of 

July, 2008.
Denise J Chandler, Auditor, Fulton County 

Indiana.
Pub. 7-24; 7-31; 8-7, 2008

PAUL’S CHAPEL SETS 
HOMECOMING

Bill Jordan from Peoria, Illinois 
will be the speaker during the 
1:30 p.m. homecoming service at 
Paul’s Chapel on Sunday, August 
3 rd. Pastor Ronald Purkey and the 
members of Paul’s Chapel, 600 
West and 650 South in Winamac, 
extend a warm welcome to 
everyone to attend the services.

Festivities will start with the 
Sunday School hour at 9:30 a.m. 
with Rev. Purkey teaching the 
adult Sunday School class. Rev. 
Purkey will also be preaching at 
10:30 a.m. during the morning 
preaching service and Bill Jordan 
will bring the message during the 
1:30 p.m. homecoming service. A 
carry-in lunch is at 12:15 p.m. 
and the homecoming program 
starts at 1:30 p.m.

Members and visitors are invited 
to present special music during 
the homecoming service. For 
more information call William
Huffman at (574) 595-7699.

###

Notice To 
Subscribers

PLEASE notify The Observer 

office whenever you have a 

change of address. New ad­

dresses may be sent to The 

Observer, P.O. Box 307, Ke­

wanna, IN 46939; or, tele­

phoned to (574) 653-2101.
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The library will be hosting a 
performance of The Story 
Peddlers as the ending for the 
summer reading program. The 
performance will be Saturday, 
August 2, 2008 at 10:00 am in the 
basement of the library.

Bob and Kathie Myers are from 
Elkhart and gave a performance 
at the library three years ago. “A 
husband and wife team whose 
backgrounds are as diverse as the 
stories they tell. Bob was an 
electronic engineer and computer 
specialist while Kathie was a 
children’s librarian with a 
master’s degree in library 
science."

“Storytelling is their first love. 
Bob and Kathie work as a team, 
improvising and weaving their 
tales singly, and with each other, 
to communicate history, heritage, 
values and tradition. Drawing on 
their love of good books, they 
interest children in reading. Using 
voice characterization, partici­
pation and props, they offer true 
multimedia performance enter­
tainment to any audience."

Handschu 
Construction 
(574) 653-2422

SIDING I SOFFIT I WINDOWS Kewanna
DECKS I BATHROOM I KITCHEN' IN 46939

New books at the library:
ADULTS:
Christian Fiction— Black Sea 
Affair (#4 of the Navy Justice 
series) by Don Brown; Anathema 
by Colleen Coble; The Great 
Divide by T. Davis Bunn; Skid 
(#3 of The Occupational Hazards 
series) by Rene Gutteridge; The 
Grand Scheme (#3 of the 
Phantom Hollow series) by Kathy 
Herman; and Dream of Love (#3 
of the American Dreams series) 
by Michael Phillips.
Large Print General Fiction— 
The Miracle at Speedy Motors 
(#9 of The No. 1 Ladies’ 
Detective Agency series) by 
Alexander McCall-Smith; Heart 
of Texas, Vol. 3 by Debbie 
Macomber; The Third Circle (an 
Arcane Society novel series) by 
Amanda Quick; The Hollow (#2 
of The Sign of Seven trilogy) by 
Nora Roberts; Phanton Prey by 
John Sandford; and Certain Girls 
by Jennifer Weiner.
JUVENILES:
Ages 10 and Under Fiction— 
The One, The Only Magnificent
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Me! by Dan Haseltine; The Best 
Seat in Second Grade and The 
Best Teacher in Second Grade by
Katherine Kenah; Has Anyone 
Seen Christmas ?, Lighthouse 
Fireflies and ‘Twas The Night 
Before Summer by Anne 
Margaret Lewis; Snowball Soup 
(from the Little Critter series) by 
Mercer Mayer; and Green Puppy 
goes to The Dentist (from the 
Blue’s Clues series) by J.C. 
Schwanda.
Youth Nonfiction— Atlas of 
Africa, Atlas of Australia, Atlas of 
Europe, Atlas of North America, 
Atlas of South America and Atlas 
of The Poles and Oceans by 
Karen Foster and Atlas of 
Southwest and Central Asia and 
Atlas of The Far East and 
Southeast Asia by Felicia Law 
(from the World Atlases series); 
Whooping Crane by Susan 
Heinrichs Gray; Jellyfish, 
Stingrays and Deadly Fish (from 
the Poison! series) by Shane 
McFee; and Golden Lion 
Tamarin by Barbara A.
Somervill.

KEWANNA TOWN HALL 
(Water & Sewage Payments)

308 S. Logan St.
Hours:

9 a.m. to 3 p.m. weekdays 
or by 

Appointment 
574-653-2112

+++

PUBLIC NOTICE
Fulton County 

ADVERTISING CLAIMS
for August 4th, 2008

ABF Business Forms Inc., 2,005.85; AIT 
Laboratories Inc., 312.00; AT&T, 251.35; 
American Structurepoint, Inc., 3,846 90; 
Amsterdam Printing & Litho; 155.65; 
Appraisal Research Corporation, 6,325.33; 
Bl Incorporated, 4,320.54; Bonine-Odom 
Funeral Home Inc., 100.00; Boyce 
Forms/Systems Inc., 235.90; Bratemans Inc., 
75.49; Brown, Richard, 167.42; Carlson 
Elizabeth N, 90.00; CDW Government Inc., 
332.88; CMC, LLC, 1,12 7.00; Cardinal Office 
Products, 178.00; Centenial Wireless, 57.50; 
Citicard, 1,202.37; Clark Michael, 100.00; 
Collier Melissa S, 5.35; Council on Aging, 
3,500.00; Cramer, Casi, 10.64; Crosby 
Excavating Inc., 10,000.00; Cultice Judith, 
7.63; Daltons Inc., 4,975.00; Dell Marketing 
LP, 1,743.00; Duke Energy, 4,502.93; E&B 
Paving Inc., 3,713.84; Earl-Love Funeral 
Home Inc., 200 00; Early Mike, 285.60; 
Emergency Radio Service Inc., 32.00; Enid

Tate Shepherd. 997.67; Fine Things. 68.54 
Four County Conseling Center. 51.500.00 
Fulton Co Tire & Service Cnt., 1.539.80. 
Fulton County 4-H Council Inc . 6.250.00, 
Fulton County 4-H Fair Board, 2,500.00, 
Fulton County Crime Stoppers. 1,000.00, 
Fulton County Historical Soc , 4,500.00. 
Gardner. Debra. 3 79, Good Family Funeral 
Home, 200 00. Gordon Food Service Inc., 
7,535 43. Harter Beverly. 1.968 00 Heltzel 
Construction Co , 368 06, IN Farm Bureau 
Inc , 70 00, IN State Police Training Fund. 
6 00, Indiana Sheriffs Association. 1,800.00, 
Ingram Excavating, 9,068 64, Irving 
Materials Inc., 100.70; Kegarise Signs, 
50.00, Kewanna Pro Hardware & Supply, 
32.59; Knight James Taylor, 327.12. LSTS 
Port A Pots. 35.00; Landmark Adult Learning 
Center. 6,435.00. Lee A Christopher, 349.71, 
Lexisnexis Matthew Bender, 418.00; 
Landmark Missy, 50.00; Marshall Starke 
Development Ctr. 15,000.00; Miller Karen. 
164.92; Morbark Inc , 42.52; Morris & Ruiz. 
PC.. 1,318.20; NIPSCO. 1,193.32; Norris 
Investigations Inc , 842.33; North Central 
Co-op Inc.. 706.00; Observer, 45.14, Office 
Depot, 414.03; POPAI, 1,000.00; Park & 
Recreation Board, 2,500.00; Peterson & 
Waggoner, 642.00; Peterson Linda L, 54 56; 
Pfeiffer Alison, 8 43; Phend & brown Inc., 
544 39; Plumlee Maintenance, 960.00, 
Priority Project resources, 1,044.15; Purdue 
CES Education Fund. 6 12; Quality Auto 
Repair LLC, 36.20; Rude Jesse, 465.84; 
Reese Steve, 100.00; Rochester L P gas 
Corp., 72.21; Rochester sentinel Corp., 
39.42; Rockhill Pinnick LLP, 369.30; Slisher 
Frederick L, 90.00; Saylor J H Inc., 188.06; 
Schaeffer MFG Co Inc., 4,323 75; Schuster 
Mecancial, 450.34; Semmaterials L P, 
4,520.09; Shideler Spray Service, 3,484.31; 
Shireman Penny, 40.88; Shorter-Pifer-Holli, 
420.85; Smith Farm Store-Rochester, 10 86; 
Smith Sawyer Smith Inc., 129.00; Speedway 
Sand & Gravel Inc., 1,445.70; Staples 
Business Advantage, 212.40; Sutton Jesse, 
90.00, Sutton Maurice, 100.00; The 
Traditions Group, 12,890.00; Thompson 
Ronnie, 200.00; Towtem Attachments, 
1.121.29; Tractor Supply Co., 249.99; 
Traylor-Wolff Lisa M, 786.00; Ulerick Chris, 
416.50; United States Post Office, 881.50; 
Van Ausall & Farrar Inc., 1,463.52; Vance 
Earl, 100.00; Walsh Electric Inc., 36.42; 
Webbs Electronics/Radio Shack, 40.93; 
Webbs Family Pharmacy Inc., 27.97; 
Weldstar Co., 69.51; Wells Law Office, 
2,339.93; Whetstone Angy, 35.20; Wildman 
First Aid Direct, 20.06; Wildman Inc., 386.50; 
Wilson Grant T, 150.00.
WITNESS MY HAND AND SEAL OF THE 

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, FULTON CO., 
INDIANA ON JULY 28th, 2008.

DENISE J. CHANDLER
Pub. 7/31/08 FULTON COUNTY AUDITOR

Notice To Taxpayers
Notice is hereby given to the taxpayers of 

Fulton County, Indiana, that a meeting of the 
County Council of Fulton County, Indiana, 
will be held at the County Office Building in 
Rochester, Indiana on the 19th day of 
August, 2008, at 6:30 P.M. for the following
additional appropriations:
BIO-TERRORISM:

Social Security................................ $ 1,447.00
Contract/Operate Services...........$1 7,655.00

Total County General..................$19,102.00
TOURISM:

Grants............................................... $ 3,000.00
Total Tourism...............................$ 3,000.00

Taxpayers appearing at the meeting shall 
have a right to be heard. The additional 
appropriations as finally made will be 
referred to the State Board of Tax 
Commissioners. The board will make a 
written determination as to the sufficiency of 
funds to support the appropriations made 
within (15) days of receipt of a certified copy 
of the action taken.

ATTEST:
Denise J. Chandler 

Fulton County Auditor 
Pub. 7/31/08

NOTICE TO TAXPAYERS OF ADDITIONAL 
APPROPRIATIONS

Notice is hereby given the taxpayers of 
Union Township, Fulton County, Indiana that 
the proper legal officers will consider the 
following additional appropriations in ex­
cess of the budget for the current year at 
their regular meeting place at Kewanna/ 
Union Township Fire Station, at 7:00 o’clock 
p.m., on the 18th day of August, 2008.
RAINY DAY FUND:

Other Services & Charges..................$5,578
Total Rainy Day Fund......................... $5,578
Taxpayers appearing at the meeting shall 

have a right to be heard. The additional 
appropriations as finally made will be re­
ferred to the Department of Local Govern­
ment Finance (DLGF). The DLGF will make a 
written determination as to the sufficiency 
of funds to support the appropriations made 
within fifteen (15) days of receipt of a certi­
fied Copy of the action taken.
Dated 7-28-08 Arthur Gudas

Trustee, Union Twp.
Pub. 7/31/08

NOTICE OF THE ACTION OF THE 
FULTON COUNTY DRAINAGE BOARD 

ROUCH DITCH « 2 TILE
CAUSE NO 4-1971

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
The Increase Maintenance Rate Report of the 

Fulton County Surveyor and the Schedule of 
Assessments made by the Drainage Board 
have been filed and are available for public 
inspection in the office of the Fulton County 
Surveyor, and a hearing will be held before the 
Drainage Board on the Schedule of Assess­
ments at 9 30 A M local time; Monday, August 
11. 2008 in the Conference Room in the Fulton 
County Office Building at Rochester, Indiana 
FULTON COUNTY DRAINAGE BOARD 
Roger D Rose, Chairman
Richard A Powell, Vice Chairman
Mark J Rodriguez, Member
Don Towne, Fulton County Surveyor
Pub 8/31/08

Classified 
Ads

BUY-RENT-SELL

In Loving Memory Of
MARK ALLAN COGDILL 

9-1-1963-8-2-1998
Ten years have passed, it 

doesn’t seem true,
But in 1998, we said our good­

byes to you.
No matter where we are in our 

daily lives,
A memory of you eternally 

thrives.
Your love, your smile and 

laughter will never fade away, 
Because you, dear Mark, are 

with us each and every day.
Days go by, years go by, but 

you are forever in our hearts
Remembering you and missing 

you this August 2, 2008 -
Love, Mom 

Linda, Jane, Tim, Jim 
Mike, Tina, Shade and Families 

FOR SALE - New shipment 
of PECANS. $6.50 for a 1- 
pound bag. Available at The 
Observer, Kewanna, or by 
calling Beth Weller, (574) 653- 
2173; or Karen Good, (574) 
653-2777.

+ + + + + + +

Sales & Service

AGRICULTURE
NEW HOLLAND ROCHESTER, INC.

1260 E 100 S, Rochester, IN 46975

New Holland - 
Grasshopper - Hiniker 

Dealer 
We Can Fill Your Farm 

Equipment Needs!!
• PARTS

• SALES
• SERVICE

Junction U.S. 31 and 25 
ROCHESTER, IN 46975 

PH.: (574) 223-2714 
1-800-327-5936

Station House
APARTMENTS....
KEWANNA, INDIANA

Spacious one bedroom and effi­

ciency apartments. Private exterior 

entry; refrigerator; range; on-site 

laundry facilities; some utilities 

included. Country setting; plenty 

of off-street parking. Rent based 

on 30% of adjusted income; in­

come guidelines apply - Elderly 

(62 and older). Disabled. Handi­

capped Housing; Rental Assistance 

Available. For more information 

Call Lucille Bowlan at (765) 669- 

1 308 or Kathy Richards Manage­

ment at 1-888-576-6468.

Equal Housing Opportunities 
Now Taking Applications



THURSDAY, July 31st, 2008PAGE EIGHT

Barb Hieber and JoAnn 
Tsoodle had working visitors 
Sunday, July 20. Coming down 
for a chat and to help with some 
chores were Barb’s daughter and 
grandson, Sue Janes and Tom 
Wilk of LaPorte.

Pauline Brown and Julie were 
in Logansport Monday, July 21. 
They did some shopping before 
dining at the Bob Evans 
restaurant.

Jon and Barb Gast were in 
Winamac Monday. They enjoyed 
a pleasant visit with Jon’s 
parents, Stuart and Rachel Gast.

Don and Doris Woolington had 
a houseguest last week. Staying 
with them for several days was 
their granddaughter, Kayci 
Cunningham.

Barb Hieber traveled to 
LaPorte Monday to visit with Sue 
Janes and Tom and Joe Wilk. 
Barb and Sue made a ladies- only 
shopping trip during the day. 
They checked out the Marquette 
and Lighthouse Malls in 
Michigan City in search of 
clothes. They also dined at 
Swingbellies restaurant along 
Lake Michigan.

Ann Zartman and her 
daughters, Jane Green and

RATES AS LOW AS 2.9% ON SELECT GM CERTIFIED USED

Shirley Zartman, traveled to Peru 
Tuesday afternoon, July 22. They 
had a nice time visiting with 
several of Jane and Shirley’s 
cousins from North Manchester 
and Kokomo at The Siding 
restaurant.

Helen Whiteman had a couple 
of working visitors Tuesday. 
Coming over in the evening to 
mow her yard and take care of 
some other chores were her son 
and daughter- in- law, Kevin and 
Monica Whiteman of Pulaski.

Kay Brown and her mother, 
Mary K. Williamson of 
Winamac, left Wednesday, July 
23, for a three- day visit with 
Mary K.’s daughter, Karen 
Kruger in Brownsburg.

JoAnn Tsoodle and Barb 
Hieber spent a few days in 
Chicago, Illinois at the end of the 
week. They were attending a 
business convention. After the 
meetings were over, they 
remained in the city to do a little 
sightseeing and reminiscing. 
Among their stops were a 
restaurant they frequented while 
living in the city and the 
remodeled Shedd Aquarium.

Helen Whiteman had a busy 
day Wednesday. In the afternoon,
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her son, Kenny Whiteman, 
stopped in for a chat. In the 
evening, her granddaughter and 
great- granddaughter, Andrea 
Hook and Rylee of Winamac, 
came over for a visit and joined 
her for supper.

Ruth Cogdill had several 
errands to run in Winamac 
Thursday, July 24. But the one 
she was not expecting until she 
received a telephone call around 
noon was a visit to see her newest 
great- granddaughter. Renata 
Heinsen and Joe Peterson became 
the parents of a girl born 
Thursday morning at 9:30 a.m. 
She weighed 7 lbs. 4 oz. and has 
been named Olivia Cora Meredith 
Peterson. Baby, mom, dad and 
siblings, Doran, Lily and Roan, 
are doing fine. Olivia’s maternal 
grandparents are Linda and 
Gordon Ligocki and Dr. Charles 
and Deb Heinsen.

Earl and Mary Bangel had 
company during the week. 
Arriving Thursday for a four- day 
visit were their niece and her 
husband, Barbara and Rob Staub 
of Evansville.

Don and Pauline Scales had a 
visitor Thursday. Coming over 
for an afternoon chat was their 
cousin, Carol Huffman.

Helen Whiteman had a late day 
caller Thursday. Stopping by for 
an evening chat was her great- 
granddaughter, Tiffany Trout­
man, and Tiffany’s college friend, 
Rachel.

Wilma Wilson had guests 
Friday evening. Coming for an 
enjoyable visit were her niece, 
Nancy Clerget of West Lafayette, 
and her nephew and his wife, 
Charles and Ruby Clerget of 
Memphis, Tennessee. Joining 
them a little later in the evening 
for a chat was Wilma’s son, Tim 
Wilson.

Pauline and Don Scales had 
several visitors Saturday, July 26. 
Stopping by for a chat and 
bringing along lunch were their 
daughters, Phyllis Koontz of 
Rochester, Barb Grandstaff of 
Kendallville, Ellen Heiden of 
Columbia City and Linda Garner. 
Later in the day, the Scales were 
visited by their granddaughter 
and her family, Cindy and Greg 
Wiese and Allison, and Greg’s 
niece, Bailey.

Florence Baldwin was in 
Winamac Saturday. She had an 
enjoyable time attending the 
annual Stepp family reunion at 
the city park. There were 71 
members of the family in 
attendance coming from Ripley, 
Tennessee, Kewanna, Lafayette, 
North Judson and Winamac.

Mathilda Lamb had a visitor 
Saturday. Stopping by for a chat 
was her son, Wayne Lamb of 
Peru. He had participated in the 
James F. Talbott VFW Post No. 
1121’s Red, White and Blue 
benefit run earlier in the day.

Send In Your News

Recycling Dates 
Thurs., July 3rd, July 17th 

and Thurs., July 31st

FULTON
SOLID WASTE DISTRICT

Materials accepted at 
the Recycling Center:

Aluminum Cans
• Beverage cans
• Pop tab pet food cans

Aluminum Foil
• Foil wrap
• Aluminum pie and dinner trays

Chipboard
• Cereal box type paper
• Office paper - all types
• Paperback books
• Junk mail
• Phone books
• Hardback books - covers need to 

be removed
No tissue or foil paper
No carbon, carbonless forms or 

other treated paper
No wax paper

Corrugated Cardboard
• Viewed from the edge, 

corrugated cardboard looks like 
this: _____

• Remove packing materials

Electronics
• Computers (including mice, 

keyboards, monitors and 
printers)

• Main frames
• Fax machines
• Scanners
•VCRs
• DVD players
• Stereos
• Telephones
• TVs

Glass Jars & Bottles
• Separate into: CLEAR COLORED
• Labels do not have to be removed
• Remove lids - put with steel
No mirrors, light bulbs, window, 

ceramic, Pyrex or other glass

Grocery Bags
• Paper grocery bags can be used 

to hold newspapers

Magazines & Catalogs
• Only magazines & catalogs made 

of slick, glossy paper
• Slick newspaper insert

Scrap Metal
• Small amounts of any type of 

scrap metal are accepted
• Aerosol cans - remove lids

Miscellaneous
• AAA-D, hearing aid, watch and 

rechargable batteries
• Inkjet and laser cartridges
• Items containing mercury
• Florescent bulbs
• Motor oil
• Pallets - wood or plastic
• Styrofoam packing peanuts - 

must be contained

Newspaper
• Stack in brown paper grocery 

bags
• Remove glossy inserts and put 

with magazines
Do not pack in plastic bags

Plastic Bags and film
• Plastic grocery bags (make sure 

they are empty)
• Bubble wrap
• Clean plastic film

Plastic Bottles #l-#7
• All plastic bottles - look for the 

chasing arrows
• Farm chemical containers - MUST 

be triple rinsed

Refrigerated Units
• Refrigerators
• Freezers
• Air conditioners
• Dehumidifiers
(Any item containing Freon)

Steel Food Cans
• Include metal lids from glass jars
• Pet food containers

Please make sure all items are 
separated and rinsed out. 

Manufacturers require clean and 
contaminant-free materials to 

make new products.

574-223-4939
1452 Wentzel St., Rochester 

Mon. - Fri. 8 a.m. - 4 p.m.;
8 a.m. - Noon Sat.

E-mail: fcswd@rtcol.com

www.fultoncountyrecycling.com

mailto:fcswd@rtcol.com
http://www.fultoncountyrecycling.com

